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Member FDIC
Have a great summer break!

	 Break out your island at-
tire for the Charlevoix Area 
Community Pool’s annual 
fundraiser called “AquaRi-
taVille.” 
	 The event is hosted on 
Thursday, June 27 from 
6 to 9 pm at the Historic 
Train Depot and Gardens in 
Charlevoix. 
	 Event features heavy 
appetizers, a silent auc-
tion and cash bar. Local 
musician Dave Cisco will 
entertain guests with his 
melodies of Caribbean 
music. 
	 Event registration is 
$100 and all proceeds 
benefit the Charlevoix Pool, 
a non-profit organization 
open to everyone. 

	 To make a reservation, 
call the pool at 814-308-
3168. 
	 Details at: https://
www.charlevoixpool.org/

june-fundraiser-event  A 
live auction with five adver-
ture packages is underway 
now at: https://givebutter.
com/c/AquaRitaVille

Charlevoix Pool Fundraiser Event on June 27

The fundraising committee is pictured in the gardens at the 
Charlevoix Train Depot (L to R): Holly Russell, Diane Herder, 

Naomi Singer, Chris Abbey, Joyce Maager and Babette 
Stolz. Missing from photo: Sue Parr, Kathy Klimas, Janet 

Chambers, Shari Hoek and Chelsea Biddick.

	 The Boyne City Com-
mission moved ahead with 
repairs to the City Marina 
on Tuesday night, approv-
ing a $23,500 project for 
electrical engineering ser-
vices. The project will ex-
pand electrical capacity for 
improvements at the marina 
and will also result in plac-
ing all Consumers Energy 
utility poles and overhead 
wiring underground. 
	 The City Commission 
also scheduled a special 
meeting for 7 p.m. Thurs-
day, June 27, to consider 
a tentative contract for 

improvements to the city’s 
sanitary sewer system as 
part of an ongoing Clean 
Water State Revolving 
Fund project. The project 
would update and expand 
the sewer system, which 
was built 20 years ago.
A special meeting work ses-
sion will also be scheduled 
to discuss the Lofts on Lake 
Street apartment and com-
mercial project. City Clerk 
Jessica Purroll will contact 
Commission members to 
determine a date, possibly 
as soon as next week.

In other action Tuesday, 
the City Commission:
• Heard a report on Eco-
nomic Trends Impacting 
Housing Demand from the 
Northern Lakes Econom-
ic Alliance. The report 
highlights are included in 
a presentation starting on 
page 39 of the Commission 
Agenda. 
• Heard the City Manager’s 
Report that the city had 
applied for a state grant to 
extend State Street side-
walks from Call Street to 
Rotary Park, that Maple 
Street sewer repairs have 
been completed, and water 
line inspections will start 
next week in the north end 
of the city and proceeding 
south. 

City moves ahead 
with marina repairs

	 The Great Start Col-
laborative of Charlevoix, 
Emmet and Northern 
Antrim Counties recently 
received preschool funding 
that will support families 
and children in Northern 
Michigan. The Charlevoix 
County Community
Foundation and the Peto-
skey-Harbor Springs Area 
Community Foundation 
both provided funding to 
the Great Start Preschool 
Scholarship Program.
	 “Having access to 
high-quality preschool is 
a key factor impacting a 
child’s school readiness,” 
said Savanah Cool, Great 
Start Collaborative di-
rector. “While there are 
income-based programs in 
our communities - Great 
Start Readiness Program 
and Head Start, specifi-
cally - there is not enough 
capacity in those programs 
to serve every child that 

would qualify. These schol-
arships remove financial 
barriers for families to be 
able to enroll their children
in available tuition based 
preschool programs.”
	 The Charlevoix County 
Community Foundation 
provided $10,000 through 
the Community Priorities 
2024 grant cycle.
	 The Petoskey-Harbor 
Springs Area Communi-
ty Foundation provided 
$9,300 from its Boeckman 
Family Fund ($500),
Ted and Brenda Frey Donor 
Advised Fund ($800), Cir-
cuit Controls Corp. Char-
itable Fund ($1,000), and 
Birchwood Outreach Fund 
($7,000). Cool said these 
funds will be available to 
support families beginning 
in fall 2024.
	 “We are so grateful for 
these donations that help 
level the playing field and 
alleviate strain for local 

families,” Cool added.
	 Businesses, organi-
zations, and individuals 
interested in donating to 
preschool scholarships are 
encouraged to contact Cool 
at the Great Start Collabo-
rative, cools@charemisd.
org. Char-Em Intermediate 
School District serves as 
the fiduciary of the collab-
orative with 100 percent of 
funds distributed back to 
Great Start Collaborative 
offerings.
	 Tax incentives may be 
available for donations

About preschool funding
	 The Great Start Pre-
school Scholarship Fund 

(GSPSF) fills the state and 
federal preschool funding 
gap in local counties. Upon 
capacity of government 
funded preschool programs, 
GSPSF provides preschool 
tuition support for eligible 

children ages 3-5. Eligibil-
ity standards require fam-
ilies to be living at 250% 
or below poverty level and 
takes into account other 

Great Start Collaborative receives preschool 
grant funding from local community foundations

SEE PRESCHOOL, PAGE 3
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06684 US-31,Charlevoix, MI 49720

BOYNE CITY – This fabulous 3 bed, 2 bath home is 
set to impress! This beautiful Boca home offers it all, 
starting with drywall throughout the home, beauti-
ful new low maintenance flooring, and a large open 
floor plan, especially the kitchen, living, dining  
areas for entertaining! The master en-suite rivals 
some custom homes, and couple that with all the 
upgrades and extras put into this home, you won’t 
find a more welcoming place to call home. This truly 
is a must see for care-free living, in a great park in 
Boyne City. Call today for your own personal tour! 
Seller is motivated as they are relocating.  $155,500
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Courtlan “Cork” 
Conrad Clausen, 84

(March 5, 1940 -  
June 11, 2024)

EAST JORDAN
	 Heaven gained an angel 
on June 11, 2024. Tuesday, 
Courtlan Clausen passed 
away peacefully at his 
home in East Jordan, Mich-
igan.
	 He was born in North-
port, Michigan on March 
5, 1940, to John & Bertha 
Clausen.  His family moved 
to Boyne City, Michigan 
when he was 10 years old.  
On July 15, 1961 he mar-
ried Sandra Howard, they 
were married for 60 years. 
Together they had three 
children, Teresa Clausen of 
East Jordan, Steven (San-
dra) Clausen of East Jordan 
and Julie (Tom) Ferris of 
Poquoson, Virginia.
	 Family was very import-
ant to Cork. He and Sandy 
have seven grandchildren, 
John Clausen, Jay Clau-
sen, Rachel Clausen, Ellie 
Clausen, Mitchell Ferris, 
Allie (Trae) Wilkinson and 
Courtney Ferris. They also 
have two great-grandchil-
dren, Macie Wilkinson and 
Riley Wilkinson. Corks 
extended family includes 
several nieces and nephews 
and many close friends that 
he considered family.
Cork is survived by his 
three children and his sister 
Mabel Howard of Vander-
bilt. He was preceded in 
death by his wife, Sandy, 
his parents, John & Bertha 
Clausen and his three 
sisters, Anna May Clau-
sen, Pat Whitley and Carol 
Wells.
	 Cork worked at DME 
in Charlevoix for 43 years, 
retiring in 2004. Cork loved 
going on vacations to visit 
his daughter, grandkids and 
great grandkids in Po-
quoson, VA. He enjoyed 
traveling with family to 
see parts of the country, 
Cork and Sandy especially 
enjoyed going to the ocean 
in Nags Head, NC. He also 
enjoyed company at home 
and just having a beer on 
the deck with family and 
friends.  Papa enjoyed when 
his grandkids would stop 
by after school or work to 
visit and bring him his mail.  
Papa called his granddaugh-
ter Allie every Wednesday 
and shared with her the joke 
of the day from the news-
paper.  He always loved 
telling jokes. Cork also 
enjoyed spoiling their fur 
babies, Smokey and Ziggy.
	 Funeral and visitations 

will be at the Stackus 
Funeral Home in Boyne 
City.  Visitation will be on 
Monday, June 24, 2024 
from 5:00 PM to 8:00 PM. 
Funeral will be on Tuesday, 
June 25, 2024 at 11:00 AM, 
with visitation starting at 
10:00 AM. Immediately 
following the funeral will 
be a graveside service at 
Eveline Township Ceme-
tery followed by a luncheon 
at the Eagles Hall in Boyne 
City.

Paul William  
Beauvais, 86
(May 19, 1938 -  
June 13, 2024)

EAST JORDAN
	 Paul William Beauvais 
died Thursday, June 13, 
2024, surrounded by his 
family at his home in East 
Jordan. 
	 He was born on May 19, 
1938, in Detroit, Michigan, 
the son of Paul Joseph and 
Helen Louise (Godfrey) 
Beauvais. 
	 He graduated from West-
ern High School in Detroit, 
Michigan in 1957.
Paul married Patricia Anne 
Young on December 27, 
1958, at St. Scholastica 
Catholic Church in Detroit.
In 1972, he moved his 
family to East Jordan from 
Dearborn Heights.
	 He had worked as an au-
dio-visual technician/stage 
set designer at Chadsey 
High School in Detroit, a 
truck driver for the Otsego 
County of Public Works, 
and a movie projectionist 
for several local Northern 
Michigan movie theaters 
and drive-ins. He retired 
as a press operator for East 
Jordan Tool & Die, and a 
school bus driver for East 
Jordan Public Schools (he 
drove the bunny bus). 
	 Paul loved spending 
time with his family. He 
loved history and partic-
ipated in living history 
reenactments such as Civil 
War Reenacting with the 
Loomis Battery Club and 
French Indian War Re-
enacting with the Jordan 
River Sportsman’s Club. 
He was the past president 
of the Jordan River Sports-
man’s Club for many years. 
Paul was very talented at 
drawing and woodwork-
ing. He enjoyed hunting, 
muzzleloading, fishing with 
the grandkids and camping. 
He always looked forward 
to deer camp with the guys. 
The Detroit Tigers were 
his favorite and he enjoyed 
watching them as much as 

possible. You could always 
find him reading a book at 
the kitchen table or sitting 
on the front porch smoking 
his pipe filled with Vanilla 
Cavendish or Free Cuban 
Cigars.
	 He is survived by his 
wife of 65 years, Patricia 
Anne Beauvais of East 
Jordan; four children, Paul 
Michael (Anne) Beauvais 
of East Jordan, David 
Joseph (Colleen) Beauvais 
of East Jordan, Laura Marie 
Massey of Boyne City, Mi-
chele Lee (Ken) Paulson of 
Canadian Lakes, 16 grand-
children, 25 great-grand-
children; one brother, Ralph 
Gerald Beauvais of Detroit, 
and several nieces and 
nephews.
	 Paul was preceded in 
death by his brother, Joseph 
Beauvais; sister, Virginia 
Barrett; sister, Catherine 
Jakinovich; son-in-law, 
John Massey; granddaugh-
ter, Lynette Beauvais; 
great-granddaughter, Hazel 
Whitley; and great-grand-
son, Mayson Paulson. 
	 Funeral mass will be 
held on Thursday, June 20, 
2024, at Noon at St. Joseph 
Catholic Church in East 
Jordan.
	 The family will receive 
friends on Wednesday, June 
19, 2024, from 6:00 to 8:00 
P.M. at the Penzien Funeral 
Home in East Jordan.

Gregory Scott Clark, 
41

(July 21, 1982 -  
June 11, 2024)

TRAVERSE CITY,  
FORMERLY  

EAST JORDAN

	 Gregory Scott Clark of 
Traverse City and formerly 
of East Jordan, sadly left 
his family on Tuesday, June 
11, 2024.
	 He leaves behind, his 
mother, Monica A. Gui-
gar; father & step mother, 
Terry (Rose) Clark; two 
brothers Gary Lee (Pame-
la) Clark and Dom Clark; 
sister, Erika Clark; maternal 
grandmother, Shirley Ann 
Clark; step brother, Ryan 
Lamp; and step sister, Ash-
ley (Jared) Niswander.  He 
was preceded in death by 
his grandfather, Raymond 
Clark and grandmother, 
Janice Clark. 
	 Funeral service will be 
held on Monday, June 17, 
2024, at 11:00 A.M. at the 
Lighthouse Missionary 
Church, 7824 Rogers Road, 
East Jordan, MI.  Interment 
will follow at Mt. Bliss 

Cemetery, Jordan Town-
ship, Antrim County, MI.
The services was held 
June 18 at the Lighthouse 
Missionary Church, East 
Jordan.

Quintin Walker, 87
(April 16, 1937 —  

June 14, 2024)

CHARLEVOIX

	 Quintin Allen Walker, 
“Gookoosh” in Ojibwe, 
passed away June 14th, 
2024. He was born in 
Charlevoix MI on April 16, 
1937. He graduated from 
Charlevoix High School 
in 1956 where he excelled 
in football, basketball, and 
track. He loved all kinds 
of sports, fishing and the 
game of golf. His bucket 
list of The Old Course was 
crossed off with family in 
2004, Old Head in 2007.
He went to college briefly 
in Marquette before enlist-
ing in the US Army. While 
stationed in Fort Campbell, 
KY, he met his future wife, 
Nancy Carol Bodine, and 
they married on January 
4, 1964. He served twice 
in Korea and the Vietnam 
war, and became afflicted 
by Agent Orange and its 
horrendous ensuing effects 
after retiring at 22 years of 
service.
	 Husband and wife 
enjoyed more than 60 years 
together, had two children, 
Melissa (Missy) and Quin-
tin II (Buff). Together they 
travelled far and wide while 
living in KY, Fort Walters, 
TX, Fort Benning, GA, Pir-
masens Germany while in 
1st Cavalry Division trav-
elling the British Isles and 
Europe, back to Fort Camp-
bell and the 101st Airborne, 
retiring to Bumpus Mills, 
TN, and finally back home 
to Charlevoix in December 
1979. He enrolled in the 
Grand Traverse Band of 
Ottawa and Chippewa Indi-
ans, where he sat in Judge-
ship in the Tribal Appellate 
Court, worked for MIETS, 
and retired again in 1999.
	 Quintin I is preceded in 
death by his son in Febru-
ary 2010 and his mother, 
Irene Walker Compo, and 
a very special Aunt, Clara 
Walker. Nancy and his 
daughter survive him. Me-
lissa is married to Robert 
Jay Mason from Spokane, 
WA, whose two sons Ste-
ven Jay and Ryan Matthew 
and wife Hope Marie 
Richards, and grandsons 
Chase Matthew and Caleb 
Christopher, were also 

special in his heart.
No services will be held. 
He will be missed for 
his zest for activity and 
joviality, but mostly for his 
love and caring heart. Rest 
in Peace, Retired Sergeant 
First Class, that’s an order! 
Give QII and Kobe and 
all the friends and family 
preceding, the biggest hugs. 	
Until we meet again... 
	 In lieu of flowers 
donations can be made to 
Greensky Hill Methodist 
Church in Charlevoix.
	 Arrangements are in 
the care of the Charlev-
oix Chapel of Mortensen 
Funeral Homes. Please 
sign his online guestbook 
at www.mortensenfuneral-
homes.com

Shelley Ann 
DeYoung, 61
(Dec. 17, 1963 —  

June 12, 2024)

CHARLEVOIX
	 Shelley Ann DeYoung, 
a cherished wife, mother, 
Mimi, and pillar of her 
community, passed away 
peacefully in her sleep on 
June 12, 2024, in Coopers-
ville, MI, at the age of 60. 
She was born on December 
17, 1963, in Holland, MI, to 
Ron and Helen Bakker.
	 Shelley leaves be-
hind her loving husband, 
Tim DeYoung, and their 
children: Jordan (Michael 
Lamoreaux), Morgan 
(Fisher Kiteley , Oliver 
(Bree Farmer), and Austen. 
She also leaves behind 
her adored grandchildren, 
Weston and Ava. Shelley 
is survived by her mother 
and father, four sisters, and 
many nieces and nephews.
Shelley was deeply in-
volved in her community, 
dedicating her time and 
energy to numerous causes. 
She was Co-Chair of the 
Sue DeYoung/Judy Edger 
Cancer Walk, served as 
Chair of Big Brothers Big 

Sisters of Northwestern 
Michigan, and contribut-
ed her leadership skills to 
the Charlevoix Children’s 
House, among other com-
munity organizations and 
boards.
	 Professionally, Shelley 
was a cornerstone of 4 
Front Credit Union for 19 
years, where she served 
as Senior Vice President 
of Human Resources and 
Chief Operations Officer. 
Her dedication and exper-
tise left an indelible mark 
on the organization and the 
lives of those she worked 
with.
	 Shelley found joy in 
boating, camping, and trav-
eling to warm destinations. 
She cherished moments 
spent with her loved ones, 
enjoyed shopping excur-
sions, and loved attend-
ing musicals, concerts, 
and sporting events. She 
delighted in sharing drinks 
and laughter with friends 
and family.
	 Shelley will be remem-
bered for her kindness, de-
termination, love, patience, 
and infectious sense of hu-
mor. Her presence brought 
light and warmth to all who 
knew her, and her legacy 
will continue to inspire.
	 A celebration of Shel-
ley’s life will be held on 
June 22nd from 2:00pm-
5:00pm at 9870 Murray 
Road in Charlevoix. In lieu 
of flowers, donations may 
be made in honor of Shel-
ley’s memory to the cancer 
foundation at C3F.org or 
Big Brothers Big Sisters of 
Northwestern Michigan at 
bigsupnorth.org/donate.

Roger Postmus, 92
(Dec. 30, 1931 —  

June 11, 2024)

CHARLEVOIX
	 Roger Wendell Postmus 
of Charlevoix passed away 
on June 11, 2024. He was 
born on December 30, 
1931, in Plainwell, MI. 
He was a proud veteran and 
served his country in the 
U.S. Navy.
A full obituary will be post-
ed in the near future.
Arrangements are in the 
care of the Charlevoix 
Chapel of Mortensen Fu-
neral Homes.
Sign his online guestbook 
at www.mortensenfuneral-
homes.com 

O B I T U A R I E S

record temps
Day..................Avg HIGH....Avg LOW.... Record HIGH....YEAR....Record LOW..... YEAR

June 20..... 75........ 52.......... 94...... 1953...... 31....... 1970
June 21..... 75........ 53.......... 91...... 2022...... 33....... 1992
June 22..... 75........ 53.......... 93...... 1983...... 33....... 1992
June 23..... 76........ 53.......... 90...... 1983...... 34....... 1978
June 24..... 76........ 53.......... 95...... 2009...... 32....... 1979
June 25..... 76........ 53.......... 94...... 2003...... 32....... 1979
June 26..... 76........ 53.......... 93...... 1983...... 37....... 1982



BY JOHN KEYSER

	 Christine is another 
community leader rec-
ommended by Mitchell 
Klooster. She is fifth gen-
eration Boyne Falls, and is 
totally devoted to the rich 
history of the area. Much 
of the background, the ear-
ly settlers, were Polish, and 
Christine was very much 
involved with starting the 
Polish Festival – 49 years 
ago! And it continues today 
and remains very much 
a center piece of Boyne 
Falls.
	 If you want to have 
some fun, visit boynefall-
shistory.com. It will bring 
you smiles and admiration. 
Christine has been key to 
the development and main-
tenance of the site. She 
took photographs, labeled 
them, and interviewed long 
standing families.
	 Christine’s maiden 
name is Kondrat. What a 
wonderful heritage are the 
Kondrat family members!
	 Christine’s work outside 
of her continuous commu-

nity service was 18 years 
with Boyne Falls Log 
Homes and 25 years with 
East Jordan Iron Works.

	 She has served on the 
Board of Boyne Falls Pub-
lic School, the Board of the 
Boyne Falls Cemetery (and 

she can be seen cleaning 
the head stones), and the 
Board of St. Augustine 
Catholic Church, is a greet-
er and usher and helps in 
many other ways.
	 The classic, and I mean 
classic, A Pictorial His-
tory of The Boyne Valley 
Area is thanks to Chris-
tine and her close friend, 
Joann Gibes. They worked 
tirelessly together on this, 
and it is a true treasure to 
everyone who has lived 
there and their families, 
preserving their heritage.
	 Christine’s father was 
friends with everyone. He 
truly enjoyed people so 
very much, and Christine 
follows in his footsteps.
	 Christine’s life may be 
accurately described as a 
Mom, a gardener, actively 
involved with St. Au-
gustine Catholic Church, 
helping keep the cemetery 
as it should be, helping 
with elections, and being a 
friend to everyone.
	 Being with Christine is 
definitely inspiring. She is 
a non-stop giver.
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C O M M U N I T Y  L E A D E R

CHRISTINE THOMAS
A NON-STOP GIVER

Christine Thomas

112 E. SIXTH ST., GAYLORD, MICHIGAN 49735
OFFICE  989-732-8160 • OFFICE@CHARLEVOIXCOUNTYNEWS.COM

Charlevoix County News 
15th Anniversary

To recognize our 15th Anniversary of the Charlevoix County
News, we are donating $15 to local charities from every 
subscription to the Charlevoix County News during June and
July. Subscribers can select one of the 6 charities they would
like the $15 donation to go to.
The Charlevoix County News is the area’s only locally owned
newspaper and is filled with local news and sports from our area.

Ellsworth

Good Samaritan 
Family Services

Boyne Falls

Food
Pantry

Boyne City

Free Health
Clinic

East Jordan

Depot Teen
Center

Charlevoix

Rotary Club 
for Mt. McSauba 

Community Playground

Charlevoix County

Charlevoix County
Community 
Foundation

You may order your subscription by phone, email or by mail. 
Contact Dave Baragrey to order your subscription and make a donation to a local charity.

Local area subscriptions are just $55 a year.

we know insurance can 
be complicated.  
luckily, we’re experts.
simple human sense

AGENCY NAME 
GOES HERE

CITY  •  000.000.0000
bestinsuranceagency.com

     
  

        

  

     
  

        

CHARLEVOIX AGENCY, INC.

Are you looking for a 
local insurance agent?
Call Don Jess today for a “No Problem®” quote.

  

factors such as development 
delays and single parent 
households. Scholarships 
are awarded for assistance 
up to 100% for preschool 
enrollment to high-qual-
ity programs. Preschool 
partners are selected based 
on participation & rating in 
the state’s Quality Rating 
& Improvement System. 
GSPSF is a committee 
of the Great Start Col-
laborative of Charlevoix, 
Emmet & northern Antrim 
counties. The fiduciary is 
a collaborative partner, 
Char-Em ISD. GSPSF has 
awarded 440+ preschool 
scholarships. Through 
partnerships with Joint Pre-
school Recruitment & Great 
Start to Quality Northwest 
Resource Center, children 
of highest need are assured 
to receive high quality care 
and education.

PRESCHOOL
FROM PAGE 1

www.bergmanncenter.org
6585 M-66, Charlevoix MI • 231-547-9624

Bergmann Center Resale Shop

Open Mon-Sat 
10am-5pm

Watch us on
facebook for
our specials!

“Making 
a difference 
in the lives 
we serve”

SAVE AN ADDITONAL

$250 
OFF YOUR 

RV PURCHASE
When you mention you saw our ad 

in the Charlevoix County News 

2215 US31 N. Petoskey
231-347-3200

www.petoskeyrvusa.com

SEE OUR
AD INSIDE
ON PAGE

RECEIVE A

$50
GAS CARD
When you mention you saw the Byrider

ad inside the Charlevoix County News when
you buy your next vehicle from them.

SEE OUR
AD INSIDE
ON PAGE

2215 US Hwy 31 N, Petoskey, MI 49770
(231) 347-3200 • www.byriderpremium.com

7
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In the Rough, Professionally Painted 
or Completely Restored

Over 7,000 sq. ft. of Furniture, Antiques & Goodies

06176 Old U.S. 31 South, Charlevoix, MI 49720

E-Mail: donkellyantiques@yahoo.com

FURNITURE BARN
(231) 547-0133 • Cell (231) 881-0353

Web: dkellyantiques.com

CUSTOM & ANTIQUE
FURNITURE

CHECK OUT OUR FISH FARM & RETAIL STORE!
11073 Peach Ave. Just 6 Miles East of Grant

Live Fish for Pond Stocking • Lake & Pond Management
Water Gardening Supplies • Water Features

Monday - Friday: 8am - 5pm
Saturdays from April 13 - June 29: 8am - 3pm.  Closed all other Saturdays

Closed Sundays and Holidays.
Call Ahead for Fish Availability 800-448-3873

Get your
catalog today!
stoneycreekequip.com

800-448-3873

L E A D E R S H I P

Lessons Learned From 
Great Leaders
BY JOHN KEYSER

	 Here are a few quick 
lessons I learned Fortune 
Magazine issue highlight-
ing great leaders. While 
these principles may seem 
to be common sense and 
that we should know and 
practice them routinely, 
I assure you these are 
lessons that need to be 
reiterated.
	 Take Isadore Sharp, 
founder and longtime CEO 
of Four Seasons Hotels. 
When he established his 
first few motels and hotels, 
he knew that motivated 
and happy employees were 
essential to the success of 
his business. From the be-
ginning, he set these values 
and expectations:
 Treat employees with 
respect.
 All employees, at all lev-
els, meet with their general 
managers regularly.
 Everyone, at all levels, 
is encouraged to contribute 
ideas for improvement.
	 Every one of our busi-
nesses would benefit from 
these principles because 
they demonstrate that we 
value our people. Those 
of us in leadership can 
create a highly energetic, 
positive culture if we make 
it a priority every day to 
have conversations with 
our team members. When 
we ask how we may help 
them and for their ideas, 
and if we are truly present 
and listen with patience 
and purpose, to learn and 
understand, we can watch 
the energy and enthusiasm 
rise!
	 Another highly effective 
leader featured in Fortune’s 
special issue was Steve 
Kerr, a highly successful 
pro basketball head coach. 
Kerr believes in:
 Empowering his people 
to make decisions.
 Encouraging work-life 
balance, conveying its 
value to his people.
 Addressing issues and 
problems in a timely 
manner.
	 While thinking about 
lessons I have learned from 
great leaders, two of the 
best come to mind: Chris-
tine LaSala, previously 
Chair of Willis North Amer-
ica, and Betty Carr, former 
Accenture partner and a 
remarkable spiritual leader.
	 I worked with Chris 
for a number of years and 
I can attest first hand to 
her exceptional leadership 
capabilities. She turned 
around an office of 1,200 
people that was struggling 
with low morale by listen-
ing to her team members 
and engaging them all to be 
part of the solution.
	 Chris demonstrates 
these values every day:

 Leadership through 
conversations.
 Setting high standards 
for herself and her team 
members, and telling them 
she believes in them.
 Helping people feel 
good about themselves, 
building their confidence.
	 Chris understands that 
when people feel valued 
and trusted, they engage 
and work hard to live up to 
her level of trust.
	 Betty is a profoundly 
effective spiritual leader. 
Countless people have 
been guided, and many 
transformed, by her wis-
dom. People realize:
 Betty believes in them 
and their potential for 
growth.
 She is generous with her 
help.
 She stands ready to chal-
lenge and confront them to 
strive to be the best version 
of themselves.
	 Both of these women 
radiate positive energy and 
lead with humility and qui-
et inner-confidence. Each 
of them has a wonderful 
sense of humor and has an 
ever-present smile – and 
they laugh easily at them-
selves. Their people would 
do anything for them.
	 Yes, we may know these 
principles, and yet it is so 
important to remember 
their core purpose: to help 
our team members grow in 
confidence and capability 
and to raise morale and 
spirit – which will greatly 
improve the culture of our 
businesses.
	 It is clear how much 
these leaders appreciate 
their people – as all re-
spected leaders do.
	 Great leaders focus on 
helping others!

John and his wife, Kerry, live in 
Charlevoix, was a senior executive in 
the corporate world in NYC, Chicago 
and DC, then founded Common 
Sense Leadership, a leadership 
coaching and consulting practice, 
helping senior people in the 
business, academic, and religious 
worlds improve leadership, their 
own and their team’s. John is a 
graduate of Georgetown’s Institute 
for Transformational Leadership and 
Life Purpose Institute. Kerry teaches 
at St. Mary School in Charlevoix and 
heads Encounter School of Ministry, 
Charlevoix campus.

John Keyser

July is National Ice Cream Month

	 Americans consume 
about 20 pounds of ice 
cream and 15 pounds of 
watermelon annually Two 
of the most popular summer 
treats are ice cream and 
watermelon. And, in case 
you didn’t know, July is 
National Ice Cream Month. 
Americans on average con-
sume about 20 pounds of 
ice cream per year, and 15 
pounds of watermelon, no 
doubt most of that during 
the summer months.
	 And here is a hot trivia 
question: What is the most 
popular flavor of ice cream?
Well, the answer isn’t 
exotic and it isn’t surprising 
either.
	 Yes, vanilla is the favor-
ite flavor, followed closely 
by chocolate. The third 
most popular flavor may be 
a surprise though: Cookies 
and Cream. No one knows 
for sure where this partic-
ular ice cream flavor origi-
nated but it is very possible 
that Shirley Seas, a dairy 
professor from South Da-
kota State University in the 
1970s, is responsible. She 
was judging a dairy show 
in New Jersey when she no-
ticed staff crumbling Oreo 
cookies into their ice cream. 
She later had students at the 
college make up a batch to 
serve on campus. The rest, 
as they say, is history.
	 And if you’re wondering 
if “Rocky Road” made the 
top 10, it fell just short, 
coming in 11th place, at 
least in this particular sur-
vey.
	 Another ever-popular 
summer treat is watermel-
on. Watermelon is part of 
the cucumber, pumpkin, 
and squash family and 
consists of 92% water.
	 Did you know that the 
popsicle, a ubiquitous sum-
mer treat, was accidentally 
invented by an 11-year-old 
boy named Frank Epperson 
in San Francisco in 1905? 
Young Frank mixed some 
sugary soda powder with 
water and let it sit outside 
all night. San Francisco 
nights can get pretty cold, 
of course, and by the next 
morning the soda had 
frozen. Frank discovered, 
much to his delight, that the 
“ice pop” was sweet and 
tasty. He originally called 
it the “Epsicle,” combining 
his own name with icicle.
	 The industrious young 
man started making and 
selling his treats local-

ly and they were quite 
popular. In the early 1920s, 
he expanded his market, 
selling the “Epsicle” at 
nearby Neptune Beach 
Amusement Park, which 
ironically is also the place 
where the snow cone made 
its premier. Frank, now a 
young father and entrepre-
neur, applied for a patent 
for his Epsicle and received 
one. He changed the name, 
though, to “popsicle” 
because that’s what his 
children called the treats, 
literally “pop’s sicle.” In the 
U.S., cherry still reigns as 
the No. 1 popsicle flavor.
	 Hamburgers have their 
place but hot dogs reign as 
the most popular summer 
food, at least for Ameri-
cans. Someone pass the 
ketchup and mustard and 
don’t forget the pickles and 
onions either. Between Me-
morial Day and Labor Day, 
Americans eat over 7 bil-
lion hot dogs, many of them 
no doubt grilled outdoors. 
That’s an amazing 818 
dogs eaten every second! 
Somewhere, Oscar Meyer 
must be smiling. Americans 
eat enough hot dogs on July 
4 alone to extend from
Washington, D.C. to Los 
Angeles five times!
	 Summer is also the 
most popular time for the 
old-fashioned backyard 
barbecue. No matter how 
epic your summer BBQ, 
though, it probably can’t 
beat the longest one ever. 
Over the course of 80 hours 
(3.3 days), grillmaster Jan 
Greef of Columbus, Geor-
gia, cooked up enough grub 
to satisfy the Seventh Army 
after a forced march: 1,000 
hot dogs, 558 burgers, 526 
boerewors (South African 
sausages), 104 pieces of 
chicken, and 200 pieces of 
corn. (What, no tofu!) The 
Georgia grillmaster set the 
record from April 24-27, 

2014, according to Guin-
ness World Records.
	 Summer isn’t just wed-
ding season — it’s also 
prime time for birthdays. 
August happens to be the 
most popular birthday 
month, with 12.7 percent 
of birthdays occurring then. 
September is a close second 
with 12.6 percent, followed 
by June and July in a tie 
for third, each with 12.1 
percent.
	 Interestingly, the most 
popular American birthdays 
are all in September: 12, 18, 
25 and 26.
	 It’s also widely known 
that the most intelligent and 
charming people are born 
in September, which has 
nothing at all to do with the 
fact that the one writing this 
(charming Mike Dunn) is 
born in September.

Here are some other interesting 
summer fun facts:
•	 According to the Tea 

Association, Americans 
consume about 3.8 
billion gallons of tea 
annually — and approx-
imately 75 to 80 percent 
of that was of the iced 
variety. Iced tea became 
popular in the U.S. after 
the 1904 World’s Fair in 
St. Louis. That was the 
year tea-maker Rich-
ard Blechynden put his 
hot tea over ice to help 
cool off overheated fair 
attendees.

•	 The most popular 
summer vacation is still 
going to the beach or to 
the ocean. Other pop-
ular summer vacations 
include visiting a famous 
city, touring or camping 
at national parks, escap-
ing to a lake, or going to 
a resort.

•	 In the United States, 
more than 650 million 
long-distance summer 
trips are made annually.

•	 According to Rolling 
Stone magazine, the top 
10 summer songs of all 
time are 1) “Dancing 
in the Street,” Martha 
& The Vandellas; 2) 
“Summertime Blues,” 
Eddie Cochran; 3) 
“School’s Out,” Alice 
Cooper; 4) “California 
Girls,” The Beach Boys; 
5) “Rockaway Beach,” 
The Ramones; 6) “Hot 
Fun in the Summertime,” 
Sly & the Family Stone; 
7) “Summer in the City,” 
Lovin’ Spoonful; 8) 
“Vacation,” The Go-Gos; 

9) “Summertime,” DJ 
Jazzy Jeff & The Fresh 
Prince; and 10) “Cruel 
Summer,” Bananarama.

•	 Another interesting fact 
about summer is that TV 
shows used to only be re-
runs during the summer 
months. The thought be-
ing that everyone would 
be outside enjoying the 
weather.

•	 According to Face-
book studies, across 
age groups, couples are 
more likely to break up 
earlier rather than later 
in the summer, though 
summer is less popular 
than winter or spring for 
breakups. December is 
the most popular month 
overall to break up, as 
are Mondays.

•	 At the summer solstice, 
the days are longest and 
the nights are shortest, 
with day-length decreas-
ing as the season pro-
gresses after the solstice.

•	 Did you know that the 
month of June is named 
after the Roman goddess 
Juno? Now you do.

•	 The “dog days of 
summer” refer to the 
weeks between July 3 
and August 11 and are 
named after the Dog 
Star (Sirius) in the Canis 
Major constellation. 
The ancient Greeks 
blamed Sirius for the hot 
temperatures, drought, 
discomfort, and sickness 
that occurred during the 
summer.

•	 Marc Antony named the 
month of July, in honor 
of Julius Caesar.

•	 The month of August 
was named for Julius 
Caeser’s adopted nephew 
Gaius Julius Caesar 
Octavius, who held the 
title “Augustus,” which 
means reverend. He 
named the month after 
himself.

•	 The month September is 
from the Latin word sep-
tem, meaning “seven.”

•	 The Eiffel Tower actual-
ly grows in summer. This 
historic structure is made 
of iron. Metal expands 
with heat. As a result, the 
Eiffel Tower can grow 
more than 15 centimeters 
(6 inches) in hot weather.

•	 More thunderstorms oc-
cur during summer than 
any other time of year.

–Compiled by Mike Dunn

Yes, the most popular flavor 
of ice cream is still vanilla, 

with chocolate a close 
second. No doubt many 

vanilla cones will be sold 
during National Ice Cream 

Month in July. 
(photo by Steven Depolo)

S U M M E R  F U N  F A C T S

Charter has committed 
$10 Million in grants since 
2017; Nonprofits can ap-
ply through June 26
	 Charter Communica-
tions, Inc., which operates 
the Spectrum brand of 
connectivity and enter-
tainment services, today 
announced a commitment 
of $1 million to Spectrum 
Digital Education in 2024, 
bringing its total investment 
in the initiative to $10 mil-
lion since 2017. Spectrum 
Digital Education awards 
grants to nonprofit organi-
zations that work to expand 
access to connectivity tools, 
education and resources 
in the communities that 
Spectrum serves. Nonprofit 
organizations can apply to 
be considered for a grant 
between June 5 at 9 a.m. 
ET and June 26 at 5 p.m. 
ET on the Spectrum Digital 
Education grants page.
	 Spectrum Digital Educa-
tion grants support pro-
grams that address a range 
of individual needs across 
Charter’s 41-state service 
area, including those to ex-
pand digital skills training 

for seniors, connect adults 
with professional advance-
ment opportunities and 
provide students with the 
technology and resources 
they need for their educa-
tion. Since its 2017 launch, 
Spectrum Digital Education 
has awarded 261 grants to 
143 unique organizations 
to benefit over 163,000 
community members, 
distribute more than 18,500 
laptops and other devices, 
and sponsor over 40,000 
classes focused on digital 
education.
	 “Spectrum Digital Ed-
ucation provides commu-
nities with the connectiv-
ity services and tools they 
need, as well as the skills 
to use those tools effective-
ly,” said Rhonda Crichlow, 
Senior Vice President, 
Chief Diversity Officer for 
Charter Communications. 

“In partnership with non-
profits across our service 
area, Charter is working to 
connect families, seniors 
and individuals with the re-
sources to harness technolo-
gy to improve their lives.”
Spectrum Digital Educa-
tion Fosters Future-Ready 
Communities
	 Through Spectrum Digi-
tal Education, Central Com-
munity House in Ohio has 
received $75,000 over the 
last four years to support 
digital education programs, 
including those that provide 
hands-on training to seniors 
on how to use their devic-
es to monitor their health 
or connect with others. 
For the STEM Alliance 
in New York, a $20,000 
grant supported its “Digital 
Navigator” program to pro-
vide community members 
with education on how to 

use important desktop and 
search applications and a 
special course on internet 
safety for seniors. Latinitas, 
a Texas-based nonprofit, 
has received $34,000 in 
grants over the last two 
years for programs like 
“Padres Digitales,” which 
offers a free, bilingual 
digital literacy program for 
adults seeking to improve 
their technology skills.
	 “‘Padres Digitales’ 
equips community mem-
bers with the tools and 
resources they need to use 
technology effectively, 
whether to communicate 
with their child’s teacher, 
pay their bills or build a re-
sume,” said Gabriela Kane 
Guardia, Executive Director 
of Latinitas. “Through the 
Spectrum Digital Education 
grant, we’ve been able to 
further expand the program, 
establish a computer lab, 
invest in more take-home 
devices and retain full-time 
staff members who are 
dedicated to the success of 
the program.”

Spectrum Digital Education to Award $1 Million in 
Grants from Charter Communications 2024 Pledge

To be eligible for a Spectrum Digital Education grant,  
organizations must serve communities within Charter’s 

41-state service area and have 501c(3) tax-exempt status. 
More information on how to apply is available on the  

Spectrum Digital Education grants page.
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43rd Annual 
ELLSWORTH PIG ROAST

	 This family friendly event, held Father’s Day weekend, was a great way to 
launch into summer.
	 Lots of fun and energy as people learned about the history of Ellsworth’s 
unique Labyrinth, learn about the history of Ellsworth, enjoy some great food, 
watch the horse pull, enjoy the waterslide, ice cream social, march and watch 
the parade and participate in the Ellsworth Pig Roast Scavenger Hunt.
	 It was a day filled with fun. If you missed it; plan to attend next year on 
Father’s Day weekend.

 PHOTO CREDIT: JODELL DANBERT 
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	 Retesting and some 
source tracking new this 
summer
	 The Health Department 
of Northwest Michigan 
(HDNW) begins its annual 
Beach Monitoring Program 
Monday, June 17. Over the 
summer, through Friday, 
Aug. 30, water sampling 
will take place at about 50 
Great Lakes and Inland 
Lakes throughout Antrim, 
Charlevoix, Emmet, and 
Otsego counties.
	 The Beach Monitoring 
Program involves staff 
taking water samples at 
area beaches early in the 
mornings and delivering 
the samples to Northern 
Michigan Regional Lab 
in Gaylord for evaluation. 
Testing is done to identify 

potentially high levels of 
bacteria, namely E. coli. 
The process involves an 
employee wading into the 
water, filling a bottle with 
the water, and proper label-
ing.
	 The lab then shares 
the results with HDNW 
Environmental Health 
Director Jeremy Fruk. If an 
elevated level of E. coli is 
found, 300 E. coli per 100 
milliliters (ml) of water, 
a beach advisory will be 
issued, and the water resa-
mpled. Same-day reporting 
is new this summer at eight 
beaches, with plans for 
expansion. The change will 
provide the public with 
more timely information 
on when an advisory is 
issued and lifted.

HDNW Begins Beach  
Monitoring Safety Program

	 Dear Readers, this week, 
my new doctor asked me 
how my sleep was. Like 
many people, I said it could 
be better. She suggested 
the book Sleep for Success 
and a Mel Robbins podcast 
where she interviews a Har-
vard researcher who gives 
seven tips to sleep better.
	 What I found profound 
in the podcast was the tip 
about our mindset regarding 
sleep. She said to change 
the story we tell ourselves. 
If we’re waking up at 3am 
every night, for example, 
and we’re always thinking 
and talking about waking 
up at 3am, we’ll continue 
to wake up at 3am. In-
stead, she suggests telling 
ourselves that waking up at 
3am each night is some-
thing we used to do and 
that we’re waking up at 
3am less and less. Brilliant. 
I learned long ago that our 
thoughts and words have 
power.  Now a Harvard 
researcher has found this to 
be true with sleep as well.
	 The restorative benefits 
of sleep are immense. Qual-
ity sleep improves memory, 
boosts mood, enhances 
cognitive function, and 
even supports our immune 
system. Just like when we 
sleep-trained our babies, we 
need to baby ourselves and 
often retrain ourselves to 

sleep. Establishing a bed-
time routine and sticking to 
it can make a huge differ-
ence.
	 So, dear readers, if you 
too ‘used to’ struggle with 
sleep, consider listening 
to the podcast, reading the 
book, and changing what 
you tell yourself about your 
quality of sleep. Let’s work 
on improving our sleep 
together!

Laura Jasurda is not just a writer 
and columnist; she’s also a certified 
John Maxwell Leadership Trainer and 
Mentor, as well as a highly accom-
plished global business development 
executive and entrepreneur. Her 
passion lies in spreading positivity, 
nurturing personal growth, and for-
tifying our community bonds. Laura’s 
mission is to empower you to unlock 
your full potential and lead your 
best life, both individually and as an 
integral part of your community. 

A S K  L A U R A 
YOUR DOSE OF POSITIVIT Y AND INSPIRATION

Transform Your Sleep 
with a Mindset Shift

Laura Jasurda

	 The following events are 
offered by Little Traverse 
Conservancy and its part-
ners. Unless noted, these 
events are free but regis-
tration is required at www.
landtrust.org.

THE FASCINATING HIS-
TORY OF THE VERMILION 

LIFE SAVING STATION
Friday, June 28 - 1pm

Vermilion Point Nature 
Preserve, northwest of 

Paradise
A special onsite opportunity to learn 
about the unique history of this Lake 
Superior nature preserve with Bruce 
Lynn of the Great Lakes Shipwreck 
Museum and Grace Truman of S.O.S. 
Vermilion. S.O.S. is also seeking 
volunteers for the workdays. Contact 
s.o.s.vermilion@gmail.com for 
details.

HIKE AND HOPS ARE 
BACK!

Friday, July 12 - 5:30pm
Elizabeth B. Hoffmann  

Nature Preserve,  
Charlevoix

Join us for a hike at a beautiful 
Charlevoix County preserve followed 
by beer and pizza at Bier’s Inwood 
Brewery. The hilly trail traverses 
through a mix of orchards, woods, 
and farm fields, and along Inwood 
Creek.

SAVE THE TREES/ROCK 
THE FOREST 

Thursday, July 25
Offield Family Viewlands 
Reserve, Harbor Springs

www.landtrust.org/save-the-trees/

MUSHROOM HIKE AT 
ELMER JOHNSTON

Sunday, July 28, Noon-2 pm
Join Amy Lipson and friends for a 
mushroom hunting adventure. If 
mushrooms are not readily found on 

this day, we will change to a regular 
nature walk. Come prepared to hike 
off trail on steep or soggy terrain.
       

HINDLE-ROSS TRAIL 
EXPERIENCE WITH BRAD

Saturday, August 3
10am-Noon

Private property
near Cross Village

A unique opportunity to experience 
the trails of Debbie Hindle and Ken 
Ross’s property with LTC Ecology 
Specialist Brad Von Blon. These 80 
acres have been lovingly cared for 
and restored by the owners who in-
vite you to enjoy the beautiful views 
of the Waugoshance Peninsula, walk 
their unique sundial, and learn from 
Brad’s deep wealth of botanical 
knowledge.

CLEAN COAST
GREAT LAKES 

CONSERVATION WEEK
Friday, August 9 • 10am-Noon

Walk the Coast of the 
Woollam Family Nature 

Preserve, near Cross Village
As part of this festival raising 
awareness about protecting our 

Lake Michigan coast, join Sarah 
Mayhew to learn more about this 
unique ecosystem and how to be a 
valuable land steward while soaking 
in breathtaking lake views. To learn 
more about this three-day festival, 
visit unitedbywater.org.

LTC’S 52ND 
ANNUAL MEETING 
Tuesday, August 6

The Boathouse on Lake 
Charlevoix, East Jordan

Call 231.347.0991 for more informa-
tion or to register.

MUSHROOM HIKE AT 
CHABOIGANING

Sunday, September 15   
Noon-2 pm

Join Amy Lipson for a mushroom 
hunting adventure. If mushrooms 
are not readily found on this day, we 
will change to a regular nature walk. 
Come prepared to hike off trail.

TAP INTO TRAILS
CHEBOYGAN

Saturday, September 21
LTC is partnering with this Pure 
Michigan Trail Town as Cheboygan 

celebrates its multitude of trail 
opportunities. Activities this day 
include birding at Duncan Bay 
Nature Preserve, 5K run with Top of 
Michigan Trails Council, a bike ride 
to the Barbara C. Hoffius Nature Pre-
serve, and more. Craft beer tasting 
will occur this afternoon along the 
river downtown and the day will end 
with a night hike at Cheboygan State 
Park. A trail challenge with prizes 
will also lead you to some new des-
tinations! Registration for individual 
events, the trail challenge, and more 
can be found at: www.cheboygan.
com/tap-into-the-trails

Upcoming Outings With 
Little Traverse Conservancy and Partners

	 State Rep. Neil Friske, 
R-Charlevoix, on Thursday 
railed against Democrats’ 
efforts to embrace the Na-
tional Popular Vote (NPV) 
movement in Michigan. 
House Bill 4156 would 
place Michigan into the 
National Popular Vote Inter-
state Compact.
	 “Democrats enjoy 
nothing more than bowing 
to coastal elites in New 
York and California. This 
dangerous NPV movement 
would force the rest of us to 
bow right alongside them,” 
said Friske, R-Charlevoix. 
“This is a blatant authoritari-
an attempt to amplify radical 
socialists in large cities so 
Democrats can finally drown 
out the voices of hard-work-
ing rural America. They’ll 
eat our food, drive our cars, 
and visit our parks, but the 
minute we step into a ballot 
box, they want nothing to do 
with us.”
	 The National Popular 
Vote Compact undermines 

the purpose of the Electoral 
College, established by the 
Founding Fathers to ensure 
a balanced influence from 
diverse states and regions in 
presidential elections.
	 Friske noted that the 
plan also poses a significant 
threat to electoral integri-
ty, potentially leading to 
premature acceptance of in-
complete results from other 
states, complications from 
varying recount standards, 
and increased reliance on 
courts to resolve disputes.
	 “Regular people won’t 
stand for this desperate 
attempt to undermine our 
elections as Democrats do 
everything possible to turn 
Michigan into their own 
little version of Commu-
nist China,” Friske said. 
“We owe it to our sons and 
daughters, grandchildren, 
and all future generations to 
preserve the constitutional 
republic our founders were 
willing to die for.”

 Rep. Friske: National Popular 
Vote effort stomps on the voice 
of rural Michigan

Park Your Boat on Lake Charlevoix
For the summer, or for the day.

At the tip of Lake Charlevoix’s South Arm, the
East Jordan Municipal Harbor has captured the
attention of more than just boaters. 

Located only one block off Main Street, the
Municipal Harbor is within walking distance to
local restaurants and friendly shops.

Memorial Park which is part of the marina has
picnic tables, grills and public restrooms. A band
shell was constructed in 2005 which has enter-

tainment most weekends throughout the sum-
mer.

The Municipal Harbor offers 27 seasonal boat
slips, 27 transient boat slips, shopping docks,
full-service Midgrade (87 Octane) and Premium
non ethanol (91 octane); both have Valvtect Ma-
rine fuel additive, pump-out station, ice and rest-
rooms. Shower facilities are available for
seasonal and transient slip holders.

For more information call 231-536-2166

DRY FIREWOOD
Delivered within 30 miles of
Boyne and Mancelona. 
231-631-9600
Burt Moeke & Son Hardwoods.
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Miss & Mr. Firecracker Pageant
Wednesday, June 19 – 6:00 PM

Location:  Memorial Park Bandshell 
(rain: The Boathouse on Lake Charlevoix)

Sponsored by:  A+ Entertains, & Kay Marie Photography 
Little Miss & Mr. Ages 5 – 8 Years old

Junior Miss & Mr. Ages 9 – 12 Years old
Miss & Mr. Firecracker 13 – 16 Years old

Outdoor Movie
Thursday, June 20 at Dusk (around 9:30 PM)

Movie: Migration
Sponsored by: Charlevoix State Bank and 

Bill, Shannon, Marcy, & Janice
	 Grab a blanket, a lawn chair, family, friends, neighbors or co-workers, and 
head to the Adult Softball Field (across from Marty’s Dairy Grille) to enjoy a 
FREE outdoor movie – PG rated.  Come down early, stake your ground, and 
have some fun.
	 Movie will begin at sundown (around 9:30 pm) and will be shown under 
the stars on a huge, inflatable screen with a state-of-the-art projection and 
sound system. The movie is free and family-friendly.

KID’S ENTERTAINMENT
Gordon Russ and his Fun Comedy Magic Show

Thursday, June 20
Memorial Park Bandshell – 7:00 PM

Sponsored by:  Burnette Foods Inc. and T & R Yamaha

Carnival
Thursday, June 20 – June 224 

Thursday, June 20th 5 – 10 PM
Friday, June 21st 12 – 10 PM

Saturday, June 22nd Noon – 11 PM

Block Party
Theme: Salute Old Glory

Friday, June 21 from 6:00 PM – 9:30 PM
Memorial Park, Spring Street & Harbor Parking Lot

Sponsored By: Mobile Marine Inc.
	 The Friday Night Block Party in downtown East Jordan. Friday, June 
21 from 6:00 PM – 9:30 PM will be an event to remember. There will be 
Live Music, Food, Games, Prizes and lots more. This is a chance for our local 
Clubs, Groups, Organizations and Churches to set up a booth and make 
some money. There is no charge for a booth space for our non-profits. It’s a 
great time to come downtown and meet up with friends, old and new for a 
great night of fun.

Youth Parade
Thursday, June 20 at 6:30 PM 

Sponsored By: Monarch Family Chiropractic and 
Louis Drapeau Concrete

	 This year the theme will be “Red, White, and Blue You!”. Build a float, 
decorate your bike or wagon, dress up in costume and join the fun. The Parade 
will begin at Sportmans Park turn right on Bridge Street and then turn left on 
Spring Street and end at Memorial Park.  Awards and refreshments immedi-
ately following the parade in Memorial  Park.

Button Drawing
Friday, June 21 at 7:00, 8:00 & 9:00 PM

	 Purchase your commemorative East Jordan Freedom Festival Button to be 
entered for a chance to win one of NINE fabulous prizes, plus one very special, 
once-in-a-lifetime chance to set off the secular Freedom Festival Fireworks 
display on Saturday night. Button drawings will be held on the hour during 
the Friday Night Block Party on the Bandshell in Memorial Park, Friday, June 
22, 2024. Drawings will be at 7:00, 8:00 & 9:00 PM. (Must be present to win) 
Your Festival Button will also be good for a money-saving special at partici-
pating East Jordan locations. Festival Buttons will be on sale at several East 
Jordan locations prior to the festival and will also be sold at the Friday Night 
Block Party while supplies last.

Corn Hole Tournament
Friday, June 21 

Check in – 5:30 PM – 6:00 PM • Start Time – 6:00 PM
Sponsored By: Marty’s on Main Street & Hejka & Son’s Construction

	 The East Jordan Freedom Festival Corn Hole Tournament will be on Friday, 
June 21, 2024 in Memorial Park. The entry fee is $50 per team, two players are 
allowed per team. Only 20 teams are allowed. Cash prizes will be awarded to 
the top three teams. More details to be finalized. 
THIS IS A DOUBLE ELMINATION TOURNAMENT

3-On-3 Basketball Tournament
Saturday, June 22 – Player Check-in 8:00 AM

Sponsored by: Buffman & Sons Excavating LLC
	 This tournament is an excellent way for both boys’ and girls’ teams to have 
fun playing 3 – on – 3 basketball in a friendly yet competitive environment. 
Divisions are determined by the grade students just completed, based on the 
oldest player.

Kid’s Events in Memorial Park
Saturday, June 22 from 10:00 AM – 2:00 PM – Memorial Park

Sponsored by: Okkonen Construction, The Inner Structure, 
Spartan Nash – Family Fare, and Truestream, powered by Great Lakes

	 Bounce Houses, Face Painting, Tattoo Booth, Fairy Hair, Megan the Balloon 
Artist, and more.

Grand Parade
Saturday, June 22

THEME: “Salute Old Glory”
Sponsored by: Gill Roys Hardware

	 If it’s Floats, Beauty Queens, Fire Trucks, Bands and Fun you’re looking for 
then the Freedom Festival Grand Parade is the place for you. Come out and 
enjoy the parade celebrating with the theme of Salute Old Glory. The Grand 
Parade will be led by the Color Guard.

Grand Festival Raffle
Saturday, June 22 – 8:15 PM

Sponsored by BA Accounting LLC
	 If you’re feeling lucky, be sure to get your Grand Festival Raffle ticket for 
your chance to win one of 10 $100 cash prizes or the Grand Prize of $1,000.00 
in cash. Tickets will be on sale during the festival at the Freedom Festival 
Information Booth or from any Festival Board Member. Tickets are $10.00 
each and the drawing will be held in Memorial Park on Saturday, just before 
the band takes the stage. You do not need to be present to win.

Fabulous Fireworks
Saturday, June 22 – Dusk

	 No festival would be complete without a grand finale of Fabulous 
Fireworks and the East Jordan Freedom Festival has just that. Launched from 
a barge in the middle of the Beautiful South Arm of Lake Charlevoix and 
synchronized to music, you won’t soon forget this fireworks display. The best 
viewing location is downtown East Jordan in Memorial Park, The Marina 
Docks, The Old Boat Launch and Bridge Area. Memorial Park will also be the 
best location to hear the music that will accompany the beautiful fireworks 
display. You won’t want to miss this perfect ending to a wonderful day at the 
East Jordan Freedom Festival. RAIN DATE – SUNDAY, JUNE 23, 2024

Freedom Lovers Breakfast
Sunday, June 23 – 7:00 AM – Noon

	 Join the East Jordan Trailblazers as they celebrate Freedom with “The 
Works” Breakfast. Held at the Trailblazers Clubhouse on Mt. Bliss Road in East 
Jordan. The Works – Adults $10, Children $6

WEEKEND ENTERTAINMENT
Friday Night Entertainment is Derailed

Friday Night Entertainment Sponsors: East Jordan Plastics Inc., 
Cosling Czubak, & Rainey’s Landscape LLC

Saturday Night Entertainment from 6-8 pm is Shuvlhed
Saturday Night Entertainment from 8:15 pm – dusk

Tom Zipp and the Bullpen
Saturday Night Entertainment Sponsors: BC Pizza, 

Bingham Well Drilling, FO Barden & Sons, Save A Lot, 
Hildee’s Auto, and Olstrom Excavating

EAST JORDAN FREEDOM FESTIVAL 
Schedule of Events • June 19 - 23, 2024



Page 8 • Charlevoix County News	 Thursday, June 20, 2024

BY LAURA JASURDA

	 A recent visit to Family 
Fare reveals a fascinating 
new addition to their team: 
Tally, the most advanced 
autonomous inventory robot 
on the market. Introduced 
about a month ago, Tally 
scans shelves to identify 
out-of-stock products and 
verify pricing, ensuring 
that shelves are always 
well-stocked and prices are 
accurate.
	 Tally’s data collection 
helps the store’s staff by al-
lowing them to spend more 
time focusing on custom-
ers, enhancing the overall 
shopping experience. This 
innovation is part of Family 
Fare’s continuous effort to 

provide top-notch service to 
its patrons.
	 In addition to Tally, 
Family Fare has also 
upgraded the monitors in 
their checkout lanes. These 
new screens are easier to 
see and entertain customers 
with trivia questions and 
special offers while they 
wait. These enhancements 
are designed to improve 
customer satisfaction and 
make shopping at Family 
Fare more enjoyable.
	 Tally and the upgrad-
ed monitors demonstrate 
Family Fare’s commitment 
to leveraging technology to 
better serve their customers. 
Shoppers are encouraged 
to check out these exciting 
new features on their next 
visit.

Meet Tally at Family Fare: 
The Most Advanced Autonomous 
Inventory Robot on the Market

Photo Credit:  Laura Jasurda

1,000 Minutes, Unlimited Texts with
4.5 GB High-Speed Data

This is a Lifeline supported service. Lifeline is a government assistance program. Only eligible consumers may enroll. Eligibilty is based on income or participation in certain 
government beneft programs and is determined by the National Verifier (documentation may be required). You must be eligible to be enrolled in Lifeline.Lifeline benefits are 
non-transferable and limited to one per household (wireless or wireline). Customers who willfully make false statements in order to obtain the Lifeline Benefit can be punished by 
fine, imprisonment, or being barred from the program. Plans include a minimum of 1,000 minutes, Unlimited Text, and 4.5 GB of Data. Offers vary by state and service may not be 
available in all states or areas. Service provided by Global Connection Inc. of America d/b/a StandUp Wireless. Visit www.standupwireless.com for Lifeline eligibility criteria and 
applicable terms & conditions. 05/2024.

Unresolved questions or complaints may be directed to your local Public Utilities Commission or customers in the states listed below may direct 
unresolved questions or complaints to the following organizations: • Colorado Public Utilities Commission: Consumer Affairs - 800-456-0858, 

303-894-8070 • Georgia Public Service Commission: Consumer Affairs - 800-282-5813, 404-656-4501 • Pennsylvania Utility Commission Bureau 
of Consumer Services - 800-692-7380 or for FDD PA Relay Center 800-682-8706 (voice) or 800-682-8786 (TTY) • Kansas Commission’s Office of 
Public Affairs and Consumer Protection - 800-662-0027 or 785-271-3140, TD 800-766-3777 • Massachusetts Consumer Dividions Department of 
Telecommunications & Cable - 800-392-6066 or 617-305-3531 • Washington: Washington State Office of Attorney General, Consumer Protection 

Dividion at 1-800-551-4636 or 206-464-6684 or https://www.atg.wa.gov/consumer-protection

Qualify by particpation in one of these programs:
Medicaid • SNAP • SSI • Section 8 • Veterans Pension • Qualify by Income • Other Programs May Apply

Bring Your Own Phone Number • Runs on the strongest 5G LTE Network

SEE IF YOU QUALIFY, APPLY TODAY! standupwireless.com/printad

PET OF THE WEEK

COCO

www.charlevoixhumane.org 
614 Beardsley Street, Boyne City, Michigan 49712

Phone (231) 582-6774 • Fax (231) 582-6776
Pets@charlevoixhumane.org

Coco came into our care as an owner surrender.  
She’s super cuddly but can also be a little crazy.  

She absolutely adores kids, and wants to play with 
every kid she sees. She’s a little skeptical of other  

dogs at first, but she warms up quick. Coco would do 
best in a home with a lot of space to run around,  as she 

loves to play. We are unsure if she’s house trained.

	 Paddle Antrim is dedi-
cated to connecting youth 
with our waterways while 
emphasizing the importance 
of water safety. Last week, 
Paddle Antrim had the 
pleasure of taking Ellsworth 
School middle schoolers 
and high schoolers kaya-
king on Ellsworth Lake. 
For some students, this was 
their first time experienc-
ing the joy of being on the 
water. These sessions were 
designed to introduce the 
students to water safety, 
basic paddling strokes, and 
the joy of being out on the 
water. Students learned how 
to wear a properly fitting 
life jacket and other safety 
considerations like weather 
and more.
	 This outing was made 
possible thanks to a gen-
erous donation earlier this 
year from Rotary Camps 
and Services, which pro-
vided Paddle Antrim with 
a fleet of kayaks, paddles, 

and life jackets. The event 
with Ellsworth Schools 
marked the first use of this 
equipment for the season, 
highlighting the impact of 
community support on our 
programs.
	 Throughout the summer, 
Paddle Antrim is hosting 
kids’ kayaking classes in 
Ellsworth. These classes, 
tailored for children aged 
7-13, offer a fantastic intro-
duction to the sport of kaya-
king. With a focus on fun 
and water safety, students 
learn through a variety of 
games and exploration. 

Our experienced, certified 
instructors teach basic skills 
aimed at empowering kids 
to feel comfortable and 
confident on the water. The 
classes are conducted in 
traditional youth-sized sea 
kayaks.

Class Details:
Ages: 7-13
Cost: $35 per child for a 
two-hour session, including 
all necessary equipment.
Scholarships: Limited 
partial scholarships are 
available to ensure accessi-
bility for all.

2024 Kids’ Kayaking 
Class Schedule:

June 26: 
12:00 PM – 2:00 PM

June 27: 
11:00 AM – 1:00 PM

June 27: 
1:30 PM – 3:30 PM

July 24: 
1:30 PM – 3:30 PM

July 27: 
10:00 AM – 12:00 PM

July 31: 
5:30 PM – 7:30 PM

Paddle Antrim is committed 
to making these classes 
accessible and enjoyable for 
all children, fostering a love 
for kayaking and an appre-
ciation for our waterways.
	 For more information on 
all the classes and events 
offered by Paddle Antrim, 
including adult kayaking 
classes, community pad-
dles, and the Paddle Antrim 
Festival, please visit www.
paddleantrim.com/events.

Paddle Antrim Engages Youth with Kayaking 
Programs to Promote Water Safety

News� O F F I C E @ C H A R L E V O I X CO U N T Y N E W S . CO M

E-Mail News Releases and Announcements to
Office@CharlevoixCountyNews.com

MICHIGAN MEDIA INC.
112 EAST SIXTH ST., GAYLORD, MI 49735

PHONE 989-732-8160
The Charlevoix County News is published weekly on Thursdays

Published by Michigan Media, Inc., 112 East Sixth St., Gaylord, MI 49735
POSTMASTER: Send address changes to

Charlevoix County News, 112 East Sixth St., Gaylord, MI 49735

Distributed to Boyne City, East Jordan, Charlevoix,
Boyne Falls, Walloon Lake, Ellsworth and Atwood

Available on Newsstands: 75 cents a copy

Subscriptions:
Local Home Delivery of the News: $55.00/year

Out-Of-County Delivery of the News: $75.00/year
(Local area includes Boyne City, Boyne Falls, Charlevoix, East Jordan, Ellsworth, Petoskey, Gaylord)

ADVERTISING DEADLINE MONDAYS AT NOON
Place Classified ads on-line at 25 cents/word, $2 minimum

Office: 989-732-8160
Publisher:

DAVE BARAGREY 1
Office@WeeklyChoice.com

Office:
CATHY BARAGREY
CB@WeeklyChoice.com

KARI BARAGREY
Office@WeeklyChoice.com

MARISA MARCENARO
Reporters:

JIM AKANS
Jim@WeeklyChoice.com

ANGELA GONZALEZ
Angela@WeeklyChoice.com

MARK HUNTER
LINDA ROGERS
KAREN WALKER
MEGAN WILSON

Megan@WeeklyChoice.com

Photographers:
KIM CULVER
CHRIS FIEL 

BRADY HEBERT
JOANIE MOORE

SCOTT RICHARDS
KENNY RIVERS/IN MOTION IMAGES

Sports Reporters:
BOB DELONG

RobertDeLong48@yahoo.com
MIKE DUNN
989-370-0605

GREG GIELCZYK
ggielczyk@jackpine.net

BEN MURPHY
benmurphysports@yahoo.com

JIM RUTKOWSKI
JR@WeeklyChoice.com
ANDY SNEDDON
TODD VANSICKLE

landho22@hotmail.com

Advertising Sales:
DAVE BARAGREY 1

Office@WeeklyChoice.com
989-732-8160

SHERRY KILBOURN
Shersk1942@gmail.com

SHANNON KNOWLTON
Shannon@WeeklyChoice.com

989-390-4542
PAUL PANOSSO

Paul@WeeklyChoice.com
KEN SCHOENBERG

KenSchoenberg@yahoo.com

National Account Rep
DAVE BARAGREY 2

Dave2@WeeklyChoice.com

Notice to Readers - Typically most advertising is honest and clear about special offers, however, please 
be sure to read contents throughly to avoid misrepresentation. Michigan Media does not warranty the 
accuracy or reliability of content and does not accept any limitability for injuries or damages caused to 
the reader or advertisers that may result from content contained in this publication. Errors in advertising 
should be report immediately. Damage from errors will not exceed the cost of the advertisement for one 
issue. Michigan Media Inc. reserves the right to publish or refuse ads in their discretion.

VOLUME 16  ISSUE 2



Thursday, June 20, 2024	 Charlevoix County News • Page 9

  
   

 

TURN NORTH AT MEECHER ROAD (TRAFFIC SIGNAL BY WALGREENS (ON M-32 WEST) • NORTH 2 BLOCKS TO EXPRESSWAY COURT

WWW.NORTHERNMICHIGANRV.COM VVEETTEERRAANNSS  AANNDD  FFIIRRSSTT  RREESSPPOONNDDEERRSS  SSAAVVEE  AANN  
AADDDDIITTIIOONNAALL  $$550000  OONN  AALLLL  NNEEWW  RRVV’’SS!!

SALES • PARTS
SERVICE
PROPANE

JUST WEST OF I-75
EXIT 282•GAYLORD
277 EXPRESSWAY COURT • GAYLORD

989-448-8700

2023 Arcadia Hideout 175BH
$15,995*

2024 Arcadia 21SRK
1/2 Ton Towable Fifth Wheel

$36,995*

OVER 150 CAMPERS IN STOCK! EVERYTHING IS ON SALE!   3 DAYS ONLY!

3 DAYS ONLY
JUNE 20-22

$1,750 DOWN
$147/MO.

$4,000 DOWN
$338/MO.

* Plus tax, title and Plates. 

SALE

ELLSWORTH HIGH SCHOOL BOYNE CITY HIGH SCHOOL

 Tyler DeYoung 
Salutatorian

 Jürgen Griswold 
Valedictorian

Brianna Ager
 Valedictorian

Lucille Uy
Salutatorian

 JT Greenier 
Valedictorian

BOYNE FALLS HIGH SCHOOL

Maddison Loper 
Salutatorian

EAST JORDAN HIGH SCHOOL

Isadora Boyer
Co-Valedictorian

Lila Kelly
Co-Valedictorian

Madelyn Hardy
Salutatorian

Congratulations to All Local Graduates
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News Briefs� OFFICE@CHARLEVOIXCOUNT YNEWS.COM

CHARLEVOIX COUNTY
SUBSCRIBE TO THE  

ONLY LOCALLY OWNED  
NEWSPAPER IN THE 

COUNTY
Local News, Local Sports, Locally 
Owned. The Charlevoix County News 
is distributed by mailed subscription 
or at tons of locations throughout 
Boyne City, Boyne Falls, Charlevoix, 
East Jordan, Ellsworth and Petoskey. 
While other newspapers in the area 
are quickly fading, the Charlevoix 
County News is growing. Our news-
stand prices, subscription rate and 
advertising rates are far less than 
any other paper and your message 
will reach readers all across the area. 
Contact us at Office@Charlevoix-
CountyNEWS.com or call 989-732-
8160. One of the few Locally Owned 
and Locally Operated newspapers in 
the state.

ADVANCE
THE HISTORY OF  

ADVANCE
A Historical Presentation by Local 
Historian Ed May III. Wednesday, 
June 19th, 6-8pm, Advance Board 
of Commerce Community Center 
(Building behind Porter’s Grocery 
Store in Advance). Light Refresh-
ments and Finger Foods will be 
served. Donations only. For more 
information reach out to Sue Cook, 
Advance Board of Commerce Secre-
tary, 231-547-5818

CHARLEVOIX
TRIBUTE DINNER

Please join us for Charlevoix Circle of 
Arts Tribute Dinner fundraiser event. 
Honoring Paul & Linda Weston, Circle 
Patrons of the Year and Bill Dietrich, 
Circle Artist of the Year. Thursday, 
June 20 at 5:30pm. Located at Grey 
Gables Restaurant. Purchase your 
tickets today, Charlevoixcircle.org. 
231-547-3554

EMMET & CHARLEVOIX COUNTY
GLE CUSTOMERS VOTE 

COMMUNITY GRANT 
GIVEAWAY

Northern Community Mediation 
(NCM) is one of 10 potential 
recipients of $7,000 from Great Lakes 
Energy Community Grant Giveaway. 
All we have to do to be the winner 
is to get more votes than the other 
nine non-profit organizations in 
the northern region service area of 
Great Lakes Energy. How do we do 
this? Contact everyone we know 
and say that if you are a Great Lakes 
customer, go to www.gtlakes.com/
community-grant-giveaway and 
cast your vote for NCM. Voting will 
end on June 21. If NCM were get the 
$7,000 that would be a great boost 
for our Capital Campaign. If you are 
a Great Lakes Energy customer, cast 
your vote for NCM (only one vote per 
household).

EAST JORDAN
SUMMER SOLSTICE  

CELEBRATION
June 21 at 6pm, come to Raven 
Hill Discovery Center and meet at 
the Obelisk in the Ancient World 
on Friday, June 21 at 6 PM for an 
unforgettable evening. We will 
celebrate the longest day of the 
year and share in the excitement of 
creating a grander, more walkable 
labyrinth. Bring a 10” - 12” 
diameter rock and join Raven Hill’s 
elite Labyrinth Builders Club. Be a 
part of this lasting legacy at Raven 
Hill, and leave your mark for future 
generations to admire. Don’t miss 
this chance to contribute to an 
extraordinary and enduring exhibit!

CHARLEVOIX
VOLUNTEER WORK DAY 

FOR CHARLEVOIX  
CONSERVATION  

DISTRICT
We are looking for volunteers to 
assist our efforts at our American 
Beach Grass Nursery located just 
south of Charlevoix, off Clipperview 
Rd on June 21st, 8am-1pm. The Dis-
trict will provide lunch & supplies, so 
RSVP is needed for numbers. Contact 
information is available on the web-
site charlevoixcd.org. Also available 
through the Boyne District Library 
is a Tools Collection, which includes 
many tools through a grant from 
the Charlevoix County Community 
Foundation to CAKE CISMA. The tools 
can be checked out at the library and 
used at your home and property to 
help you manage invasive species. 
All you need is a library card! Learn 
more at https://www.cakecisma.
org/recent-work

EAST JORDAN
CHICKEN BAR-B-Q

Saturday, June 22, Noon - 3pm at 
GAR Park, Rebec-Hosler-Sweet Post 
227 at 305 Main St. Meal includes 
BBQ chicken, roll, mac & cheese, cole 
slaw, baked beans. Cost is $12.

CHARLEVOIX
BLOOD DRIVE

June 24, 11:30am - 5:30pm at 
Charlevoix Elks lodge, 12735 US 31 
North. 

BOYNE CITY
PAVILION SUMMER 

CONCERT SERIES
The Boyne Area Chamber of 
Commerce Pavilion Summer Concert 
Series is located at the pavilion in 
Veterans Park for the 2024 summer 
season. Concerts will take place each 
Wednesday evening, 6:30pm-8pm, 
through August 28.
6/26/2024 - Andrew Lutes
7/3/2024 - No Concert this week!
7/10/2024 - Billy McAllister
7/17/2024 - Charlie Millard Band
7/24/2024 - Greg Vadnais Quartet
7/31/2024 - James Michael Duo
8/7/2024 - Crosscut Kings
8/14/2024 - Lavender Lions Duo
8/21/2024 - Delilah DeWylde
8/28/2024 - Nelson Olstrom

CHARLEVOIX
CHARLEVOIX POOL 

FUNDRAISER
Break out your island attire for the 
Charlevoix Area Community Pool’s an-
nual fundraiser called “AquaRitaVille.” 
The event is hosted on Thursday, June 
27 from 6 to 9pm at the Historic Train 
Depot and Gardens in Charlevoix. 
Event features heavy appetizers, a 
silent auction and cash bar. Local 
musician Dave Cisco will entertain 
guests with his melodies of Caribbean 
music. Event registration is $100 and 
all proceeds benefit the Charlevoix 
Pool, a non-profit organization open 
to everyone. To make a reservation, 
call the pool at 814-308-3168. 
Details at: www.charlevoixpool.org/
june-fundraiser-event. A live auction 
with five adventure packages is 
underway now at: https://givebutter.
com/c/AquaRitaVille

EAST JORDAN
MUSIC IN THE PARK 

SUMMER 2024
June 28th – Crosscut Kings 
July 5th – Pine River Jazz 
July 12th - Two Beats 
July 19th – RPM 
July 26th – Union Guns 
All Shows 7:00 p.m. - Memorial Park 
Bandshell

CHARLEVOIX
CHARLEVOIX 

CIRCLE OF ARTS
June 27: Polymer Clay Floral Jewelry

CHARLEVOIX
EARLY REGISTRATION 

FOR BIBLE SCHOOL
St. Mary Parish Bible School is June 
24-28, 9am - Noon for grades 1-5. 
Registration is $40 per child. Family 
registration rate available. Contact 
Liz Gengle with questions, egengle@
stmaryschoolcharlevoix.org.

BOYNE CITY
SMOKE ALARMS

The Boyne City Firefighters Associa-
tion and American Red Cross are pro-
viding and helping to install smoke 
alarms for residents who need them. 
If you need one, you can contact the 
Boyne City Fire Department office at 
231-582-3642.

NORWOOD TOWNSHIP
CURBSIDE TRASH 

PICKUP
Pickup for Norwood residents only 
is Saturday, June 22. Put your trash 
curbside no earlier than Monday, 
June 17, no later than midnight 
Friday June 21. The maximum pick 
up per household is 2 cu. yards.

ELLSWORTH
STATE OF THE 
COMMUNITY

June 24, 6-7pm at Banks Township 
Hall. Brief updates from the Village 
of Ellsworth, Banks Township, 
Ellsworth Community School, Ells-
worth DDA, East Jordan/Ellsworth 
Chamber of Commerce, Ellsworth 
Parks Consultant. The remainder 
of the meeting will be devoted to 
gathering community input. Of par-
ticular interest will be your thoughts 
on improvements to Ellsworth’s two 
waterfront parks. Refreshments will 
be served.

BOYNE CITY
REGISTER YOUR
PARADE ENTRY 

FOR BOYNE CITY 
4TH

It’s time to register your float for the 
Best 4th in the North! Planning is 
well underway for the two-day Fes-
tival. If you are interested in joining 
this fun committee, please contact 
Jessica White at jessicaboyneace@
gmail.com

EAST JORDAN
SUMMER ADVENTURE 

CLASSES
Summer Adventure Classes for Kids 
(SACK) programs #1-9. Classes are 
scheduled Mondays through Thurs-
days each week. SACK programs run 
through August 22. AM classes run 
from 10:30AM to noon. PM classes 
run from 12:30PM to 2PM

CHARLEVOIX
TRIBUTE 
DINNER

Please join us for Charlevoix Circle 
of Arts Tribute Dinner fundraiser 
event. Honoring Paul & Linda 
Weston, Circle Patrons of the Year 
and Bill Dietrich, Circle Artist of 
the Year. Thursday, June 20th at 
5:30pm. Located at Grey Gables 
Restaurant. Purchase your tickets 
today. Charlevoixcircle.org. 231-
547-3554

ELLSWORTH
HISTORICAL SOCIETY 

LOOKING FOR 
NEW MEMBERS

The Banks Township Historical 
Society is looking for new members. 
If you are interested, please contact 
Shirley Tornga at 231.588.1063.

EAST JORDAN
SERENDIPITY ART 

WORKSHOP
Serendipity art workshop at Raven 
Hill Discovery Center with Kelly Boyle 
on June 21 and 22 from 9 to noon 
both days.

EAST JORDAN
SUMMER READING 

PROGRAM
The Library’s summer entertainment 
for the summer reading program is 
Wednesday, June 19th at 10:30am 
in the Library’s community room. 
It is free to readers. Joel Tacey is 
the entertainment as Indiana Joel 
as a park ranger in his magic show 
with stunts, upbeat music and lots 
of audience participation. Summer 
Reading program begins May 15th 
for sign up.

PETOSKEY
PETOSKEY 

OPEN CHESS
CLASSIC

Format: 4-Round Swiss, Open Sec-
tion & Reserve Section (1200 and 
under) Time control: Game 45 with 
5 sec. delay Rounds: Saturday, June 
22, 9:30am - Noon - 3pm - 5:15pm. 
On-site registration & check-in: 
8am-9am. 
	 We request pre-registration at 
Petoskey Library website (payment 
accepted on-site at registration: 
cash/check/credit). Players must re-
cord moves on a game scoresheet. 
Scoresheets provided. 
	 Sponsored by the Petoskey 
District Library. Awards: Custom 
ceramic cups by Sturgeon River 
Pottery for Open (1st, 2nd & 3rd; 
best U1600) and Reserve (1st & 
2nd, best U700). Carnegie Building, 
Second Floor 451 E Mitchell St. 
Entry fee: $10 for players over 18; 
free to youth 18 and under. USCF 
membership required; may be 
purchased on-site. Contact: Robert 
Bemben, tournament director, at 
rjbemben@gmail.com

CHARLEVOIX
BIBLE SCHOOL

Scuba Diving into friendship with 
God bible school, June 24-28, 9am to 
Noon at St. Mary Parish, 1005 Bridge 
St. Grades 1-5.

ELLSWORTH
CONCERTS 

ON THE SQUARE
June 26-Lou Thumser
July 3-Country Thunder
July 10-Cyndel Thompson
July 17-Two Beats
July 24-OJ Adkins
July 31-Strings Attached
August 7-Foghorn Jazz
All Shows 7:00 PM - Ellsworth 
Community Square

CHARLEVOIX
YOUTH GOLF
FUNDRAISER

Thursday, June 27 at Charlevoix 
Municipal Course. Shotgun start at 
10am. 4 person 9 hole scramble. 
$200 team entry fee includes lunch 
at Shanahan’s Pub after golf. Limit 
of 16 teams. For more information 
contact Scott Kelly, 231-547-1144, 
scott@basesmi.org. 

CHARLEVOIX
LIVE ON THE LAKE

A free Summer Concert Series 
takes place in picturesque East 
Park at the Odmark Performance 
Pavilion located in downtown 
Charlevoix. The amphitheater is 
nestled along the shores of Round 
Lake overlooking the Charlevoix 
Marina and offers tiered seating 
with grassy knolls large enough for 
lawn chairs and picnic blankets. So 
grab the family, get some carry-out 
from a nearby restaurant, and enjoy 
the show!
June 27, 7pm - Hearth & Hymn
June 27, 8pm - Chris Bathgate
July 4, 7pm - IPR Sound Garden 
Project
July 11, 7pm - Hazel James Band
July 18, 7pm - The Marsupials
Aug. 1, 7pm - Pocket Watch
Aug. 8, 7pm - Levitator w/ Super 
Nuclear
Aug. 15, 7pm - Ryan Curtis

EAST JORDAN
DONATE CLOTHES

During the month of June, Bright 
Lights girls youth group are 
accepting donations of clothing 
and apparel for all seasons, from 
girls size 6 through all women’s 
sizes. Apparel could include pants, 
shorts, shirts, sweaters, dresses, 
skirts, shoes, purses, outerwear, 
pj’s, belts or accessories. Donations 
can be dropped off at East Jordan 
Community Church on Sundays and 
at Lighthouse Missionary Church or 
St. Joseph’s Catholic Church in East 
Jordan any day of the week.

PETOSKEY
MACKINAW TRAIL 

WINE 
RUN 5K

Like Running or Walking? Love 
Wine? This race is for you! Join us on 
Saturday, June 30, at 10am for an 
exciting annual event that features 
the amazing scenery and landscape 
of Mackinaw Trail Winery & Brewery. 
Mackinaw Trail Winery is a family 
owned business that was founded in 
2004 that sits on 30 acres of beauti-
ful rolling hills which is planted with 
15 acres of grapes. In its ten years of 
operation Mackinaw Trail continues 
to be one of the most awarded and 
recognized wineries in the state of 
Michigan. So come out and enjoy 
some amazing wine! Whether you 
are looking to run, walk or just enjoy 
the wine this race is a sure thing 
for a great time and an incredible 
experience.

EAST JORDAN
MY SISTER’S CLOSET

The Bright Lights girls youth group 
of East Jordan invites you to the 2nd 
annual My Sister’s Closet, a morning 
of refreshments, fellowship and 
free shopping on June 29 from 9am 
- Noon. The event will be held at 
Lighthouse Missionary Church, 7824 
Rogers Rd.. Their goal is to provide 
ladies of all ages with free, modest, 
gently-used clothing and apparel 
that works for them. Ladies, please 
mark your calendars and invite your 
family and friends to join you on 
June 29th for this entirely free event! 
No donations are required to come 
and shop.

CHARLEVOIX
SUMMER 

ART SHOW
Saturday & Sunday, June 29 & 30 in 
East Park, downtown.

EAST JORDAN
MONTHLY 

DINNER 
FUNDRAISER

The American Legion, Rebec-Ho-
sler-Sweet Post #227 (305 Main 
Street) hosts a monthly dinner fund-
raiser the 1st Saturday of the Month 
hosting a Monthly Dinner Fundraiser 
for the G.A.R. Park upgrades on 
the first Saturday of each month. 
4:30PM - 7PM. Suggested donation: 
Adult - $12, Children - $8, Under 5 
Free. Dine in or take-out available. 
July 6, Aug. 3, Sept. 7, Oct. 5, Nov. 
2, Dec. 7

CHARLEVOIX
SUMMERTIME MUSIC 
AT THE CHARLEVOIX 

PUBLIC LIBRARY
The Charlevoix Public Library is once 
again the place to be for live music 
in the summer! We are thrilled to 
announce that SummerFolk and 
Jazz @ The Library (JATL) continue 
this summer during June, July and 
August. Billy McAllister also returns 
to present Frankie and the Crooners. 
Concerts are outside in the Children’s 
Garden – bring your own chair! Rain 
location in the Community Room. 
SummerFolk Concert Series: Second 
Monday of the Month beginning at 
6:30 pm
July 8: Laura Thurston 
August 12: Jessica Dominic 
September 9: The Rhythymskool 

CHARLEVOIX
JAZZ @ THE LIBRARY 

(JATL)
Wednesdays in July & August from 
7 – 8pm
The Library is excited to continue 
hosting Jazz @ The Library (JATL) 
this summer as it has for many years 
past, featuring the Steve Stargardt 
Trio with Andy Evans, bass; Jon Lin-
deneau, drums; and Steve Stargardt, 
piano.
July 10: Jack Stargardt on Bass & 
Nick Birchler on Piano
July 16: Bill Sears on Sax
(July 24: Venetian Week: No Concert
July 31: Mike & Michelle Davis, Sax 
& Flute
August 7: Rick Stewart on Trumpet & 
Vocals, Mike Hunter on Trombone, & 
Bill Sears on Sax
August 14: Nancy Stagnitta on Flute
August 21: Family & Friends
JATL is sponsored by the Dion Family 
Charitable Fund, Melvy Lewis, Bob-
bie Rassieur Williams - in memory 
of Bob Williams, Lynne and Mason 
Rosenthal, and Patrons of JATL

EAST JORDAN
JORDAN VALLEY 

COMMUNITY BAND
Thursday Evenings in July 11th, 18th, 
25th at the Memorial Park Bandshell

CHARLEVOIX
ART & CRAFT SHOW

Saturday & Sunday, July 13 & 14 in 
East Park, downtown.

CHARLEVOIX
FREE SUMMER MOVIES 

AND FOOD DRIVE
Charlevoix Cinema free summer 
movies series & food drive lineup. 
Join us for free weekly movies and 
bring along a canned/dry good to 
donate to Charlevoix Rayder Den. We 
can’t wait to see you at the movies!

BOYNE CITY 
SPLASH PAD 

The Splash Pad is open for the 
season at Peninsula Beach, 310 Front 
Street. Aside from normal amounts 
of sand from a user’s feet, please do 
not carry sand or dirt onto the splash 
pad or its fountains. This can cause 
issues with clogging and interrupt or 
delay use of the splash pad.

EAST JORDAN
FARMERS MARKET

The East Jordan Garden Club’s 
Farmers Market, held each Thursday 
from 10AM - 2PM at the East Jordan 
Tourist Park is open. Fresh veggies, 
fruit, baked good, handmade items, 
fresh cut flowers and much more.

CHARLEVOIX COUNTY
CHAMBER CASH RAFFLE

The awesome Charlevoix County 
Chamber Champion Cash Raffle is 
underway! Only 400 tickets will 
be sold at $100 each. First place 
is $10,000, second place is $2,000 
and third place $1,000. Drawing to 
be held on November 1st. Tickets 
available at the East Jordan Area 
Chamber of Commerce and from 
Board Members and at Charlevoix 
Chamber of Commerce & Board 
Members. Raffle license #R75404

CHARLEVOIX COUNTY
ADVERTISING FUNDS 

THE CHARLEVOIX  
COUNTY NEWS

We love to run community 
announcements and news releases 
about all the things happening in 
Northern Michigan in the Charlevoix 
County News. We help publicize 
hundreds of events and activities all 
across our area. Readers love the fact 
that the Charlevoix County News is 
distributed by mailed subscription 
or at tons of locations throughout 

Boyne City, Boyne Falls, Charlevoix, 
East Jordan, Ellsworth and Petoskey. 
However, it is expensive to publish 
this newspaper each week filled 
with tons of local news and sports. 
Our main source of revenue comes 
from advertising. If your business or 
organization has an advertising bud-
get, be sure to include the Charlevoix 
County News in your plans. While 
other newspapers in the area are 
quickly fading, the Charlevoix County 
News is growing. Our newsstand 
prices and advertising rates are far 
less than any other paper and your 
message will reach readers all across 
the area. Contact us at Office@
CharlevoixCountyNEWS.com or 
call 989-732-8160. One of the few 
Locally Owned and Locally Operated 
newspapers in the state.

CHARLEVOIX
FARMERS MARKET

The downtown farmers market is 
held every Thursday thru October 31 
on Bridge St. 8am - 1pm. 34 vendors 
plus music organized by Blissfest 
Music Organization and sponsored 
by Pat O’Brien & Assoc. Real Estate.

BOYNE CITY
FARMERS MARKET

The market now meets at the Vet-
erans Park Pavilion every Saturday, 
9am - 12:30pm. Fresh produce, local 
artists and live music

EAST JORDAN
FARMERS MARKET

The East Jordan Garden Club’s 
Farmers Market, held each Thursday 
from 10AM - 2PM at the East Jordan 
Tourist Park. Fresh veggies, fruit, 
baked good, handmade items, fresh 
cut flowers and much more.

CHARLEVOIX
FREE BREAKFAST CLUB 

TEAMS UP WITH COA
Collaboration Between The Free 
Breakfast Club & Commission On 
Aging has begun. Anyone can come 
to the Shirley Roloff Center (old 
Elementary School on Division), 
between 8-9am and get a free 
breakfast sponsored by Safe Haven 
and prepared for you by COA chefs 
and our volunteers. You may dine 
in, take out or get curbside pick-up. 
This will happen at the Shirley Roloff 
center every Tuesday and Friday for 
all ages at no cost.

NORTHERN MICHIGAN
CHILD CARE PROGRAM

The MI Tri-Share Child Care Program 
help companies retain their employ-
ees by participating and pay 1/3 of 
the cost of childcare, the OCEA (Grant 
from the State of MI) pays 1/3, 
leaving the parent only to pay 1/3 of 
the childcare cost. We are looking for 
smaller businesses that want to help 
their employees. Right now, some 
of the companies participating are 
Treetops Resort, Albies Foods, Gaylor 
Insurance. We can help self-em-
ployed families by paying 1/3 of cost. 
They would be responsible for 2/3 of 
the cost. Non-Profits can participate 
with this program to help their 
employees. For more information 
call 989-731-7510 or email Brandy@
Gaylord-Otsego.com

EAST JORDAN
TEEN CENTER

The Depot Teen Center Located in the 
Teen Zone at 214 Main St. Serving 
6th-12th Graders throughout North-
ern Michigan Wednesdays & Fridays 
after school until 6pm. EJDepot.org. 
(231) 222-2224. DepotJVTeenCen-
ter@gmail.com

CHARLEVOIX
MONTHLY ADULT GRIEF, 
LOSS & BEREAVEMENT 

SUPPORT GROUP 
Hospice of Northwest Michigan 
invites you to join our Monthly adult 
grief, loss & bereavement support 
group, which takes place the 2nd 
Sunday of each month from 4-5pm 
at the First Baptist Church, 6781 
M66 North. This program is open to 
anyone in our community looking 
for assistance in their grief process 
and is facilitated by Rev. David Be-
hling. There is no charge to attend. 
Please feel free to call Hospice at 
231-547-7659 to register or for more 
information.

EAST JORDAN
CANCER SUPPORT 

GROUP
Cancer and Caregiver Support group 
meets at 10am the 3rd Saturday of 
each month at Lighthouse Mission-
ary Church.
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athletes    weekof
the

Charlevoix Rayder 
Baseball team

The Charlevoix Rayder 
Baseball team made 
it to the final 4 in the 
state division 3 base-
ball tournament. The 
lost a heart breaker to 
Jackson Lumen Christi 
in the semi-finals. 

Subscribe
friendly & positive news and sports

covering all of Charlevoix County
Distributed to Boyne City, East Jordan, Charlevoix,
Boyne Falls, Walloon Lake, Ellsworth and Atwood.

Contact Us Today at: 989-732-8160

                AND OUTDOORS
CALL (989) 732-8160   EMAIL SPORTS@CHARLEVOIXCOUNTYNEWS.COM

BY GREG GIELCZYK

 	 Holding a two-run lead 
going into the seventh 
inning, the Charlevoix 
baseball team was three 
outs away from advanc-
ing to the Division 3 state 
championship game in East 
Lansing last Thursday.
	 But then lightning 
struck, and the Rayders 
-- who came into the state 
semifinal ranked 10th in 
the state -- suffered a punch 
to the stomach when No. 
15 Jackson Lumen Christi 
rallied for a 3-2 win in walk 
off fashion.
	 It truly was heartbreak-
ing for the Rayders to have 
a game they seemingly had 
won torn from their hands, 
and the season ended one 
game short of playing for 
the big prize.
	 Once the sting wears 
off, the Rayders can look 
back on this season with 
great pride. It was the first 
time since 1980 a Rayders 
baseball team had made the 
semifinals, and their 27-11 
record was one of their best 
ever as well.
	 “It was a little bitter-
sweet,” said Rayders coach 
Stephen Speigl. “It’s not the 
outcome you look for, but 
to be honest you can’t learn 
anything more than that 
scenario.
	 “You always want to 
win, but you always get 
better through those type of 
scenarios than just cruising 
through something easy. I 
always approach it that a 
loss is a loss. One loss isn’t 
easier than the other.
	 “It’s a matter of how you 
get there, and what you can 
actually learn from it. It’s 
emotional. It’s hard for peo-

ple to grab onto the life’s 
lessons.”
	 Charlevoix junior Hunt-
er Lemerand produced the 
first run of the game, stak-
ing starter Bryce Johnson (a 
senior) to a 1-0 lead when 
he drove a hard single to 
deep centerfield in the top 
of the second.
	 Then in the third inning 
Johnson helped himself 
with a RBI single to right 
in the third for the Rayders’ 
second run of the contest. 
But, that would be their 
last.
	 Johnson has been nearly 
untouchable this season, 

with 91 strikeouts, just 22 
walks and a 0.75 earned 
run average and he was on 
point against Lumen Christi 
for much of the game.
	 He allowed just four 
hits, rung up seven strike 
outs and issued only four 
walks in 6 1/3 innings 
before being lifted from the 
game in favor of reliever 
Lemerand.
	 The game was tied 2-2 
when Lemerand entered, 
and after throwing a first-
pitch strike to the first 
batter he faced gave up the 
game-winning single to 
right.

	 Charlevoix sparkled 
on defense, making some 
outstanding plays, includ-
ing three clutch double 
plays that thwarted several 
Lumen Christi scoring 
chances.
	 “It got the momentum 
going, and kept the momen-
tum in our favor,” Speigl 
said.
	 Lumen Christi had other 
opportunities to score, most 
notably in the bottom of 
the third when it loaded 
the bases with two out, but 
Johnson managed to wiggle 
his way out of trouble.
	 Until the bottom of the 

seventh.
	 “We’ve said it multiple 
times this year ... if there’s 
one out, there’s a chance,” 
Speigl said. “Lumen Christi 
didn’t give up. They could 
have, but kept battling.
	 “I give Lumen Christi a 
lot of credit, because they 
ran with that opportunity. 
You can’t fault a team that 
doesn’t give up. Our kids 
did their best, and we didn’t 
come out on top.
	 “Down the road I hope 
our kids can look back and 
say ‘They didn’t give up 
on their opportunity, and 
we can always use this as 

motivation to get better.’” I 
told them not to live in the 
‘What if?’ of this game.”
	 The Rayders graduated 
only three seniors this year 
-- Troy Nickel, Johnson and 
Dylan Clapp. Which means 
they have a lot coming 
back next spring, including 
several starters.
	 Charlevoix had 30 wins 
in the 2022-23 season and 
finished just three wins shy 
of that total this year.
	 “You just hope to keep 
building on that,” said Spei-
gl.

Rayders have heart breaking  
loss in state semi-finals, 3-2

BASEBALL

2024 CHARLEVOIX RAYDERS BASEBALL TEAM
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Score by Innings................ 			   R	 H	 E
Charlevoix...................... 010	 100	 0 - 	 2	 7	 2
JacksonLumen Christi..... 000	 000	 3 - 	 3	 5	  0

Charlevoix starters: 2/c Nickel; 5/rf Bergman; 8/cf Speigl; 11/ss Waha; 6/3b 
Pearl; 3/p Johnson; 16/1b Lemerand; 19/lf Batkoski; 9/dh Clapp; 1/2b Jarema;
JacksonLumen Christi starters: 9/3b Sattler; 6/p King; 22/ss Gregory; 1/c Kala-
har; 16/2b Gaston; 7/dh Hinkley; 13/lf Walicki; 5/1b Crowley; 2/rf Fitzpatrick; 
4/cf Shore;

Charlevoix 1st - Nickel struck out. Bergman grounded out to 2b. Speigl 
grounded out to 2b. 0 runs, 0 hits, 0 errors, 0 LOB.

JacksonLumen Christi 1st - Sattler walked. King flied out to cf. Sattler stole 
second. Gregory struck out swinging. Kalahar flied out to cf. 0 runs, 0 hits, 0 
errors, 1 LOB.

Charlevoix 2nd - Waha struck out swinging. Pearl singled to right center. John-
son struck out looking. Lemerand doubled to right center, RBI; Pearl scored. 
Batkoski struck out swinging, out at first c to 1b. 1 run, 2 hits, 0 errors, 1 LOB.

JacksonLumen Christi 2nd - Gaston hit by pitch. Hinkley lined out to lf. Walicki 
struck out looking; Gaston stole second. Crowley struck out swinging. 0 runs, 
0 hits, 0 errors, 1 LOB.

Charlevoix 3rd - Clapp struck out swinging, out at first c to 1b. Nickel singled 
to left field. Bergman grounded out to 3b, SAC; Nickel advanced to second. 
Speigl struck out swinging. 0 runs, 1 hit, 0 errors, 1 LOB.

JacksonLumen Christi 3rd - Fitzpatrick grounded out to 3b. Sattler hit by pitch. 
King singled to shortstop; Sattler advanced to second. Gregory flied out to 
lf. Kalahar singled through the left side; King advanced to second; Sattler 
advanced to third. Gaston struck out looking. 0 runs, 2 hits, 0 errors, 3 LOB.

Charlevoix 4th - Waha doubled to left center. Pearl singled to left field; Waha 
advanced to third. Johnson singled to second base, RBI; Pearl advanced to 
second; Waha scored. Lemerand singled to left field; Johnson advanced to sec-
ond; Pearl advanced to third. Batkoski reached on a fielder’s choice; Lemerand 
advanced to second; Johnson advanced to third; Pearl out at home 3b to c. 
Clapp flied out to rf. Nickel grounded out to p. 1 run, 4 hits, 0 errors, 3 LOB.

JacksonLumen Christi 4th - Hinkley struck out looking. Walicki walked. Walicki 
stole second. Walicki advanced to third on a wild pitch. Crowley walked. 
Fitzpatrick lined into double play 3b unassisted; Walicki out on the play. 0 
runs, 0 hits, 0 errors, 1 LOB.

Charlevoix 5th - Bergman struck out swinging. Speigl flied out to lf. Waha 
struck out looking. 0 runs, 0 hits, 0 errors, 0 LOB.

JacksonLumen Christi 5th - Sattler hit by pitch. King fouled out to rf. Gregory flied 
into double play rf to 1b; Sattler out on the play. 0 runs, 0 hits, 0 errors, 0 LOB.

Charlevoix 6th - Pearl grounded out to ss. Johnson struck out swinging. 
Lemerand grounded out to ss. 0 runs, 0 hits, 0 errors, 0 LOB.

JacksonLumen Christi 6th - Kalahar doubled to right center. Gaston hit by 
pitch. Hinkley grounded into double play 3b to 1b; Gaston advanced to 
second; Kalahar out on the play. Walicki struck out swinging, out at first c to 
1b. 0 runs, 1 hit, 0 errors, 1 LOB.

Charlevoix 7th - Batkoski grounded out to ss. Clapp grounded out to 2b. Nickel 
grounded out to ss. 0 runs, 0 hits, 0 errors, 0 LOB.

JacksonLumen Christi 7th - Crowley hit by pitch. Fitzpatrick singled to left field; 
Crowley advanced to second. Sattler flied out to cf. King struck out swinging. 
Gregory reached on a fielding error by ss; Fitzpatrick advanced to third; Crowley 
scored, unearned. Kalahar reached on a fielding error by 3b; Gregory advanced 
to second; Fitzpatrick scored, unearned. Waha to 1b. Pearl to ss. Johnson to 3b. 
Lemerand to p. Gaston singled through the right side, RBI; Kalahar advanced to 
second; Gregory scored, unearned. 3 runs, 2 hits, 2 errors, 2 LOB.

P L A Y - B Y - P L A Y
2024 MHSAA BASEBALL

Charlevoix 2 (27-11-1)
PLAYER................................. AB	 R	 H	 RBI	 BB	 SO	 PO	 A	 LOB
TROY NICKEL C........................4	  0 	 1	  0	 0	 1	 6	 1	 3
EMMETT BERGMAN RF...........2	 0	 0	 0	 0	 1	 2	 1	 0
AIDEN SPEIGL CF....................3	 0	 0	 0	 0	 1	 3	 0	 1
OWEN WAHA SS/1B................3	 1	 1	 0	 0	 2	 0 	 0	  0
RYAN PEARL 3B/SS.................3	 1	 2	 0	 0	 0	 3	 2	 0
BRYCE JOHNSON P/3B............3	 0	 1	 1	 0	 2	 0	 0	 0
HUNTER LEMERAND 1B/P......3	 0	 2	 1	 0	  0	 4	 0	 0
MAX BATKOSKIREYNOLDS LF.3	 0	 0	 0	 0	 1	 2	 0	 1
DYLAN CLAPP DH...................3	 0	 0	 0	 0	 1	 0	 0	 0
MATTHEW JAREMA 2B...........0	 0	 0	 0	 0	 0	 0	 0	 0
TOTALS...................................27	 2	 7	 2	 0	 9	 20	 4	 5

JacksonLumen Christi 3 (30-10)
PLAYER.................................  AB	  R	  H	 RBI	 BB	 SO	 PO	 A	 LOB
Paul Sattler 3b.........................1	 0	 0	 0	 1	  0	  0 	 2	 0
Gabe King p.............................4	  0 	 1	 0	 0	 1	 0	 1	 0
Brodie Gregory ss....................4	 1	  0	 0	 0	 1	  0	 4	  0
Kash Kalahar c.........................4	 0	 2	 0	 0	 0	 8	 2	 1
Benny Gaston 2b.....................2	 0	 1	 1	 0	 1	 0 	 3	 3
Nathan Hinkley dh..................3 	 0	 0	 0	 0	 1	 0	 0 	  0
Ryan Walicki lf.........................2	 0	 0	 0	 1	 2	 1	  0	 1
Timmy Crowley 1b..................1	 1	 0	 0	 1	 1	 11	 0	 1
Jack Fitzpatrick rf...................  3	 1	 1	 0	 0	  0	 1	 0	 1
Gannon Shore cf......................0	 0	 0	 0	 0	  0	 0	  0	 0
TOTALS...................................24	 3	 5	 1	 3	 7	 21	 12	 9

SCORE BY INNINGS  ............ 			   R  H   E
Charlevoix............................  010	 100 	 0	 2  7  2
JacksonLumen Christi............000	 000	 3	 3  5  0
Note: 2 outs, 2 runners LOB when the game ended.

E - Waha; Pearl. DP - CHS 3. LOB - CHS 5; JLC 9. 2B - Waha; Lemerand; Kalahar. 
HBP - Sattler 2; Gaston 2; Crowley. SH - Bergman. SB - Sattler; Gaston; Walicki.

CHARLEVOIX.......................... IP	 H	 R	 ER	 BB	 SO	 AB	 BF
Bryce Johnson....................... 6.2	 4	 3	 0	 3	 7	 23	 31
Hunter Lemerand.................. 0.0 	 1	  0	 0	 0 	 0	 1	 1

JACKSONLUMEN CHRISTI ..... IP	 H	 R	 ER	 BB	 SO	 AB	 BF
Gabe King............................. 7.0	 7	 2	 2	 0	 9	 27	 28

Win - King.  Loss - Johnson.  Save - None.
WP - Johnson. HBP - by Johnson (Gaston); by Johnson (Sattler); by Johnson
(Sattler); by Johnson (Gaston); by Johnson (Crowley).
Umpires - HP: Malik Baker  1B: Jeff Herman  2B: Jacob Moreno  3B: Denny 
Hewitt
Start: 9:01 am   Time: 1:41   Attendance:
Game notes:
Michigan High School Athletic Association Baseball Division 3 Semifinal#1
Weather: Sunny, 76F, Wind W 10 mph, Humidity 64%
Lemerand faced 1 batter in the 7th.

 Charlevoix’s Max Reynolds lays down a bunt against  
Pinconning. (Photo by: Todd VanSickle)

Emmett Bergmann slides safely back to first base against 
Pinconning in the Division 3 Regional final at the Trojan 

Athletic Complex in Traverse City on Saturday.  
(Photo by: Todd VanSickle)

Charlevoix’s Troy Nickel attempts to turn a double 
play at second base. (Photo by: Todd VanSickle)

B O X  S C O R E
2024 MHSAA BASEBALL TOURNAMENT

Charlevoix vs JacksonLumen Christi
June 13, 2024 at East Lansing, Mich. (McLane Stadium)

   
  

OPEN 24 HOURS
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2 LOCATIONS TO SERVE YOU!
1400 Bridge Street • Charlevoix 
3950 Alpha Blvd • Traverse City

Marc Anderson                   231-547-0742 

Refreshments will be served

There will be brief updates presented by:
The Village of Ellsworth • Banks Township • Ellsworth Community School

Ellsworth Downtown Development Authority (DDA)
East Jordan/Ellsworth Chamber of Commerce

Ellsworth Parks Consultant - River & Community Parks

The remainder of the meeting will be devoted to gathering your input. 
Of particular interest will be your thought on the improvement to 

Ellsworth’s two waterfront parks

State Of the COmmunity

MEETING
Monday, June 24, 2024

6 to 7 p.m.
Banks Township Hall

We need 

your input!
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2023 Water Quality Report
for City of Boyne City 
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Brief Job Description: The Head of School is to advance the mission and vision of Ot-
sego Christian School by providing overall leadership and supervision of the school and
serve as a liaison between the school and the Board of Directors. The Head of School
will also minister to the OCS faculty and staff in their faith, and mentor them to live out
their faith in their chosen calling and profession.
Qualifications:
• Faith

• Must be a born-again Christian, whose godly lifestyle and character demonstrate
obedience to God and the Bible.
• Must be committed to attending and joining, as a member, one of the area
churches.

• Leadership
• Acts as a visionary leader, implementing innovative ideas that will continue to en-
hance the culture, and bring growth and relevance to Christian education.
• Is a servant leader who possesses a humble and compassionate heart with listen-
ing ears.
• Empowers those serving alongside them and is able to cultivate employee morale
by implementing relational interactions and maintaining approachability with all fac-
ulty and staff.
• Recognizes Christ as the model for leadership by extending confidence, boldness
and assurance as a leader, being a strategic thinker and problem solver.

Education/Experience
• Bachelor’s degree or higher in education and have classroom teaching experience.
• Three years’ experience of school leadership (preferred).
• Agree with OCS’s educational objectives and philosophy of education.

Roles and responsibilities: 
• Personal and Spiritual Leadership
• Administrative Leadership
• Financial Management
• Educational Leadership
• Marketing & Fund Leadership

Reports to: The Otsego Christian School Board of Directors (BOD)
Supervises: All Staff
Compensation: Based upon qualifications
Send Resume to: teamOCSgaylord@gmail.com

OTSEGO CHRISTIAN SCHOOL IN GAYLORD, MI IS 
SEEKING A HEAD OF SCHOOL FOR PRE-K-9TH GRADE

PUBLIC NOTICE
NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN that the Public Accuracy Test for 
the August 6, 2024, Primary Election has been scheduled for all 
jurisdictions. 
Please see below for the dates, times, and locations.

Bay Township July 17, 2024, at 9:30 a.m.
05045 Boyne City Rd, Boyne City, MI 49712

Boyne Valley Township July 10, 2024, at 11:00 a.m.
2489 Railroad St., Boyne Falls, 49713

Chandler Township July 15, 2024, at 4:00 p.m.
07620 Chandler Hill Rd. Boyne Falls, MI 49713

Charlevoix Township July 17, 2024, at 11:00 a.m.
12491 Waller Rd., Charlevoix, 49720

Evangeline Township July 19, 2024, at 10:30 a.m.
02746 Wildwood Harbor Rd, Boyne City, MI 49712

Eveline Township July 17, 2024, at 9:00 a.m.
201 Main Street, East Jordan, MI 49727

Hayes Township July 8, 2024, at 10:00 a.m.
09195 Major Douglas Sloan Rd., Charlevoix, MI 49720

Hudson Township July 9, 2024, at 4:00 p.m.
07865 Reynolds Rd., Elmira, 49730

Marion Township July 17, 2024, at 8:00 p.m.
03735 Marion Center Rd., Charlevoix, 49720

Melrose Township June 28, 2024, at 8:00 a.m.
04289 M75 N., Walloon Lake, 49796

Norwood Township July 18, 2024, at 5:00 p.m.
00640 Lakeshore, Charlevoix, 49720

Peaine Township July 11, 2024, at 4:30 p.m.
36825 Kings Hwy, Beaver Island, 49782

St. James Township July 18, 2024, at 1:00 p.m.
37735 Michigan Ave., Beaver Island, 49782

South Arm Township July 17, 2024, at 9:00 a.m.
201 Main Street, East Jordan, MI 49727

Wilson Township July 15, 2024, at 2:00 p.m.
02530 Fall Park Rd., Boyne City, 49712

Boyne City July 11, 2024, at 9:00 a.m.
319 North Lake St, Boyne City, 49712

Charlevoix City July 11, 2024, at 10:00 a.m.
210 State St., Charlevoix, 49720

East Jordan City July 17, 2024, at 9:00 a.m.
201 Main Street, East Jordan, 49727

The Public Accuracy Test is conducted to demonstrate that the 
computer program used to record and count the votes cast at the  
election meets the requirements of law.

JULIA A. DROST
Charlevoix County Clerk
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4 WHEEL DRIVE
2010 Ram 1500. 4x4, tow 
pkg, 5.7L Hemi, bedliner, soft 
tonneau, 287 K miles. Sale 
Price $5,995. As low as $249 
a month. Rivertown Auto Sales 
& Leasing. 989 VFW Rd, Che-
boygan. 231-627-6700. Need 
a car a day or a week. We rent 
vehicles.

2013 Chevy Avalanche. Black 
Diamond Edition. 4x4, Moon 
roof, leather, 237 K miles. 
Beautiful truck. Sale Price 
$13,995. As low as $349 a 
month. Rivertown Auto Sales 
& Leasing. 989 VFW Rd, Che-
boygan. 231-627-6700. Need 
a car a day or a week. We rent 
vehicles.

2014 CHEVY SILVERADO 
1500 4WD. SALE PRICE 
$14,295. FINANCE FOR 60 
MOS. at $283 MONTH. Jim 
Wernig Chevrolet, 2401 Old 27 
South, Gaylord. 989-732-5161, 
www.JimWernigChevrolet.com

2015 Ford F-250 FX4 Off 
Road. 6.7 L Turbo Diesel. Moon 
roof, leather, quad cab, tow 
pkg, bedliner, hard tonneau 
cover, 288 K miles. Sale Price 
$24,995. As low as $399 a 
month. Rivertown Auto Sales 
& Leasing. 989 VFW Rd, Che-
boygan. 231-627-6700. Need 
a car a day or a week. We rent 
vehicles.

2015 Ford F-250 Super Duty 
XLT. 4x4, bedliner, double cab, 
tow pkg, 225 K miles. Sale 
Price $16,495. As low as $550 
a month. Rivertown Auto Sales 
& Leasing. 989 VFW Rd, Che-
boygan. 231-627-6700. 

2016 GMC SIERRA 3500 HD 
SLE. REGULAR CAB, LONG 
BOX, 4X4. SALE $33,995. 
FINANCE FOR 60 MOS. As low 
as $715 MO. Jim Wernig GMC. 
2086 South. Gaylord. 989-448-
4757. www.WernigGMC.com

2017 FORD SUPERDUTY 
F350 SRW. XL, 4X4, CREW 
CAB, 6.75’ BOX. SALE 
$50,862. FINANCE FOR 60 
MOS. As low as $1070 MO. 
Jim Wernig GMC. 2086 South. 
Gaylord. 989-448-4757. www.
WernigGMC.com

2019 CHEVY SILVERADO 
1500 LT. DOUBLE CAB, 4X4, 
STANDARD BOX. SALE 
$26,983. FINANCE FOR 60 
MOS. As low as $566 MO. Jim 
Wernig GMC. 2086 South. 
Gaylord. 989-448-4757. www.
WernigGMC.com

2019 RAM 1500 BIG HORN 
4WD. Tonneau Cover, Running 
Boards, Pwr. Mirrors. SALE 
PRICE $24,995. FINANCE 
FOR 60 MOS. at $495 MONTH. 
Jim Wernig Chevrolet, 2401 Old 
27 South, Gaylord. 989-732-
5161, www.JimWernigChevro-
let.com

2019 Subaru Legacy. AWD, 
82 K miles, $18,995. As low 
as $305 a month. Byrider - 
NorthFin Automotive . 2215 US 
Hwy 31 N, Petoskey. Call Zeke 
Eberly, 231-347-3200. Buy. Fi-
nance. Drive On, PLUS, get an 
additional $50 Gas Card when 
any vehicle purchase when you 
let us know you saw the ad in 
the Weekly Choice.

2021 TOYOTA TACOMA SR 
4WD. 1-Owner, Tonneau Cov-
er, New Tires. SALE PRICE 
$32,995. FINANCE FOR 72 
MOS. at $571 MONTH. Jim 
Wernig Chevrolet, 2401 Old 
27 South, Gaylord. 989-732-
5161, www.JimWernigChev-
rolet.com

2022 Ram 3/4 ton. 4x4, crew 
cab, long bed, 55 K miles. Sale 
Price $32,995. As low as $499 
a month. Rivertown Auto Sales 
& Leasing. 989 VFW Rd, Che-
boygan. 231-627-6700. Need 
a car a day or a week. We rent 
vehicles.

2024 CHEVY SILVERADO 
3500 HD. 1-Owner, Boss 
Plow, Long Box. SALE PRICE 
$63,695. FINANCE FOR 84 
MOS. at $993 MONTH. Jim 
Wernig Chevrolet, 2401 Old 27 
South, Gaylord. 989-732-5161, 
www.JimWernigChevrolet.com

CERTIFIED PRE-OWNED. 
2019 GMC SIERRA 1500 SLT 
4X4. CREW CAB, 1 OWNER, 
WIRELESS PHONE CHAR-
GER. SALE $36,025. FINANCE 
FOR 60 MOS. As low as $759 
MO. Jim Wernig GMC. 2086 
South. Gaylord. 989-448-4757. 
www.WernigGMC.com

CERTIFIED PRE-OWNED. 
2021 CHEVY SILVERADO 
1500 LT. Sunroof, BOSE Audio, 
Trail Boss 4WD. SALE PRICE 
$40,995. FINANCE FOR 72 
MOS. at $709 MONTH. Jim 
Wernig Chevrolet, 2401 Old 27 
South, Gaylord. 989-732-5161, 
www.JimWernigChevrolet.com

CERTIFIED PRE-OWNED. 
2021 GMC SIERRA 1500 
DENALI. 6,2L V8, 4X4, CREW 
CAB, SHORT BOX. SALE 
$48,843. FINANCE FOR 60 
MOS. As low as $1028 MO. 
Jim Wernig GMC. 2086 South. 
Gaylord. 989-448-4757. www.
WernigGMC.com

CERTIFIED PRE-OWNED. 
2022 GMC SIERRA 3500HD 
4X4 PRO. 1 OWNER, CERTI-
FIED, NEW REAR BRAKES. 
SALE $43,113. FINANCE FOR 
60 MOS. As low as $907 MO. 
Jim Wernig GMC. 2086 South. 
Gaylord. 989-448-4757. www.
WernigGMC.com

CERTIFIED PRE-OWNED. 
2023 GMC SIERRA 1500 
ELEVATION 3SB. CREW CAB, 
SHORT BOX, 4X4. SALE 
$51,914. FINANCE FOR 84 
MOS. As low as $860 MO. Jim 
Wernig GMC. 2086 South. 
Gaylord. 989-448-4757. www.
WernigGMC.com

ADVICE FROM GOD
For if you forgive other people 
when they sin against you, your 
heavenly Father will also forgive 
you. Matthew‬ 6:14‬ NIV‬‬

ANNOUNCEMENTS
Are you looking for something 
more? God has a plan for you. 
Encouraging, Uplifting and 
Challenging. Join us Sunday 
morning at 11am for great mu-
sic and ministry and discover-
ing what the Bible says. Pigeon 
River Baptist Church, 2 blocks 
south of the blinker in Vander-
bilt. If you can’t attend, Watch 
on Facebook Live Sundays at 
11AM, search Pigeon River 
Baptist Church.

DO YOU HAVE SOMETHING 
NICE TO SAY? We would like 
to hear something nice you 
have to say about businesses 
or people in Northern Michigan. 
Send us a note in the mail or by 
e-mail. Each week we will pub-
lish positive comments from our 
readers in the Weekly Choice, 
Charlevoix County News and 
Michigan MoneySaver. Mail 
your note to Weekly Choice, 
PO Box 382, Gaylord, MI 49734 
or e-mail to Office@Weekly-
Choice.com. Negative notes 
may be sent elsewhere. 

LOCALLY OWNED, LOCALLY 
OPERATED, LOCAL NEWS, 
LOCAL SPORTS. The Weekly 
Choice and Charlevoix County 
News and Michigan Mon-
eySaver are locally owned 
newspapers. We are inde-
pendently owned newspapers 
based in Gaylord, Michigan 
Dave Baragrey and the staff of 
news writers, sports writ-
ers, photographers, graphic 
designers, delivery people and 
sales people all live and work 
here and care about our local 
communities we serve. We hear 
from readers every week how 
much they appreciate all the 
local coverage. We appreciate 
all the positive response from 
both readers and advertisers to 
our newspapers that we hear 
so frequently. CHOICE PUB-
LICATIONS AND MICHIGAN 
MEDIA. Publisher of the Weekly 
Choice, Charlevoix County 
News, Michigan MoneySaver 
and APS – Advertisers Postal 
Service. 112 East Sixth St., 
Gaylord • Office – 989-732-
8160, Cell – 989-350-9235 • 
Office@WeeklyChoice.com

LOWEST COST IN MICHI-
GAN! CLASSIFIED ADS ARE 
JUST $2 for an 8-word ad in 
the Weekly Choice, Charlevoix 
County News or Michigan Mon-
eySaver. The area’s widest dis-
tribution paper and the lowest 
cost for advertising. E-mail your 
ad to Office@WeeklyChoice.
com or call 989-732-8160. The 
Weekly Choice is distributed 
weekly from Mackinaw City to 
Grayling. 11 zones of the Mich-
igan MoneySaver distributed 
from Traverse City to Tawas 
City. Northern Michigan’s best 
choice for buying and selling.

AUCTIONS
Ferris Street Online Auction bid 
now through June 20. Oak table 
& chairs, wine cooler, vintage 
advertising signs, Looney Toon 
glasses, Pyrex, collectibles, 
knives, antiques and more!  To 
bid visit Bid.SherwoodAuction-
ServiceLLC.com. Call 800-835-
0495.

Large Online Firearm Auction. 
Bidding open. 300+ guns, 
ammunition, accessories. Bid 
anywhere anytime at john-
peckauctions.com Inspection/
shipping available. Merchandise 
pickup Charlotte or Gladwin. 
Selling guns? Call John Peck 
989-345-4866. Michigan’s Pre-
mier Gun Auctioneers.

Live Auction Wednesday June 
26th 10 am 1600 Euler Rd. 
Brighton MI 48114. 1995 Ford 
8000 8.3 Cummins crane truck, 
chains, crated engines, 16’ 
rowboat & more. Visit NarhiAuc-
tions.com 810-266-6474.

Multiple quality estate auctions 
bidding open @johnpeckauc-
tions.com plus Large Firearm 
& Ammunition Opening Soon. 
Bid anywhere anytime. Need 
an auction? Call John 989-426-
8061. Offices Charlotte & Glad-
win. Award-winning auctioneers 
45 years.

Weddle Estate Online Auction 
bid now through June 27. Hand-
gun, ammo, hunting knives, 
pocketknives, hunting/shooting 
supplies, kitchen applianc-
es, dinner ware, collectibles, 
antiques and more!  To bid visit 
Bid.SherwoodAuctionServi-
ceLLC.com. Call 800-835-0495.

Wurtsmith Airport & Watts 
Moving Auction happening now. 
Bid anywhere, anytime @John-
PeckAuctions.com. Aerospace, 
boats, trailers, three-wheeler, 
snowmobiles, tools. Selling or 
need an auction? Call John 
Peck 989-426-8061. Offices 
Charlotte & Gladwin.

AUTOMOBILES
2012 Chevy Impala LT. 167 K 
miles. Cash price $6,995. As 
low as $199 a month. North Fin 
Automotive located at Byrider - 
2215 US Hwy 31 N, Petoskey. 
Call Zeke Eberly, 231-347-
3200. Buy. Finance. Drive On, 
PLUS, get an additional $50 
Gas Card when any vehicle 
purchase when you let us know 
you saw the ad in the Weekly 
Choice.

2012 Dodge Avenger. $7,995. 
As low as $199 a month. 
North Fin Automotive located 
at Byrider - 2215 US Hwy 31 
N, Petoskey. Call Zeke Eberly, 
231-347-3200. Buy. Finance. 
Drive On, PLUS, get an addi-
tional $50 Gas Card when any 
vehicle purchase when you let 
us know you saw the ad in the 
Weekly Choice.

2012 Subaru Legacy. AWD, 160 
K miles. Sale Price $5,995. As 
low as $199 a month. River-
town Auto Sales & Leasing. 989 
VFW Rd, Cheboygan. 231-627-
6700. Need a car a day or a 
week. We rent vehicles.

2012 Toyota Corolla LE. 110 
K miles. Buy Here, Pay Here. 
Byrider - 2215 US Hwy 31 N, 
Petoskey. Call Zeke Eberly, 
231-347-3200. Buy. Finance. 
Drive On, PLUS, get an addi-
tional $50 Gas Card when any 
vehicle purchase when you let 
us know you saw the ad in the 
Weekly Choice.

2014 Subaru Outback. AWD, 
117 K miles. Buy Here, Pay 
Here. Byrider - 2215 US Hwy 
31 N, Petoskey. Call Zeke 
Eberly, 231-347-3200. Buy. Fi-
nance. Drive On, PLUS, get an 
additional $50 Gas Card when 
any vehicle purchase when you 
let us know you saw the ad in 
the Weekly Choice.

2017 Hyundai Sonata. 120 K 
miles. Buy Here, Pay Here. 
Byrider - 2215 US Hwy 31 N, 
Petoskey. Call Zeke Eberly, 
231-347-3200. Buy. Finance. 
Drive On, PLUS, get an addi-
tional $50 Gas Card when any 
vehicle purchase when you let 
us know you saw the ad in the 
Weekly Choice.

2018 Nissan Sentra. Rear 
camera, 62 K miles. Buy Here, 
Pay Here. Byrider - 2215 US 
Hwy 31 N, Petoskey. Call Zeke 
Eberly, 231-347-3200. Buy. Fi-
nance. Drive On, PLUS, get an 
additional $50 Gas Card when 
any vehicle purchase when you 
let us know you saw the ad in 
the Weekly Choice.

2019 Chevy Cruze. Rear 
camera, great MPG, 52 K 
miles. $16,995. As low as $349 
a month. Byrider - NorthFin 
Automotive . 2215 US Hwy 31 
N, Petoskey. Call Zeke Eberly, 
231-347-3200. Buy. Finance. 
Drive On, PLUS, get an addi-
tional $50 Gas Card when any 
vehicle purchase when you let 
us know you saw the ad in the 
Weekly Choice.

2019 Subaru Outback. AWD, 
rear camera, leather, 86 K 
miles. $19,995. As low as $329 
a month North Fin Automotive 
located at Byrider - 2215 US 
Hwy 31 N, Petoskey. Call Zeke 
Eberly, 231-347-3200. Buy. Fi-
nance. Drive On, PLUS, get an 
additional $50 Gas Card when 
any vehicle purchase when you 
let us know you saw the ad.

2022 TOYOTA COROLLA 
CROSS. 1-Owner, Spacious, 
AWD. SALE PRICE $24,895. 
FINANCE FOR 72 MOS. at 
$431 MONTH. Jim Wernig 
Chevrolet, 2401 Old 27 South, 
Gaylord. 989-732-5161, www.
JimWernigChevrolet.com

Are you tired of driving a 
vehicle that breaks down all 
the time. Get a LOW MILEAGE 
automobile at Byrider. 2215 US 
Hwy 31 N, Petoskey. Call Zeke 
Eberly, 231-347-3200. Buy. Fi-
nance. Drive On, PLUS, get an 
additional $50 Gas Card when 
any vehicle purchase when you 
let us know you saw the ad.

I BUY CARS! Wrecked or in 
need of mechanical repair, 
1995 and up. Gaylord area. 
989-732-9362

Just Arrived! 2021 Audi A-5. 81 
K miles. North Fin Automotive 
located at Byrider - 2215 US 
Hwy 31 N, Petoskey. Call Zeke 
Eberly, 231-347-3200. Buy. Fi-
nance. Drive On, PLUS, get an 
additional $50 Gas Card when 
any vehicle purchase when you 
let us know you saw the ad.

Just Arrived! 2021 Nissan 
Altima. 65 K miles. Byrider - 
NorthFin Automotive . 2215 US 
Hwy 31 N, Petoskey. Call Zeke 
Eberly, 231-347-3200. Buy. Fi-
nance. Drive On, PLUS, get an 
additional $50 Gas Card when 
any vehicle purchase when you 
let us know you saw the ad in 
the Weekly Choice.

Just Arrived! 2021 Nissan 
Versa. 65 K miles. 3 to choose 
from. North Fin Automotive 
located at Byrider - 2215 US 
Hwy 31 N, Petoskey. Call Zeke 
Eberly, 231-347-3200. Buy. Fi-
nance. Drive On, PLUS, get an 
additional $50 Gas Card when 
any vehicle purchase when you 
let us know you saw the ad.

BOATS & MARINE
1985 INKER BOAT. 20’, 140 HP 
I/O, $6,500 obo. 231-944-2025

SEA KAYAK, P&H Virgo, 14 
feet 6 inches long, 23 inches 
wide, 52 pounds, polyethylene 
construction, with skeg. Good 
for day trips on the bay or lakes. 
$950. Call 231-330-1408.

BUILDING  
MATERIALS
AMISH BUILT MINI CABIN 12 x 
24 $10,900.00. New construc-
tion, delivery included. Call for 
details, other sizes & options.  
989-832-1866

AMISH BUILT storage sheds 
and mini cabins delivered to 
your site anywhere in Michigan. 
Starting at $2,500. mynextbarn.
com. 989-832-1866

BATH & SHOWER UPDATES 
in as little as one day! Afford-
able prices - No payments for 
18 months!  Lifetime warranty 
& professional installs. Senior 
& Military Discounts available. 
Call: 844-587-8518
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Summary of Evangeline Township Zoning Ordinance AmendmentSummary of Evangeline Township Zoning Ordinance Amendment
Concerning Sand and GravelConcerning Sand and Gravel

Ordinance No. 2024-06-11Ordinance No. 2024-06-11

THE TOWNSHIP OF EVANGELINE HEREBY ORDAINS:THE TOWNSHIP OF EVANGELINE HEREBY ORDAINS:

Section 1. Amendment of Section 2.01.Section 1. Amendment of Section 2.01.
This section amends Section 2.01 of the zoning ordinance to add the following This section amends Section 2.01 of the zoning ordinance to add the following 
definitions: Decibel, Excavating, Excavation Operation, Mining Operation, definitions: Decibel, Excavating, Excavation Operation, Mining Operation, 
Quarrying Operation, Sand and Gravel, and Topsoil.Quarrying Operation, Sand and Gravel, and Topsoil.

Section 2. Amendment of Section 5.07.24.Section 2. Amendment of Section 5.07.24.
This section amends Section 5.07.24 of the zoning ordinance to add a new This section amends Section 5.07.24 of the zoning ordinance to add a new 
subsection K, which allows by right sand and gravel excavation operations for subsection K, which allows by right sand and gravel excavation operations for 
up to one thousand (1,000) cubic yards of topsoil, sand, clay, gravel or similar up to one thousand (1,000) cubic yards of topsoil, sand, clay, gravel or similar 
material in the mixed use zoning district.material in the mixed use zoning district.

Section 3. Amendment of Section 5.07.25.Section 3. Amendment of Section 5.07.25.
This section amends Section 5.07.25 of the zoning ordinance to re-letter This section amends Section 5.07.25 of the zoning ordinance to re-letter 
current subsections E and F to subsections A and B and to add a new subsec-current subsections E and F to subsections A and B and to add a new subsec-
tion C, which allows by a special use permit sand and gravel excavation  tion C, which allows by a special use permit sand and gravel excavation  
operations one thousand (1,000) cubic yards or more of topsoil, sand, clay, operations one thousand (1,000) cubic yards or more of topsoil, sand, clay, 
gravel or similar material in the mixed use zoning district.gravel or similar material in the mixed use zoning district.

Section 4. Amendment of Section 5.07.26.Section 4. Amendment of Section 5.07.26.
This section amends Section 5.07.26 of the zoning ordinance to re-letter This section amends Section 5.07.26 of the zoning ordinance to re-letter 
current subsections D, E and F to subsections A, B, and C.current subsections D, E and F to subsections A, B, and C.

Section 5. Amendment of Section 5.08.2.Section 5. Amendment of Section 5.08.2.
This section amends Section 5.08.2 of the zoning ordinance to add a new This section amends Section 5.08.2 of the zoning ordinance to add a new 
subsection L, which allows by right sand and gravel excavation operations for subsection L, which allows by right sand and gravel excavation operations for 
up to one thousand (1,000) cubic yards of topsoil, sand, clay, gravel or similar up to one thousand (1,000) cubic yards of topsoil, sand, clay, gravel or similar 
material in the rural residential/farm forest zoning district.material in the rural residential/farm forest zoning district.

Section 6. Amendment of Section 5.08.3.Section 6. Amendment of Section 5.08.3.
This section amends Section 5.08.3 of the zoning ordinance to add a new This section amends Section 5.08.3 of the zoning ordinance to add a new 
subsection I, which allows by a special use permit sand and gravel excavation subsection I, which allows by a special use permit sand and gravel excavation 
operations for one thousand (1,000) cubic yards or more of topsoil, sand, operations for one thousand (1,000) cubic yards or more of topsoil, sand, 
clay, gravel or similar material in the rural residential/farm forest zoning  clay, gravel or similar material in the rural residential/farm forest zoning  
district.district.

Section 7. Amendment of Section 8.12.A.Section 7. Amendment of Section 8.12.A.
This section amends Section 8.12.A of the zoning ordinance to prohibit any This section amends Section 8.12.A of the zoning ordinance to prohibit any 
person or entity from stripping greater than one thousand (1,000) cubic yards person or entity from stripping greater than one thousand (1,000) cubic yards 
of topsoil, sand, clay, gravel or similar material, or to use lands for filling  of topsoil, sand, clay, gravel or similar material, or to use lands for filling  
within the Township without first submitting a site plan and procuring approval within the Township without first submitting a site plan and procuring approval 
from the Planning Commission.from the Planning Commission.

Section 8. Amendment of Section 8.12.D.6.b.Section 8. Amendment of Section 8.12.D.6.b.
This section amends Section 8.12.D.6.b of the zoning ordinance concerning This section amends Section 8.12.D.6.b of the zoning ordinance concerning 
regulations related to reclaiming the land after the extraction in that area is regulations related to reclaiming the land after the extraction in that area is 
completed.completed.

Section 9. Amendment of Section 8.12.D.6.c.Section 9. Amendment of Section 8.12.D.6.c.
This section amends Section 8.12.D.6.c of the zoning ordinance concerning This section amends Section 8.12.D.6.c of the zoning ordinance concerning 
regulations related to grading, drainage, re-vegetation/re-forestation, and  regulations related to grading, drainage, re-vegetation/re-forestation, and  
stabilization of the land after the extraction in that area is completed.stabilization of the land after the extraction in that area is completed.

Section 10. Amendment of Section 8.12.D.6.h.Section 10. Amendment of Section 8.12.D.6.h.
This section amends Section 8.12.D.6.h of the zoning ordinance concerning This section amends Section 8.12.D.6.h of the zoning ordinance concerning 
regulations related to stockpiling and reusing native topsoil.regulations related to stockpiling and reusing native topsoil.

Section 11. Severability.Section 11. Severability.
This section provides that the provisions of the ordinance are legally severable.This section provides that the provisions of the ordinance are legally severable.

Section 12. Effective Date.Section 12. Effective Date.
This section provides that the ordinance becomes effective 8 days after the This section provides that the ordinance becomes effective 8 days after the 
publication of this summary.publication of this summary.

NOTICE: Please take note that a true copy of the ordinance can be inspect-NOTICE: Please take note that a true copy of the ordinance can be inspect-
ed or obtained at the office of the Evangeline Township Clerk.ed or obtained at the office of the Evangeline Township Clerk.

BID NOTICE
Charlevoix County is now accepting sealed bids for 
the repair, sealing, and striping of parking lots.

• Charlevoix County Courthouse building located 
at 203 Antrim Street, Charlevoix, MI 49720 – Fill 
cracks, sealing, and striping.

• Charlevoix County Sheriff’s Department located 
at 1000 Grant Street, Charlevoix, MI 49720 – Fill 
cracks and striping.

• Charlevoix County Health Department of  
Northwest Michigan located at 220 West Garfield, 
Charlevoix, MI 49720 – Patching, sealing, and 
striping.

Please submit sealed bids in writing to the Charlevoix 
County Clerk, 203 Antrim Street, Charlevoix, MI 
49720, NO LATER THAN 4:00 P.M. on July 19, 2024. 
Charlevoix County reserves the right to accept or 
reject any and/or all bids. For questions, call Terry 
Amick at 231-437-0945. 

Bids will be opened in the Commissioner’s Room, 
203 Antrim Street, Charlevoix, MI 49720 at 1:00 p.m. 
Monday, July 22, 2024.

BUILDING  
MATERIALS (cont.)
BUILT RITE POLE BUILDINGS 
State-wide. Prices starting at - 
24x40x10 - $18,300. 30x40x10 
- $20,400. Erected on your site. 
Call for price not shown on any 
size building or go to www.buil-
tritepolebuildingsmi.com. Or call 
989-259-2015 or 989-600-1010.

METAL ROOFING regular 
and shingle style, Half off 
special colors. Lifetime asphalt 
shingles. Steel and vinyl siding. 
Hail damage. FEMA claims. 
Licensed and insured builders. 
Pole Buildings. Quality work for 
40 years! Amish crew. 517-575-
3695.   

POLE BARNS We build ALL 
year long! Built Best Barns. In a 
rush? Call us. Best quality, best 
service, now In Our 25th year. 
Over 4,000 Buildings In Michi-
gan Call for quotes. Licensed, 
Insured. 989-205-2534

Replace your roof with the best 
looking and longest lasting 
material – steel from Erie Metal 
Roofs! Three styles and mul-
tiple colors available. Guaran-
teed to last a lifetime! Limited 
Time Offer – 50% off installa-
tion + Additional 10% off install 
(for military, health workers & 
1st responders.) Call Erie Metal 
Roofs: 888-718-1856

Various styles of Utility Sheds. 
Finance for 48 months or Rent 
to Own. Free Delivery within 
30 miles. Rivertown Auto Sales 
& Leasing. 989 VFW Rd, Che-
boygan. 231-627-6700. Need 
a car a day or a week. We rent 
vehicles.

CLASSIC AUTOS
CASH FOR pre-1970 vehicles. 
Michel’s Collision & Restoration 
231-622-1553

DISCOUNT OFFER
Reach Across Michigan with a 
MegaMarket Statewide Classi-
fied Ad! Over 1.2 million weekly 
circulation just $249 per week! 
Buy 3 Get 1 Free! Call this 
paper, 989-732-8160.

FIREWOOD &  
WOODSTOVES
DRY FIREWOOD. Delivered 
within 30 miles of Boyne and 
Mancelona. 231-631-9600. B. 
Moeke, Boyne City.

FREE ITEMS
FREE wooden skids. Most are 
in very good shape. Others 
for kindling. New supply every 
week. APS Mini Warehouse. 
112 East Sixth Street, Gaylord

HAVE SOMETHING TO GIVE 
AWAY? Free items classified 
ads run free of charge in the 
Weekly Choice, Charlevoix 
County News and the Michigan 
MoneySaver. Call 989-732-
8160 or e-mail your ad to 
Office@WeeklyChoice.com.

FURNITURE
Adjustable Bed Brand New 
with mattress. Made is U.S.A., 
in plastic, with warranty. Retail 
cost $3,995, sacrifice for $875. 
Call for showing or delivery: 
DanDanTheMattressMan.com. 
989-615-2951

Amish Log Beds, Dressers, 
Rustic Table and Chairs, 
Mattresses for Cabin or Home. 
Lowest price in Michigan. 
DanDanTheMattressMan.com. 
989-923-1278

GARAGE &  
YARD SALES
VERY LARGE YARD SALE. 
Rain or shine. 6393 Noffze 
Hwy, Hawks (4 miles east of 
Hawks Store). Friday, June 21, 
Saturday, June 22, 9-6. Farm 
implements for yard décor, 
antiques, steel wheels, house-
wares, fishing poles & tackle, 
jewelry, wood chimes and traps. 
Large variety of items. Way too 
much to list. See Craigslist for 
photos. 989-619-7242

GUNS
FREE FIREARM APPRAISALS 
and Consignment Sales. Terry’s 
Gun Shop, Rose City MI. 
Buying Winchesters and 1899 
Savages. Call 989-709-1944.

HEALTH
ATTENTION OXYGEN THER-
APY USERS! Discover Oxygen 
Therapy that moves with you 
with Inogen Portable Oxygen 
Concentrators. Free information 
kit. Call 866-348-1952

VIAGRA and CIALIS USERS. 
50 Generic Pills. Special $99. 
100% guaranteed. 24/7. Call 
now. 888-835-7273 Hablamos 
Espanol

HELP WANTED
5 SALES POSITIONS OPEN. 
ROGERS CITY, PETOSKEY, 
WEST BRANCH, STANDISH 
and BENZIE COUNTY. Inde-
pendent contractor position 
earns 20% commission. Our 
family owned business is based 
in Gaylord, Michigan but we 
distribute our weekly papers 
in 100 towns in 19 counties 
in Northern Michigan. Send 
your resume to Dave Baragrey 
1. E-mail to Office@Weekly-
Choice.com

ATTENTION EMPLOYERS. 
Reach across the state with 
a Michigan MegaMarket 
Statewide Classified Network 
EMPLOYMENT classified 
ad. Reach 1.2 Million house-
holds within highly-read, local 

home-delivered newspapers 
and shopping guides each 
week! A 25-word ad is just 
$249.00, $10 for additional 
words per-week! Call 989-732-
8160 today.

FEATURE STORY WRITER. 
Writing experience preferred. 
The Weekly Choice, a Locally 
owned “Positive News” weekly 
paper is distributed all around 
Northern Michigan including 
Alpena, Gaylord, Petoskey, 
Cheboygan, Grayling, Indian 
River, Mackinaw City, Onaway, 
Lewiston, Mio, Mancelona, 
Kalkaska and everywhere in 
between. Freelance writer will 
supply articles and photos. $35 
per story plus $10 for photo(s). 
Email Resume Dave Baragrey. 
Office@WeeklyChoice.com

IMMEDIATE OPENING - 
BOYNE CITY, EAST JOR-
DAN, CHARLEVOIX. LOCAL 
NEWS WRITER. We have an 
immediate opening in this area. 
We are adding a writer to our 
staff of Charlevoix County’s 
popular local newspaper. Nice 
extra income for a few hours of 
work. You will need dependable 
transportation and a digital 
camera. Attend local govern-
ment meetings, feature local 
people, events and businesses. 
This is an independent con-
tractor position. E-mail Office@
CharlevoixCountyNews.com 
or call Dave at 989-732-8160. 
Charlevoix County News

Indian River, Petoskey. AD-
VERTISING SALES. We are 
expanding our coverage in the 
Petoskey and Indian River area 
and have an opening. This is 
an independent contractor po-
sition. 20% Commission. E-mail 
Office@WeeklyChoice.com 
or call Dave at 989-732-8160. 
Weekly Choice

Indian River. LOCAL NEWS 
WRITER and SPORTS WRIT-
ER/PHOTOGRAPHER. We 
are expanding our coverage in 
the Indian River area and have 
an opening. We are adding a 
writer to our staff of the Weekly 
Choice. Nice extra income for a 
few hours of work. You will need 
dependable transportation and 
a digital camera. Attend local 
government meetings, feature 
local people, events and busi-
nesses. Sports writer will attend 
local high school sporting 
events for photos and a game 
report. This is an independent 
contractor position. E-mail Of-
fice@WeeklyChoice.com or call 
Dave at 989-732-8160. Weekly 
Choice

Newspaper Home Delivery. 
GAYLORD, INDIAN RIVER 
AREA - We have an immediate 
opening in this area. Home De-
livery is primarily on Saturday 
or Sunday before Noon. Nice 
extra income for a few hours of 
work. You will need dependable 
transportation and weekends 
free. E-mail Office@Weekly-
Choice.com or call or text Dave 
Baragrey at 989-350-9235. 
Michigan MoneySaver – APS - 
Advertisers Postal Service.

SCREEN PRINTER / Sign Mak-
er / Shop Assistant. Experience 
preferred but not required. Will 
train the right person. Part time 
/ Full Time. Monday - Friday. 
Will pay for experience. Send 
resume to Xpresscc@gmail.
com or mail to Xpress Copy 
Center, 127 East Michigan Ave. 
Grayling, MI 49738

We have an immediate opening 
in this area. Home Delivery 
is primarily on Saturday or 
Sunday before Noon. Nice 
extra income for a few hours of 
work. You will need dependable 
transportation and weekends 
free. E-mail Office@Weekly-
Choice.com or call or text Dave 
Baragrey at 989-350-9235. 
Michigan MoneySaver – APS - 
Advertisers Postal Service.

Weekend Newspaper delivery 
in town. WALK ROUTES. Gay-
lord, Boyne City, Charlevoix, 
East Jordan, Indian River, King-
sley. Home Delivery is primarily 
on Saturday or Sunday before 
Noon. You will need weekends 
free. E-mail Office@Weekly-
Choice.com or call or text Dave 
Baragrey at 989-350-9235. 
Michigan MoneySaver – APS - 
Advertisers Postal Service.

HOMES FOR SALE
LOG CABIN. Little Bear Lake, 
Johannesburg, MI. New 
construction, 1,000 sq. ft, up to 
code, 50’ Lakefront, all sports, 
A must see. Call Todd 989-598-
1093

LAWN & GARDEN
PROFESSIONAL LAWN 
SERVICE: Fertilization, weed 
control, seeding, aeration and 
mosquito control. Call now for 
a free quote. Ask about our first 
application special. 877-411-
0998

Want a greener lawn? TruGreen 
is your go-to for a tailored lawn 
care plan. Act now and get 
50% off your first service with 
a purchase of an annual plan. 
Call us at 855-608-1458 to 
learn more

MISCELLANEOUS
6 FOOT Steel Scaffolding, 
Extra cross braces. $50. 989-
786-5539

Donate your car, truck, boat, 
RV and more to support our 
veterans! Schedule a fast, free 
vehicle pickup and receive a 
top tax deduction! Call Veteran 
Car Donations at 877-691-4117 
today.

Eliminate gutter cleaning 
forever! LeafFilter, the most 
advanced debris-blocking gutter 
protection. Schedule a free 
LeafFilter estimate today. 20% 
off Entire Purchase. Plus 10% 
Senior & Military Discounts. 
Call 844-369-2501

GAYLORD. WOODWORK-
ING TOOLS. 7.5” Skil saw & 
blades, air tools: Nails & brad, 
spray gun. Pocket hole jig and 
screws, 10” compound sliding 
mitre saw, power hand sanders 
and more. Some household 
items. 989-858-3346. 337 
Ragen Bogen

Get DISH Satellite TV + Inter-
net. Free install, Free HD-DVR 
upgrade, 80,000 On-Demand 
movies, plus limited time up to 
$600 in gift cards. Call today. 
866-950-6757

LOWEST COST IN MICHI-
GAN! CLASSIFIED ADS ARE 
JUST $2 for an 8-word ad in 
the Weekly Choice, Charlevoix 
County News or Michigan Mon-
eySaver. Northern Michigan’s 
best choice for buying and 
selling.

New Sheds Just Arrived. New 
styles. As low as $3,499. 
Purchase or Rent to Own. Fi-
nancing available. Free delivery 
within 30 miles. Rivertown Auto 
Sales & Leasing. 989 VFW Rd, 
Cheboygan. 231-627-6700. 
Need a car a day or a week. We 
rent vehicles.

POND SUPPLIES: Live game-
fish for stocking. Large selec-
tion of lake, pond and water-
garden supplies. Free catalog! 
Stoney Creek, Inc., Grant, MI. 
Since 1970. (800) 448-3873. 
www.stoneycreekequip.com

Pond/Lake Weed Removal 
Tools (The #1 alternative to 
chemicals.) Performs C.P.R. 
Cuts-Pulls-Rakes. Michigan 
Veteran Made.  Still $150, no 
price increase! 989-529-3992. 
WeedgatorProducts.com.

Prepare for power outages 
today with a Generac Home 
Standby Generator. Act now to 
receive a free 7-Year warranty 
with qualifying purchase. Call 
855-922-0420 today to sched-
ule a free quote. It’s not just a 
generator. It’s a power move.

Prepare for power outages with 
Briggs & Stratton &; Power-
Protect(TM) standby genera-
tors - the most powerful home 
standby generators available. 
Industry-leading comprehen-
sive warranty – 7 years ($849 
value.) Proudly made in the 
U.S.A. Call Briggs & Stratton. 
855-303-4767. 855-303-4767.

Various styles of Utility Sheds. 
Finance for 48 months or Rent 
to Own. Free Delivery within 
30 miles. Rivertown Auto Sales 
& Leasing. 989 VFW Rd, Che-
boygan. 231-627-6700. Need 
a car a day or a week. We rent 
vehicles.

MUSIC
Buying used vinyl LP records. 
Top dollar paid by local buyer. 
All genres. Leave message 
586-773-6050. 

NOTES OF  
ENCOURAGEMENT
Positive Notes of Encourage-
ment are free in the Weekly 
Choice, Charlevoix County 
News and Michigan MoneySav-
er. Birthday, Anniversary, Wed-
ding, Congratulations or just a 
Positive Note all are free. E-Mail 
your Note of Encouragement to 
Office@WeeklyChoice.com

PETS
PIGEONS WANTED. 989-786-
5539

RECREATIONAL 
VEHICLES
2000 dutchman 27 foot travel 
trailer, double slideout, $2,500. 
989-786-1031

2003 Spartan 40 foot Mo-
torhome. Double slideout, 
Owens 7500 watt quiet diesel 
generator, diesel pusher rear 
engine, 32 K miles. Sale Price 
$44,900. Rivertown Auto Sales 
& Leasing. 989 VFW Rd, Che-
boygan. 231-627-6700. Need 
a car a day or a week. We rent 
vehicles.

2023 Rockwood Ultra Lite 
2608BS Travel Trailer. 2 slide-
outs, Power awning with rain 
dump and LED, outside griddle, 
All In One Wi-Fi Booster/
LTE Prep & Antenna, outside 
shower. MSRP $58,660. Sale 
Price $42,995. Save $15,665. 
Petoskey RV USA. 2215 US 31 
North, Petoskey. 231-347-3200. 
www.PetoskeyRVUSA.com. 
PLUS, Save an additional $250 
when you let us know you saw 
the ad in the Weekly Choice.

2024 Cherokee Grey Wolf 
26BRB Travel Trailer. Bunk-
house sleeps 10, slideout, out-
door kitchen, 2 entry doors, fire-
place, backup camera. MSRP 
$48,713. Sale Price $29,995. 
Save $18,718. Petoskey RV 
USA. 2215 US 31 North, 
Petoskey. 231-347-3200. www.
PetoskeyRVUSA.com. PLUS, 
Save an additional $250 when 
you let us know you saw the ad 
in the Weekly Choice.

2024 Cherokee Wolf Pup 16 
FQW Travel Trailer. Outside mini 
kitchen, lightweight and easy 
to tow, power awning. MSRP 
$37,385. Sale Price $21,995. 
Save $15,390. Petoskey RV 
USA. 2215 US 31 North, 
Petoskey. 231-347-3200. www.
PetoskeyRVUSA.com. PLUS, 
Save an additional $250 when 
you let us know you saw the ad 
in the Weekly Choice.

2024 Cherokee Wolf Pup 
16EV Travel Trailer. All electric, 
sleeps 5, 2 bunks, On Demand 
Tankless Water Heater, backup 
camera, MSRP $23,954. Sale 
Price $13,995. Save $9,959. 
Petoskey RV USA. 2215 US 31 
North, Petoskey. 231-347-3200. 
www.PetoskeyRVUSA.com. 
PLUS, Save an additional $250 
when you let us know you saw 
the ad in the Weekly Choice.

2024 Jayco Eagle 312BHOK 
Travel Trailer. 3 Slideouts, 
bunkhouse sleeps 9, outdoor 
kitchen, fireplace. SALE PRICE 
$57,495. MSRP $91,435. 
SAVE $33,940. As low as $558 
a month. Northern Michigan 
RV. 277 Expressway Court, 
Gaylord. 989-448-8700. www.
NorthernMichiganRV.com. 
MON-SAT: 9AM - 5PM. Closed 
Sunday

2024 Jayco Jay Feather 
27BHB Travel Trailer. Slideout, 
bunkhouse sleeps 8, outdoor 
kitchen, 21’ power awning. 
SALE PRICE $36,995. MSRP 

$56,716. SAVE $19,721. As 
low as $359 a month. Northern 
Michigan RV. 277 Expressway 
Court, Gaylord. 989-448-8700. 
www.NorthernMichiganRV.com. 
MON-SAT: 9AM - 5PM. Closed 
Sunday

2024 Jayco Jay Flight 264BH 
Travel Trailer. Bunkhouse sleeps 
8, front bedroom, enclosed un-
derbelly. SALE PRICE $24,500. 
MSRP $37,726. SAVE $13,226. 
As low as $302 a month. 
Northern Michigan RV. 277 
Expressway Court, Gaylord. 
989-448-8700. www.Northern-
MichiganRV.com. MON-SAT: 
9AM - 5PM. Closed Sunday

2024 Jayco Seismic Luxu-
ry Series 4113 Fifth Wheel. 
Toyhauler, 2 Slideouts, sleeps 
9, 2 awnings, triple axle, 2 patio 
party decks, lots of room and 
a ton of features. SALE PRICE 
$116,295. MSRP $177,822. 
SAVE $61,527. As low as $999 
a month. Northern Michigan 
RV. 277 Expressway Court, 
Gaylord. 989-448-8700. www.
NorthernMichiganRV.com. 
MON-SAT: 9AM - 5PM. Closed 
Sunday

2024 Jayco White Hawk 26FK 
Travel Trailer. 2 Slideouts, front 
kitchen, full bath, dual entry 
doors, fireplace. SALE PRICE 
$42,995. MSRP $67,989. 
SAVE $24,994. As low as $417 
a month. Northern Michigan 
RV. 277 Expressway Court, 
Gaylord. 989-448-8700. www.
NorthernMichiganRV.com. 
MON-SAT: 9AM - 5PM. Closed 
Sunday

2024 Rockwood Geo Pro G20 
BHS. Slideout, bunkhouse 
sleeps 6, outside griddle under 
14’ power awning, exterior bike 
door, power tongue jack, easy 
to tow. MSRP $36,230. Sale 
Price $29,995. Save $6,235. 
Petoskey RV USA. 2215 US 31 
North, Petoskey. 231-347-3200. 
www.PetoskeyRVUSA.com. 
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CITY OF EAST JORDAN ANNUAL WATER REPORT
Notice Date June 2024

SAFE DRINKING WATER ACT
 The Safe Drinking Water Act requires all Public Water systems to issue an annual report 
to its customers telling them what substances and how much of each are in their water.
 We invite the public to call with any questions they might have about this report.
 We are pleased to report that our drinking water is safe and meets Federal and State 
requirements.
 This report shows how our water supply is kept safe and will provide you with our mon-
itoring information and testing results.
 We want our valued customers to be informed about their Water Utility and encourage 
any questions about this report.

QUALITY ON TAP
 We are very pleased to provide you with this year’s Quality on Tap Water Report. We 
want to keep you informed about the water and services we have delivered to you over 
the past year.
 Our goal is and always has been, to provide to you a safe and dependable supply of 
drinking water.
 In its effort to supply you with the safest possible product, the City of East Jordan 
chlorinates the water supply against potential contamination from viruses and bacteria. 
The level of this additive is monitored daily to ensure proper dosages are being added. 
Iron is an abundant and widespread constituent of rocks and soil in Northern Michigan. 
At sufficient concentrations, iron can adversely affect the taste of water and beverages 
and can leave rust-colored stains on laundry, plumbing fixtures and porcelain.
 Our water source is groundwater that is drawn from two different aquifers by three 
wells located in various parts of our City. The susceptibility of our wells ranges from 
moderately low to moderate.

MONITORING INFORMATION
 The City of East Jordan routinely monitors for contaminants in your drinking water 
according to Federal and State laws. The tables on the following pages show results of 
our monitoring for the period of January 1 st , 2023 to December 31st, 2023.
 Drinking water, including bottled water, may reasonably be expected to contain at least 
small amounts of some contaminants. The presence of contaminants does not necessar-
ily indicate that water poses a health risk. More information about contaminants and 
potential health effects can be obtained by calling the EPA’s Safe Drinking Water Hotline 
(800-426-4791).
 The sources of drinking water (both tap water and bottled water) include rivers, lakes, 
streams, ponds, reservoirs, springs and wells. As water travels over the surface of the land 
or through the ground, it dissolves naturally occurring minerals and, in some cases, radio-
active material and can pick up substances resulting from the presence of animals or from 
human activity.
Contaminants that may be present in source water:
 Microbial contaminants, such as viruses and bacteria, which may come from sewage 
treatment plants, septic systems, agricultural livestock operations, and wildlife.
 Inorganic contaminants, such as salts and metals, which can be naturally-occurring or 
result from urban storm water runoff, industrial, or domestic wastewater discharges, oil 
and gas production, mining or farming.
 Pesticides and herbicides, which may come from a variety of sources such as agricul-
ture, urban storm water runoff and residential uses.
 Organic chemical contaminants, including synthetic and volatile organic chemicals, 
which are by-products of industrial processes and petroleum production, and can also 
come from gas stations, urban storm water runoff and septic systems.
 Radioactive contaminants, which can be naturally occurring or be the result of oil and 
gas production and mining activities.
 In order to ensure that tap water is safe to drink, EPA prescribes regulations which 
limit the amount of certain contaminants in water provided by public water systems. FDA 
regulations establish limits for contaminants in bottled water which must provide the 
same protection for public health.

EXPLANATION OF RESULTS
 As you can see by the following tables, our system had no violations in 2023. We are 
proud that your drinking water meets or exceeds all Federal and State requirements. We 
have learned through our monitoring and testing that some contaminants have been 
detected. The E.P.A. has determined that your water is safe at these levels.

Water Quality Data
 The tables on the next page list all of the drinking water contaminants that we detected 
during the 2023 calendar year. The presence of these contaminants in the water does not 
necessarily indicate that the water poses a health risk. Unless otherwise noted, the data 
presented in these tables is from testing done January 1 st , 2023 through December 
31st, 2023. The State allows us to monitor for certain contaminants less than once per 
year because the concentrations of these contaminants are not expected to vary signifi-
cantly from year to year. All of the data is representative of the water quality, but some 
are more than one year old.

TERMS AND ABREVIATIONS
Maximum Contaminant Level Goal (MCLG): The level of a contaminant in drinking 

water below which there is no known or expected risk to health. MCLGs allow for a 
margin of safety.

Maximum Contaminant Level (MCL): The highest level of a contaminant that is al-
lowed in drinking water. MCLs are set as close to the MCLGs as feasible using the 
best available treatment technology.

Maximum Residual Disinfectant Level (MRDL): The highest level of a disinfectant al-
lowed in drinking water. There is convincing evidence that the addition of a disin-
fectant is necessary for control of microbial contaminants.

Maximum Residual Disinfectant Level Goal (MRDLG): The level of a drinking water 
disinfectant below which there is no known or expected risk to health. MRDLGs do 
not reflect the benefits of the use of disinfectants to control microbial contaminants.

N/A: Not Applicable
ND: Not Detectable at testing limit
ppb: parts per billion or micrograms per liter
ppm: parts per million or milligrams per liter
pCi/l: Picocuries per liter (a measure of radioactivity).
Action Level: The concentration of a contaminant which, if exceeded, triggers treat-

ment or other requirements that a water system must follow.

TOTAL COLIFORM RULE
 The Total Coliform Rule requires water systems to meet a stricter limit for Coliform 
bacteria.
 Coliform bacteria are usually harmless, but its presence in water can be an indication 
of disease-causing bacteria. When Coliform bacteria are found, special follow-up tests 
are done to determine if harmful bacteria are present in the water supply. If this limit is 
exceeded, the water supplier must notify the public by newspaper, television or radio. To 
comply with the stricter regulation, we monitor our system monthly taking samples from 
different locations in the distribution system.

  Microbial MCL MCLG Positive Violation Typical Source of
 Contaminants   Samples Yes/No Contaminants
 Total Coliform 1 Positive monthly 0 0 No Naturally present in
 Bacteria sample (5% of    the environment
   monthly samples
   positive)
Fecal Coliform Routine and Repeat 0 0 No Human and Animal
 and E. Coli samples are total    fecal waste
   coliform positive,
   and one is also fecal
   or E. Coli positive
2023 Running Annual Average of Free Chlorine in the Water Distribution System

MRDLG = 4.0 ppm
MCL = 4.0ppm

Annual Average: 0.29 ppm

Samples Collected in the Distribution System:
 Contaminants Action Level, Our Sample Number of Typical Source
 Subject to an MCL, or Water90th Date Samples of
 Action Level MRDL Percentile  Above AL Contaminants
   Value
 Lead (ppb)* AL = 15  6/8/2021-  Corrosion of 
 District 1  3 9/15/2021 0 household plumbing
 Industrial Drive  1  0 systems; Erosion of
      natural deposits

 Copper (ppm)* AL = 1.3  6/8/2021-  Corrosion of household
 District 1  0.2 9/15/2021 0 plumbing systems;
 Industrial Drive  0.9  1 Erosion of natural deposits
      Leaching from wood
      preservatives

 TotalTrihalomethanes MCL = 80 3.9 Total 8/23/2023 0 Disinfection
 (ppb)     byproduct

 Haloacetic MCL = 60 2.0 9/01/2023 0 Disinfection 
 Acids(ppb)     byproducts

Samples Collected at the Well House:
 Regulated MCL MCLG Our Water Sample Date Violation Typical Source of
 Contaminants     Yes/No Contaminants
 Fluoride (ppm)  4  4  Range: 5/26/2023 No Erosion of Natural
    0.32-1.60 6/19/2023  Deposits; Added
       for health benefits

Radioactive MCL MCLG Our Water Sample Date Violation Typical Source of
Contaminants     Yes/No Contaminants
 Alpha Emitters 15 0 0.75 -4.63 9/14/2021 No Erosion of Natural
 pCi/L      Deposits

Combined Radium 5 0 0 –1.40 9/14/2021 No Erosion of Natural
226/228 (pCi/L)      Deposits

Other  MCL MCLG Our Water Sample Date Violation Typical Source of
Contaminants     Yes/No Contaminants
Nitrate  10  0.27-0.99 5/26/2023 No Runoff from fertilizer
ppm     6/16/2023  use; Leaching from
       septic tanks, sewage; 
       Erosion of natural  
       deposits

Sodium   3.2-24.8 5/30/2023 No Erosion of natural 
ppm     6/20/2023  deposit or storm
       runoff

In Summary…………….
 MCL’s are set at very stringent levels. To understand the possible health effects de-
scribed for many regulated contaminants, a person would have to drink 2 liters of water 
every day at the MCL level for a lifetime to have a one-in-a-million chance of having the 
described health effect.
 In our continuing efforts to maintain a safe and dependable water supply it may be 
necessary to make improvements in your water system. The costs of these improve-
ments may be reflected in the rate structure. Rate adjustments may be necessary in or-
der to address these improvements.
 Some people may be more vulnerable to contaminants in drinking water than the gen-
eral population. Immuno-compromised persons such as persons with cancer undergo-
ing chemotherapy, persons who have undergone organ transplants, people with HIV/
AIDS or other immune system disorders, some elderly, and infants can be particularly at 
risk from infections.
 These people should seek advice about drinking water from their health care providers. 
EPA/CDC guidelines on appropriate means to lessen the risk of infection by cryptospo-
ridium and other microbiological contaminants are available from the Safe Drinking Wa-
ter Hotline (800-426-4791). Please call our office if you have questions.

Consumer Confidence Report (CCR) News
(Even if Lead is not detected….)

 “If present, elevated levels of lead can cause serious health problems, especially for 
pregnant women and young children. Lead in drinking water is primarily from materials 
and components associated with service lines and home plumbing. The City of East 
Jordan is responsible for providing high quality drinking water, but cannot control the 
variety of materials used in plumbing components. When your water has been sitting for 
several hours, you can minimize the potential for lead exposure by flushing your tap for 
30 seconds to 2 minutes before using water for drinking or cooking. If you are con-
cerned about lead in your water, you may wish to have your water tested. Information on 
lead in drinking water, testing methods, and steps you can take to minimize exposure is 
available from the Safe Drinking Water Hotline at 1-800-426-4791 or at www.water.epa.
gov/drink/info/lead.”

Lead and Service Lines
 The City of East Jordan is in the process of physically evaluating water service lines for 
the existence of lead and other materials that have been identified as potentially harmful. 
An ongoing inventory of these evaluations will be available at the East Jordan City Hall 
no later than October 16, 2024. These initial evaluations will amount to approximately 
20% of the total service lines with unknown materials. The city will continue evaluating 
and replacing service lines on an annual basis pursuant to the Michigan Department of 
Environment, Great Lakes and Energy (EGLE) requirements.

Copper
 “Copper is an essential nutrient, but some people who drink water containing copper 
in excess of the action level over a relatively short amount of time could experience 
gastrointestinal distress. Some people who drink water containing copper in excess of 
the action level over many years could suffer liver or kidney damage. People with Wil-
son’s Disease should consult their personal doctor.”

PFAS
 Per-and polyfluoroalkyl substances (PFAS) are a group of man-made chemicals that 
includes PFOA, PFOS, GenX, and many other chemicals. PFOA and PFOS have been the 
most extensively produced and studied of these chemicals. Both chemicals are very 
persistent in the environment and in the human body - meaning they don’t break down 
and they can accumulate over time. There is evidence that exposure to PFAS can lead to 
adverse human health effects.
 Studies indicate that PFOA and PFOS can cause reproductive and developmental, liver, 
and kidney, and immunological effects in laboratory animals. The most consistent find-
ings from human epidemiology studies are increased cholesterol levels among exposed 
populations, with more limited findings related to infant birth weights, effects on the 
immune system, cancer (for PFOA), and thyroid hormone disruption (for PFOS).
 In 2021, water samples were taken from each of the City’s municipal wells, and PFAS 
chemicals were NOT DETECTED in East Jordan. For more information on PFAS, please 
visit the EPA website: https://epa.gov/pfas/basic-information-pfas

FFEEAATTUURREE  WWRRIITTEERR
We have an immediate opening in this
area. We are adding a writer to our
staff of Northern Michigan’s popular
local newspaper. Nice extra income for
a few hours of work. You will need de-
pendable transportation and a digital
camera. Feature local people, events
and businesses. This is an independent
contractor position. 
E-mail Office@WeeklyChoice.com
or call Dave at 989-732-8160. 

SSPPOORRTTSS  PPHHOOTTOOGGRRAAPPHHEERR
We have an immediate open-
ing in this area. We are adding
a photographer to our staff of

Northern Michigan’s popular local news-
paper. Nice extra income for a few hours
of work. You will need dependable trans-
portation and an SLR digital camera. Fea-
ture local athletes and teams. This is an
independent contractor position. 
E-mail Office@WeeklyChoice.com
or call Dave at 989-732-8160. 

LOCALLY OWNED,
LOCALLY OPERATED

LOCAL NEWS, 
LOCAL SPORTS
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NOTICE OF PUBLIC HEARING
SOUTH ARM TOWNSHIP. CHARLEVOIX COUNTY

The South Arm Township Planning Commission will hold a 
public hearing on Tuesday, July 9, 2024 at 7:00 P.M. at the 
South Arm Township Hall located at 02811 S. M-66 Highway, 
East Jordan, Michigan 49727 for the purpose of substantiat-
ing the fact that Alice Haney received a Special Use Permit in 
the 90’s which allowed her to operate a boarding and groom-
ing business for dogs at 7552 Rogers Road which she did for 
many years. Even though she has no current intentions to 
re-open this business, she’s requesting that the Planning 
Commission acknowledges her previous Special Use Permit 
which by state law, runs with the land. Every effort was taken 
to locate her permit by Township officials to no avail. If you 
have any questions, comments or would like additional in-
formation regarding this request, you can contact John Fer-
guson in writing at 8354 Mercer Road, Charlevoix Michigan 
49720 or by phone at 231-459-8141.

CHARLEVOIX TOWNSHIP
BUDGET HEARING
June 26, 2024 at 3:00 p.m.

The Charlevoix Township Board will hold the 
Budget Hearing on June 26th, 2024, at 3:00 p.m. at 
the Charlevoix Township Hall at 12491 Waller Rd., 

Charlevoix.

At such time, the budgets estimated revenue and 
expenditures will be submitted for the July 1, 2024, 

through June 30th, 2025 fiscal year.

The property tax millage rate proposed to be 
levied to support the proposed budget will be a 

subject of this hearing.

A copy of the proposed budget will be available for 
review at the Clerk’s office at 12491 Waller Rd. on 

June 25th from 9:00 a.m. – noon.  
Please call ahead. 231-547-4611

Patricia Greensky
Charlevoix Township Clerk

ELLSWORTH COMMUNITY SCHOOL
NOTICE OF A PUBLIC HEARING

ON PROPOSED 2024-2025 BUDGET

PLEASE TAKE NOTICE that on June 26, 2024,  
at eight o’clock a.m., in the Ellsworth High School  
Library in Ellsworth, Michigan, the Board of  
Education of Ellsworth Community School District 
will hold a public hearing to consider the District’s  
proposed 2024-2025 budget.

The Board may not adopt its proposed 2024-2025 
budget until after a public hearing. A copy of the  
proposed 2024-2025 budget, including the proposed 
property tax millage rate, is available for public  
inspection during normal business hours at Ellsworth 
Community School, Ellsworth, Michigan.

The property tax millage rate proposed to be  
levied to support the proposed budget will be a 
subject of this hearing.

This notice is given by order of the Board of  
Education.

CHARLEVOIX COUNTY COMMISSIONERS
SYNOPSIS JUNE 12, 2024

The Charlevoix County Board of Commissioners met 
in the Charlevoix County Commissioners room on 
June 12, 2024, at 9:30 a.m. Six Commissioners were 
present.

Motion approved the agenda as amended.

Motion approved the consent agenda as presented.

Motion approved Resolution #24-066, County Expen-
ditures.

Motion approved cancellation of the June 26, 2024 
Board of Commissioners meeting, due to a lack of a 
quorum.

Motion approved the Committee of the Whole meeting 
on July 10, 2024 at 11:00 a.m. to discuss budgets.

Motion approved Resolution #24-067, Commission 
on Aging Senior Center Dining Room Addition Award 
Proposal.

Motion approved Resolution #24-068, Whiting Park 
Electrical Upgrades.

Motion approved Resolution #24-069, Whiting Park 
Camp Fire Rings Purchase.

Motion approved Resolution #24-070, Charlevoix 
County District Court Carpet Purchase. 5.1. Nays: 
Commissioner Christensen.

Motion approved Resolution #24-071, Materials 
Management Plan Designated Planning Agency. 5.1. 
Nays: Commissioner Hankins.

Motion approved Resolution #24-072, Charlevoix 
County Materials Management Plan.

Motion approved Resolution #24-073, Employee 
Handbook Amendment. 4.2. Nays: Commissioner 
Christensen and Commissioner Kenney.

Motion approved Resolution #24-074, Beaver Island 
Substation Concrete Replacement.

The meeting was adjourned to the call of the Chair at 
10:16 a.m.

Complete copies of Board minutes can be found on 
the County website, www.charlevoixcounty.org.

Julia A. Drost, County Clerk

RECREATIONAL 
VEHICLES
New 2022 Cherokee Wolf Pack 
27 Pack 10 Toyhauler Travel 
Trailer. Garage, party patio, 
slideout, 2 bunks, sleeps 8, fire-
place, outside kitchen. MSRP 
$75,681. Sale Price $39,995. 
As low as $319 a month. 
Petoskey RV USA. 2215 US 31 
North, Petoskey. 231-347-3200. 
www.PetoskeyRVUSA.com. 
PLUS, Save an additional $250 
when you let us know you saw 
the ad in the Weekly Choice.

New 2022 Forest River RV XLR 
Nitro 351 Fifth Wheel. Toy-
hauler, 3 Slideouts, sleeps 9, 
dual entry doors, fireplace, loft. 
SALE PRICE $77,995. MSRP 
$119,676. SAVE $41,681. As 
low as $670 a month. Northern 
Michigan RV. 277 Expressway 
Court, Gaylord. 989-448-8700. 
www.NorthernMichiganRV.com. 
MON-SAT: 9AM - 5PM. Closed 
Sunday

New 2023 Coachmen RV Cata-
lina Summit Series 7 164RB 
Travel Trailer. Easy to tow, 
power awning, large pass thru 
storage. SALE PRICE $17,995. 
MSRP $26,980. SAVE $8,985. 
As low as $186 a month. 
Northern Michigan RV. 277 
Expressway Court, Gaylord. 
989-448-8700. www.Northern-
MichiganRV.com

New 2023 Coachmen RV 
Chaparral Lite 25RE Fifth 
Wheel. Slideout, entertainment 
center, outside shower, auto 
leveling, Roof Mounted Solar 
Panel. SALE PRICE $39,995. 
MSRP $67,193. SAVE $27,198. 
As low as $389 a month. 
Northern Michigan RV. 277 
Expressway Court, Gaylord. 
989-448-8700. www.Northern-
MichiganRV.com. MON-SAT: 
9AM - 5PM. Closed Sunday

New 2023 EAST TO WEST 
Alta 3150KBH Travel Trailer. 2 
Slideouts, bunkhouse sleeps 
8, outdoor kitchen, fireplace, 
walk-in pantry. SALE PRICE 
$42,995. MSRP $65,330. 
SAVE $22,335. As low as $418 
a month. Northern Michigan 
RV. 277 Expressway Court, 
Gaylord. 989-448-8700. www.
NorthernMichiganRV.com. 

New 2023 East to West Della 
Terra 170 BHLF Travel Trailer. 
Bunkhouse sleeps 8, power 
awning with LED lights. MSRP 
$26,207. Sale Price $17,995. 
Save $8,212. As low as $179 
a month. Petoskey RV USA. 
2215 US 31 North, Petoskey. 
231-347-3200. www.Petoskey-
RVUSA.com. PLUS, Save an 
additional $250 when you let us 
know you saw the ad.

NEW 2023 East to West Della 
Terra 180MB Travel Trailer. ½ 
ton towable, slideout, outdoor 
kitchen, MSRP $44,437. Sale 
Price $26,995. Save $17,442.  
Petoskey RV USA. 2215 US 31 
North, Petoskey. 231-347-3200. 
www.PetoskeyRVUSA.com. 
PLUS, Save an additional $250 
when you let us know you saw 
the ad in the Weekly Choice.

NEW 2023 Forest River RV 
Rockwood Ultra Lite 2906BS 
Travel Trailer. 3 slideouts, 
sleeps 5, rear living area, 
kitchen island, fireplace, 
seats 9 people, two 11’ power 
awnings. MSRP $96,338. Sale 
Price $51,995. Save $17,341.  
Petoskey RV USA. 2215 US 31 
North, Petoskey. 231-347-3200. 
www.PetoskeyRVUSA.com. 
PLUS, Save an additional $250 
when you let us know you saw 
the ad in the Weekly Choice.

New 2023 Forest River RV 
XLR Hyper Lite 2513 Travel 
Trailer. Toyhauler, slideout, 
electric bunk, insulated floor. 
SALE PRICE $53,995. MSRP 
$78,264. SAVE $24,269. As 
low as $464 a month. Northern 
Michigan RV. 277 Expressway 
Court, Gaylord. 989-448-8700. 
www.NorthernMichiganRV.com. 
MON-SAT: 9AM - 5PM. 

New 2023 Keystone RV Arcadia 
3550MB Fifth Wheel. 4 Slide-
outs, kitchen island, outdoor 
kitchen, tankless water heater, 
SALE PRICE $64,895. MSRP 
$96,382. SAVE $31,487. As 
low as $559 a month. Northern 
Michigan RV. 277 Expressway 
Court, Gaylord. 989-448-8700. 
www.NorthernMichiganRV.com. 
MON-SAT: 9AM - 5PM. Closed 
Sunday

New 2023 Keystone RV Ava-
lanche 360FL Fifth Wheel. 5 
Slideouts, sleeps 6, fireplace, 
Polar Pack All Season Protec-
tion. SALE PRICE $79,995. 
MSRP $114,175. SAVE 
$34,180. As low as $693 a 
month. Northern Michigan RV. 
277 Expressway Court, Gaylord. 
989-448-8700. www.Northern-
MichiganRV.com. MON-SAT: 
9AM - 5PM. Closed Sunday

New 2023 Keystone RV Pass-
port SL 221BH Travel Trailer. 
Slideout, bunkhouse sleeps 7, 
outdoor kitchen, power tongue 
jack. SALE PRICE $31,995. 
MSRP $45,639. SAVE $14,644. 
As low as $311 a month. 
Northern Michigan RV. 277 
Expressway Court, Gaylord. 
989-448-8700. www.Northern-
MichiganRV.com. MON-SAT: 
9AM - 5PM. Closed Sunday

Used 2012 Puma RLSS Travel 
Trailer. Slideout, power jack, 
sleeps 6. Regular $9,995. Sale 
Price $8,995. Save $1,000. As 
low as $179 a month. Petoskey 
RV USA. 2215 US 31 North, 
Petoskey. 231-347-3200. www.
PetoskeyRVUSA.com. PLUS, 
Save an additional $250 when 
you let us know you saw the ad 
in the Weekly Choice.

Used 2013 Keystone RV Bullet 
204RBS Travel Trailer. Rear 
Corner Bath Including: Angle 
Shower, Rear Pantry/Wardrobe, 
Refrig, 3 Burner Range, Booth 
Dinette w/Overhead storage 
and much more. Regular Price 
$13,995. Sale Price $11,995. 
Save $2,000. Petoskey RV 
USA. 2215 US 31 North, 
Petoskey. 231-347-3200. www.
PetoskeyRVUSA.com. PLUS, 
Save an additional $250 when 
you let us know you saw the ad 
in the Weekly Choice.

Used 2016 Rockwood Mini Lite 
2304 KS Travel Trailer. Slideout, 
air. Regular Price $14,995. Sale 
Price $12,995. Save $2,000.  
Petoskey RV USA. 2215 US 31 
North, Petoskey. 231-347-3200. 
www.PetoskeyRVUSA.com. 
PLUS, Save an additional $250 
when you let us know you saw 
the ad in the Weekly Choice.

Used 2016 Rockwood Mini Lite 
2304 KS Travel Trailer. Slideout, 
air. Regular Price $14,995. Sale 
Price $12,995. Save $2,000.  
Petoskey RV USA. 2215 US 31 
North, Petoskey. 231-347-3200. 
www.PetoskeyRVUSA.com. 
PLUS, Save an additional $250 
when you let us know you saw 
the ad in the Weekly Choice.

Used 2017 Winnebago Navion 
24G Class C Motorhome. Slide-
out, sleeps 6, generator, sat-
ellite, 2 TV’s, 3.0L  V-6, 20,500 
miles, rear hitch, Inverter with 
solar panel, much more. Reg-
ular $119,995. Save $34,000. 
Sale Price $85,995. Petoskey 
RV USA. 2215 US 31 North, 
Petoskey. 231-347-3200. www.
PetoskeyRVUSA.com. PLUS, 
Save an additional $250 when 
you let us know you saw the ad 
in the Weekly Choice.

Used 2019 Cherokee Arctic 
Wolf 305 ML 6 Fifth Wheel. 3 
slideouts, large pantry, oppos-
ing slides for very large living 
space, automatic leveling, can 
be towed by light duty truck. 
Regular $31,995. Sale Price 
$28,995. Save $3,000. As low 
as $259 a month. Petoskey 
RV USA. 2215 US 31 North, 
Petoskey. 231-347-3200. www.
PetoskeyRVUSA.com. PLUS, 
Save an additional $250 when 
you let us know you saw the ad 
in the Weekly Choice.

Used 2019 Flagstaff E-Pro 14 
FK Travel Trailer. Compact & 
easy to tow. Perfect for a cou-
ple. Cook indoors or on the Out-
door gas grill, wet bath, WiFi 
Booster Regular $18,714, Sale 
Price $13,995. Save $4,719. 
Petoskey RV USA. 2215 US 31 
North, Petoskey. 231-347-3200. 
www.PetoskeyRVUSA.com. 
PLUS, Save an additional $250 
when you let us know you saw 
the ad in the Weekly Choice.

Used 2021 Apex Nano 15X 
Travel Trailer. 2 queen tent bed, 
sleeps 6, great shape. Regular 
$24,771. Sale Price $19,995. 
Save $4,776. As low as $229 
a month. Petoskey RV USA. 
2215 US 31 North, Petoskey. 
231-347-3200. www.Petoskey-
RVUSA.com. PLUS, Save an 
additional $250 when you let 
us know you saw the ad in the 
Weekly Choice.

USED 2021 Coachmen 
Apex Nano 15x Travel Trailer 
Expandable. Queen beds fold 
out at each tent end, sleep 
6, Regular $24,771. Sale 
Price $19,995. Save $4,776. 
Petoskey RV USA. 2215 US 
31 North, Petoskey. 231-347-
3200. www.PetoskeyRVUSA.
com. PLUS, Save an additional 
$250 when you let us know 
you saw the ad in the Weekly 
Choice.

Used 2021 Forest River RV 
Flagstaff Micro Lite 25BRDS 
Travel Trailer. Slideout, 
bunkhouse sleeps 8, outdoor 
kitchen, tow with your SUV 
or Minivan. OUR PRICE 
$24,995. LIST PRICE $28,995. 
DISCOUNT $4,000. As low 
as $273 a month. Northern 
Michigan RV. 277 Expressway 
Court, Gaylord. 989-448-8700. 
www.NorthernMichiganRV.com. 
MON-SAT: 9AM - 5PM. Closed 
Sunday

Used 2022 Coachmen RV 
Freedom Express Liberty Edi-
tion 320BHDSLE Travel Trailer. 
3 slideouts, bunkhouse sleeps 
8, outdoor kitchen, kitchen 
island, fireplace. OUR PRICE 
$37,995. LIST PRICE $42,995. 
DISCOUNT $5,000. As low 
as $369 a month. Northern 
Michigan RV. 277 Expressway 
Court, Gaylord. 989-448-8700. 
www.NorthernMichiganRV.com. 
MON-SAT: 9AM - 5PM. Closed 
Sunday

Used 2022 Forest River RV 
Sabre 37FLL Fifth Wheel. This 
is fabulous! 4 Slideouts, sleeps 
8, electric auto leveling system, 
universal docking system, 
fireplace, outside kitchen & 
shower, large loft. Regular price 
$79,990. Sale Price $69,990. 
Save $10,000. Petoskey RV 
USA. 2215 US 31 North, 
Petoskey. 231-347-3200. www.
PetoskeyRVUSA.com. PLUS, 
Save an additional $250 when 
you let us know you saw the ad 
in the Weekly Choice.

Used 2022 Keystone RV 
Outback 340BH Travel Trailer. 
3 Slideouts, bunkhouse sleeps 
10, outdoor kitchen, kitchen 
island, barn slider door, 20’ 
awning, pass thru storage, 
power tongue jack. OUR PRICE 
$39,995. LIST PRICE $44,995. 
DISCOUNT $5,000. As low 
as $388 a month. Northern 
Michigan RV. 277 Expressway 
Court, Gaylord. 989-448-8700. 
www.NorthernMichiganRV.com. 
MON-SAT: 9AM - 5PM. Closed 
Sunday

SERVICES
Allen’s Handyman Services. 
Painting, drywall, repair, 
outdoor maintenance. Call 231-
330-8535. Cheboygan area.

ROGERS HANDYMAN SER-
VICE Quality work, reasonable 
rates. Small remodel, painting, 
flooring, etc. 989-619-3746

STORAGE
APS Mini-Warehouse of Gay-
lord has 5x10 units for just $39 
a month. No long term contract 
necessary. In town, safe 
storage. Larger units may also 
available. Call 989-732-8160.

SUV
2014 JEEP GRAND CHERO-
KEE 4WD. Remote Start, Rear 
Heated Seats, Pwr. Liftgate. 
SALE PRICE $10,995. FI-
NANCE FOR 60 MOS. at $218 
MONTH. Jim Wernig Chevrolet, 
2401 Old 27 South, Gaylord. 
989-732-5161, www.JimWer-
nigChevrolet.com

2015 Chevy Equinox LT. Rear 
camera, 115 K miles. Byrider - 
2215 US Hwy 31 N, Petoskey. 
Call Zeke Eberly, 231-347-
3200. Buy. Finance. Drive On, 
PLUS, get an additional $50 
Gas Card when any vehicle 
purchase when you let us know 
you saw the ad.

2015 Chevy Equinox. 115 K 
miles. Buy Here, Pay Here. 
Byrider - 2215 US Hwy 31 N, 
Petoskey. Call Zeke Eberly, 
231-347-3200. Buy. Finance. 
Drive On, PLUS, get an addi-
tional $50 Gas Card when any 
vehicle purchase when you let 
us know you saw the ad in the 
Weekly Choice.

2015 Ford Escape SEL. 
Ecoboost, tow pkg, leather, 
71 K miles. Byrider - 2215 US 
Hwy 31 N, Petoskey. Call Zeke 
Eberly, 231-347-3200. Buy. Fi-
nance. Drive On, PLUS, get an 
additional $50 Gas Card when 
any vehicle purchase when you 
let us know you saw the ad in 
the Weekly Choice.

2016 CHEVROLET TRAVERSE 
1LT. AWD, 3rd Row Seat. SALE 
PRICE $15,995. FINANCE 
FOR 60 MOS. at $317 MONTH. 
Jim Wernig Chevrolet, 2401 Old 
27 South, Gaylord. 989-732-
5161, www.JimWernigChevro-
let.com

2017 Hyundai Elantra. Rear 
camera, 120 K miles – 2 to 
choose from. Byrider - 2215 US 
Hwy 31 N, Petoskey. Call Zeke 
Eberly, 231-347-3200. Buy. Fi-
nance. Drive On, PLUS, get an 
additional $50 Gas Card when 
any vehicle purchase when you 
let us know you saw the ad in 
the Weekly Choice.

2017 Kia Sorento LX. AWD, 8 
passenger, rear camera. 129 
K miles. Byrider - 2215 US 
Hwy 31 N, Petoskey. Call Zeke 
Eberly, 231-347-3200. Buy. Fi-
nance. Drive On, PLUS, get an 
additional $50 Gas Card when 
any vehicle purchase when you 
let us know you saw the ad in 
the Weekly Choice.

2020 Ford Escape Titanium. 
AWD, leather, rear camera, 
77 K miles. $22,995. As low 
as $432 a month. Byrider - 
NorthFin Automotive . 2215 US 
Hwy 31 N, Petoskey. Call Zeke 
Eberly, 231-347-3200. Buy. Fi-
nance. Drive On, PLUS, get an 
additional $50 Gas Card when 
any vehicle purchase when you 
let us know you saw the ad in 
the Weekly Choice.

2021 Subaru Forester. AWD, 
rear camera, moon roof, 36 K 
miles. $24,995. As low as $469 
a month. North Fin Automotive 
located at Byrider - 2215 US 
Hwy 31 N, Petoskey. Call Zeke 
Eberly, 231-347-3200. Buy. Fi-
nance. Drive On, PLUS, get an 
additional $50 Gas Card when 

any vehicle purchase when you 
let us know you saw the ad in 
the Weekly Choice.

2021 Volkswagen Tiguan. 
$21,075. As low as $449 a 
month. Byrider - NorthFin 
Automotive . 2215 US Hwy 31 
N, Petoskey. Call Zeke Eberly, 
231-347-3200. Buy. Finance. 
Drive On, PLUS, get an addi-
tional $50 Gas Card when any 
vehicle purchase when you let 
us know you saw the ad in the 
Weekly Choice.

2022 FORD ESCAPE SE AWD. 
HEATED STEERING WHEEL, 
LOW MILES, REMOTE START. 
SALE $25,498. FINANCE FOR 
72 MOS. As low as $469 MO. 
Jim Wernig GMC. 2086 South. 
Gaylord. 989-448-4757. www.
WernigGMC.com

Are you tired of driving a 
vehicle that breaks down all 
the time. Get a LOW MILEAGE 
automobile at Byrider. 2215 US 
Hwy 31 N, Petoskey. Call Zeke 
Eberly, 231-347-3200. Buy. Fi-
nance. Drive On, PLUS, get an 
additional $50 Gas Card when 
any vehicle purchase when you 
let us know you saw the ad in 
the Weekly Choice.

CERTIFIED PRE-OWNED. 
2019 CHEVROLET BLAZ-
ER AWD. PWR. LIFTGATE, 
HEATED FRONT SEATS. 
SALE $23,912. FINANCE FOR 
60 MOS. As low as $503 MO. 
Jim Wernig GMC. 2086 South. 
Gaylord. 989-448-4757. www.
WernigGMC.com

CERTIFIED PRE-OWNED. 
2020 CHEVROLET TRAVERSE 
1LT. AW, 3rd Row Seat, Heated 
Front Seats. SALE PRICE 
$26,995. FINANCE FOR 72 
MOS. at $467 MONTH. Jim 
Wernig Chevrolet, 2401 Old 27 
South, Gaylord. 989-732-5161, 
www.JimWernigChevrolet.com

CERTIFIED PRE-OWNED. 
2021 BUICK ENCORE GX. 
1.3L TURBO, AUTOMATIC, 
AWD. SALE $20,836. FINANCE 
FOR 60 MOS. As low as $434 
MO. Jim Wernig GMC. 2086 
South. Gaylord. 989-448-4757. 
www.WernigGMC.com

CERTIFIED PRE-OWNED. 
2021 CHEVROLET TRAIL-
BLAZER LS. All Wheel Drive, 
27K Miles. SALE PRICE 
$21,995. FINANCE FOR 72 
MOS. at $381 MONTH. Jim 
Wernig Chevrolet, 2401 Old 27 
South, Gaylord. 989-732-5161, 
www.JimWernigChevrolet.com

CERTIFIED PRE-OWNED. 
2021 CHEVROLET TRAIL-
BLAZER LT. 1-Owner, Heated 
Front Seats. SALE PRICE 
$21,995. FINANCE FOR 72 
MOS. at $436 MONTH. Jim 
Wernig Chevrolet, 2401 Old 27 
South, Gaylord. 989-732-5161, 
www.JimWernigChevrolet.com

CERTIFIED PRE-OWNED. 
2022 BUICK ENVISION 
PREFERRED. 2.0L TURBO, 
AUTOMATIC. SALE $29,351. 

FINANCE FOR 72 MOS. As low 
as $539 MO. Jim Wernig GMC. 
2086 South. Gaylord. 989-448-
4757. www.WernigGMC.com

CERTIFIED PRE-OWNED. 
2022 CHEVROLET BLAZER 
LT W/2LT. 1 OWNER, HEATED 
FRONT SEATS, LOW MILES. 
SALE $29,886. FINANCE FOR 
72 MOS. As low as $549 MO. 
Jim Wernig GMC. 2086 South. 
Gaylord. 989-448-4757. www.
WernigGMC.com

CERTIFIED PRE-OWNED. 
2022 CHEVROLET BLAZER 
PREMIERE. 1 OWNER, AWD, 
BOSE AUDIO. SALE $36,529. 
FINANCE FOR 72 MOS. As low 
as $672 MO. Jim Wernig GMC. 
2086 South. Gaylord. 989-448-
4757. www.WernigGMC.com

CERTIFIED PRE-OWNED. 
2023 CHEVY SUBURBAN 
PREMIER. 4WD, HEATED 
& COOLED LEATHER, 7 
PASSENGER. SALE $65,253. 
FINANCE FOR 84 MOS. As 
low as $1081 MO. Jim Wernig 
GMC. 2086 South. Gaylord. 
989-448-4757. www.WernigG-
MC.com

CERTIFIED PRE-OWNED. 
2023 GMC ACADIA AT4 AWD. 
1 OWNER, BOSE AUDIO, 
SUNROOF. SALE $39,656. 
FINANCE FOR 84 MOS. As low 
as $657 MO. Jim Wernig GMC. 
2086 South. Gaylord. 989-448-
4757. www.WernigGMC.com

Just Arrived! 2019 Chevy Equi-
nox Premier. AWD, 48 K miles, 
leather. Very Nice. Byrider - 
NorthFin Automotive . 2215 US 
Hwy 31 N, Petoskey. Call Zeke 
Eberly, 231-347-3200. Buy. Fi-
nance. Drive On, PLUS, get an 
additional $50 Gas Card when 
any vehicle purchase when you 
let us know you saw the ad in 
the Weekly Choice.

Just Arrived! 2022 Buick Envi-
sion ST. Panoramic moon roof, 
49 K miles. Byrider - NorthFin 
Automotive . 2215 US Hwy 31 
N, Petoskey. Call Zeke Eberly, 
231-347-3200. Buy. Finance. 
Drive On, PLUS, get an addi-
tional $50 Gas Card when any 
vehicle purchase when you let 
us know you saw the ad in the 
Weekly Choice.

TRAILERS
CARGO TRAILERS. Starting 
as low as $3,095. Only $69 
a month. Petoskey RV USA. 
2215 US 31 North, Petoskey. 
231-347-3200. www.Petoskey-
RVUSA.com. 

DUMP TRAILERS. Starting 
as low as $3,995. Only $79 
a month. Petoskey RV USA. 
2215 US 31 North, Petoskey. 
231-347-3200. www.Petoskey-
RVUSA.com. 

UTILITY TRAILERS. Starting 
as low as $2,995. Only $69 
a month. Petoskey RV USA. 
2215 US 31 North, Petoskey. 
231-347-3200. www.Petoskey-
RVUSA.com. 
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* WITH APPROVED CREDIT.   PAYMENTS ARE PLUS TAX, TITLE,  LICENSE AND DEALER FEES.  SEE DEALER FOR COMPLETE DETAILS.

2086 S OTSEGO AVE GAYLORD, MI  989.448.4757              WWW.WERNIGGMC.COM

2022 GMC SIERRA 3500HD 4X4 PRO #B2162A
1 OWNER, CERTIFIED, NEW REAR BRAKES

2020 BUICK ENCLAVE PREFERRED #B2147A
FWD, BLUETOOTH, HEATED FRONT SEAT

2022 GMC SIERRA 1500 SHORT BOX SLT #B2030
CREW CAB, 4WD, 1-OWNER, 27K MI.

CERTIFIED PRE-OWNED

CERTIFIED PRE-OWNED

2019 CHEVROLET BLAZER AWD #B2100
PWR. LIFTGATE, HEATED FRONT SEATS

2023 GMC ACADIA AT4 AWD #B2115A
1 OWNER, BOSE AUDIO, SUNROOF

2019 CHEVY SILVERADO 1500 SHORT BOX #B1983
CREW CAB, 4WD, 1-OWNER, NEW BRAKES, REMOTE START

2023 CHEVY SUBURBAN PREMIER #B1987
4WD, HEATED & COOLED LEATHER, 7 PASSENGER

CERTIFIED PRE-OWNEDCERTIFIED PRE-OWNED

CERTIFIED PRE-OWNED

CERTIFIED PRE-OWNED

2014 GMC SIERRA 1500 SLT CREW CAB #B2221A
TONNEAU COVER, BOSE AUDIO, HEATED FRONT SEATS

2017 FORD F-350 SUPER DUTY SRW #B2197A
1-OWNER, POWER SUNROOF, LEATHER

2022 CHEVROLET BLAZER PREMIERE #B1852A
1 OWNER, AWD, BOSE AUDIO

CERTIFIED PRE-OWNED

2022 BUICK ENVISION PREFERRED #B2157
2.0L TURBO, AUTOMATIC

CERTIFIED PRE-OWNED

SALE PRICE
$27,576*

FINANCE FOR 84 MOS. @ $411 /MO.

2019 FORD F150 XL SUPERCREW #B2180A
1-OWNER, HANDSFREE BLUETOOTH, RUNNING BOARDS

SALE PRICE
$28,994*

FINANCE FOR 60 MOS. @ $568 /MO.

SALE PRICE
$22,494*

FINANCE FOR 72 MOS. @ $379 /MO.

SALE PRICE
$19,995*

FINANCE FOR 60 MOS. @ $329 /MO.

SALE PRICE
$38,404*

FINANCE FOR 84 MOS. @ $572 /MO.

2019 CHEVY SILVERADO 2500HD #B2236A
1 OWNER, BOSE AUDIO, LEATHER

CERTIFIED PRE-OWNED

SALE PRICE
$50,564*

FINANCE FOR 60 MOS. @ $992 /MO.

2021 GMC SIERRA 1500 SLT #B2196A
1-OWNER, RUNNING BOARDS, HEATED FRONT SEATS

SALE PRICE
$37,939*

FINANCE FOR 60 MOS. @ $744 /MO.

2020 GMC SIERRA 1500 SLT #B2181A
1 OWNER, NEW TIRES, CREW CAB

SALE PRICE
$35,899*

FINANCE FOR 60 MOS. @ $704 /MO.

2024 CHEVROLET TRAX LT #B2053B
1 OWNER, HEATED STEERING WHEEL, HEATED FRONT SEATS

SALE PRICE
$23,682*

FINANCE FOR 84 MOS. @ $353 /MO.

2014 FORD F150 SUPERCAB XL #B2219A
4WD, 6 1/2 FOOT BOX

SALE PRICE
$17,495*

FINANCE FOR 60 MOS. @ $343 /MO.

2012 CHEVY SILVERADO 1500 LT #B2149A
EXTENDED CAB, BLUETOOTH, AUX

SALE PRICE
$12,389*

FINANCE FOR 60 MOS. @ $243 /MO.

2010 DODGE RAM 1500 QUAD CAB #B2226B
NEW TIRES, LEATHER, HEATED FRONT SEATS

SALE PRICE
$8,495*

FINANCE FOR 60 MOS. @ $167 /MO.

SALE PRICE
$28,130*

FINANCE FOR 72 MOS. @ $474 /MO.

SALE PRICE
$60,899*

FINANCE FOR 84 MOS. @ $906 /MO.

SALE PRICE
$47,994*

FINANCE FOR 72 MOS. @ $809 /MO.

2022 GMC SIERA 1500 LIMITED #B2041
REGULAR CAB, LONG BOX, VINYL FLOORS

CERTIFIED PRE-OWNED

SALE PRICE
$31,963*

FINANCE FOR 84 MOS. @ $475 /MO.

SALE PRICE
$42,422*

FINANCE FOR 72 MOS. @ $715 /MO.

2022 CHEVROLET BLAZER LT W/2LT #B2111A
1 OWNER, HEATED FRONT SEATS, LOW MILES

CERTIFIED PRE-OWNED

SALE PRICE
$29,106*
FINANCE FOR 84 MOS. @ $571

SALE PRICE
$34,994*

FINANCE FOR 84 MOS. @ $521 /MO.

SALE PRICE
$49,930*

FINANCE FOR 60 MOS. @ $921 /MO.

SALE PRICE
$21,371*

FINANCE FOR 60 MOS. @ $419 /MO.

2017 CHEVY SILVERADO 1500 LT Z71 #B2215A
4WD, HEATED FRONT SEAT, BLUETOOTH

SALE PRICE
$22,549*

FINANCE FOR 60 MOS. @ $442 /MO.

2015 RAM 1500 LARAMIE LONGHORN #B2067B
CREW CAB, 4WD, 1-OWNER, PWR. SUNROOF.

SALE PRICE
$18,306*

FINANCE FOR 60 MOS. @ $359 /MO.

2021 GMC SIERRA 1500 DENALI #B2186A
6,2L V8, 4X4, CREW CAB, SHORT BOX

CERTIFIED PRE-OWNED

SALE PRICE
$48,843*

FFIINNAANNCCEE  FFOORR  6600  MMOOSS..  @@  $$995599  //mmoo..

2023 GMC SIERRA 1500 ELEVATION 3SB #B2026A
CREW CAB, SHORT BOX, 4X4

CERTIFIED PRE-OWNED

SALE PRICE
$50,452*

FINANCE FOR 84 MOS. @ $752 /MO.

Jim Wernig GMC is celebrating the start of summer
with red hot prices on our entire used inventory!
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	 If you’re shopping for a home 
and can afford to buy one, you 
couldn’t be in a better position right 
now. In many parts of the country, 
housing inventory is high and both 
home prices and interest rates are 
low and as a buyer, you can take 
advantage of that.
	 With so many properties on the 
market, you can probably take a 
more leisurely approach to house 
hunting without getting into a fast-
paced bidding war. There is a caveat, 
however. The best homes priced 
properly for the market conditions 
will always be in higher demand.
	 As you begin your search for the 
right home for you, it pays to keep 
in mind things you need to check 
carefully so that they don’t cost you 
big bucks in the long run.
Kitchen
	 If kitchens matter to you, you 
might want to be fairly selective 
about them when looking for a new 
home. The average price for a minor 
kitchen remodel for a midrange 
home is more than $21,000 and the 
cost for a major remodel is more 
than $57,000 and the costs are 
substantially more for higher-end 
homes.
	 Look carefully at the appliances, 
cabinetry, counters and floor. Those 
are the elements that cost more 
to replace. If possible, you want 
newer appliances to save money on 
repairs and energy costs; solid-wood 
cabinets; and solid-surface counters, 
such as granite, stainless steel, 
butcher block or engineered stone. 
Your floor choices include wood, 
cork, laminates and tile and it’s a 
matter of what’s comfortable and 
durable for your lifestyle.
Bathrooms
	 Following kitchens, bathrooms 
are also expensive rooms to remodel 
at a national average of more than 
$16,000 because of the fixtures 
and plumbing. Make sure you see 
no leaks or evidence of leaks in 
tubs, toilets and flooring. Sharing 
bathrooms can be one of those pain 
points for families so make sure you 
get what you need.

Roof
	 A roof is a big-ticket item 
with an average replacement cost 
of more than $19,000 although 
adding a second layer to a roof is 
not nearly as expensive as replacing 
the entire thing. Inside the house, 
you can check the attic, ceilings and 
skylights for signs of water damage, 
look for places where the roof deck 
is sagging, and see if you can detect 
any light coming through. If you do 
see light coming through, it is likely 
not a problem if the roof is made of 
shake shingles. Outside, inspect for 
cracked, ripped, curling or missing 
shingles and damaged flashing.  Also 
look for rotting, buckling, blistering 
or algae growth, which could also be 
signs of trouble.
HVAC
	 An old heater can be hard to 
repair and eats up energy at a pace 
faster than newer units. Furnaces can 
start at about $5,000 to replace and if 
you buy a combined unit with the air 
conditioner, add on several thousand 
dollars. You may need to replace the 
heat pump or air conditioner if it’s 
older than 10 years and a furnace or 
boiler if it’s more than 15 years old.
Basement
	 The extra room you gain may 
be a huge headache if the basement 
floods. Look for water marks and 
find out if the house has a system for 
removing water.

	 Other areas of concern that 
might cost money down the line 
are the driveways and sidewalks, 
chimneys, insulation and windows.
	 If you find a house and your 
offer is accepted, you’ll be dealing 
with a home inspector who can fill 
in the gaps with a professional’s 
eye. The thing is, if you really want 
the home, you don’t have to let 
problems deter you. You are in po-
sition to negotiate a price reduction 
with the seller or insist repairs be 
made to the property before your 
offer is finalized.
	 If you can afford a house, you 
can afford the luxury of taking your 
time to find the right one for you.

What You Should Look for 
When House Hunting

R E A L  E S T A T E  C O R N E R

BROUGHT TO YOU BY 
HOLLY STARK 

EXP REAL ESTATE

BY JIM AKANS

	 This week’s feature 
listing is a spacious, quali-
ty-built home on a beautiful 
setting just south of East 
Jordan.
	 This four bedroom, two 
bath home offers approxi-
mately 2,000 square feet of 
superbly designed and fin-
ished space on the main two 
levels plus a full basement. 
Interior highlights include 
an open concept living, 
dining and kitchen area 
with elegant wood flooring, 
gorgeous kitchen cabinetry 
with tons of storage space 
and access to the back deck 
off the dining area. The full 

basement has a dedicated 
hobby room/workshop and 
provides even more storage 
space. There is also an at-
tached garage on the home.
	 The large, open deck on 
the back of the home offers 
sweeping views of the 
yard. There is even a peek 
at Lake Charlevoix in the 
distance from the property. 
While the setting is pure 
northern countryside, the 
abundant shopping, dining, 
entertainment, parks and 
more in downtown East 
Jordan is just a few miles 
away.
	 This spacious, quali-
ty-built home in a beautiful 
setting is located at 3835 

Centennial Drive near 
East Jordan and is listed at 
$389,900. 
	 For more information 
visit jenniferburrgroup.
com or to arrange a home 

tour, call Jennifer Burr, 
Realtor, at Coldwell Banker 
Schmidt in Boyne City, 
231-675-0157 or email 
jennifer.burr@cbgreatlakes.
com

SPACIOUS, QUALITY-BUILT HOME 
IN BEAUTIFUL SETTING NEAR EAST JORDAN

TRUCKS
2009 Ford F-150 Lariat. 4x4, 
double cab. Sale Price $5,495. 
As low as $199 a month. Riv-
ertown Auto Sales & Leasing. 
989 VFW Rd, Cheboygan. 231-
627-6700. Need a car a day or 
a week. We rent vehicles.

2010 Ram 1500. 4x4, tow 
pkg, 5.7L Hemi, bedliner, soft 
tonneau, 287 K miles. Sale 
Price $5,995. As low as $249 
a month. Rivertown Auto Sales 
& Leasing. 989 VFW Rd, Che-
boygan. 231-627-6700. We rent 
vehicles.

2011 Ford F-250 Super Duty. 
6.7L Power Stroke Diesel, soft 
tonneau cover, tow pkg, 296 K 
miles. Sale Price $16,495. As 
low as $550 a month. Rivertown 
Auto Sales & Leasing. 989 VFW 
Rd, Cheboygan. 231-627-6700. 
We rent vehicles.

2013 Chevy Avalanche. Black 
Diamond Edition. 4x4, Moon 
roof, leather, 237 K miles. 
Beautiful truck. Sale Price 
$13,995. As low as $349 a 
month. Rivertown Auto Sales & 
Leasing. 989 VFW Rd, Cheboy-
gan. 231-627-6700. 

2013 GMC SIERRA 1500 
SLE. Power mirrors, Box Cap, 
Bluetooth, Ext. Cab. SALE 
PRICE $9,995. FINANCE FOR 
60 MOS. at $198 MONTH. Jim 
Wernig Chevrolet, 2401 Old 27 
South, Gaylord. 989-732-5161, 
www.JimWernigChevrolet.com

2014 CHEVY SILVERADO 
1500 4WD. SALE PRICE 
$14,295. FINANCE FOR 60 
MOS. at $283 MONTH. Jim 
Wernig Chevrolet, 2401 Old 27 
South, Gaylord. 989-732-5161, 
www.JimWernigChevrolet.com

2015 Chevy Silverado 1500. 
4x4, double cab, hard tonneau 
cover, rear camera, tow pkg, 
108 K miles. $23,995. MEN-
TION THIS PAPER AND SAVE 
$2,000. JUST $21,995. As low 
as $349 a month. Byrider - 
NorthFin Automotive . 2215 US 
Hwy 31 N, Petoskey. Call Zeke 
Eberly, 231-347-3200. Buy. Fi-
nance. Drive On, PLUS, get an 
additional $50 Gas Card when 
any vehicle purchase when you 
let us know you saw the ad.

2015 Ford F-250 FX4 Off 
Road. 6.7 L Turbo Diesel. Moon 
roof, leather, quad cab, tow 
pkg, bedliner, hard tonneau 
cover, 288 K miles. Sale Price 
$24,995. As low as $399 a 
month. Rivertown Auto Sales 
& Leasing. 989 VFW Rd, Che-
boygan. 231-627-6700. We rent 
vehicles.

2015 Ford F-250 Super Duty 
XLT. 4x4, bedliner, double cab, 
tow pkg, 225 K miles. Sale 
Price $16,495. As low as $550 
a month. Rivertown Auto Sales 
& Leasing. 989 VFW Rd, Che-
boygan. 231-627-6700. 

2015 GMC Sierra 1500. 
Regular cab, tow pkg, bedliner, 
8 foot bed, 192 K miles. Sale 
Price $7,995. As low as $219 
a month. Rivertown Auto Sales 
& Leasing. 989 VFW Rd, Che-
boygan. 231-627-6700. Need 
a car a day or a week. We rent 
vehicles.

2016 CHEVY SILVERADO 
1500 LTZ. NEW TIRES, TON-
NEAU COVER, BOSE AUDIO. 
SALE $24,856. FINANCE FOR 
60 MOS. As low as $524 MO. 
Jim Wernig GMC. 2086 South. 
Gaylord. 989-448-4757. www.
WernigGMC.com

2016 GMC SIERRA 3500 HD 
SLE. REGULAR CAB, LONG 
BOX, 4X4. SALE $33,995. 
FINANCE FOR 60 MOS. As low 
as $715 MO. Jim Wernig GMC. 
2086 South. Gaylord. 989-448-
4757. www.WernigGMC.com

2017 FORD SUPERDUTY 
F350 SRW. XL, 4X4, CREW 
CAB, 6.75’ BOX. SALE 
$50,862. FINANCE FOR 60 
MOS. As low as $1070 MO. 
Jim Wernig GMC. 2086 South. 
Gaylord. 989-448-4757. www.
WernigGMC.com

2018 Chevy Colorado. 4x4, 120 
K miles. Sale Price $23,995. As 
low as $429 a month. Rivertown 
Auto Sales & Leasing. 989 VFW 
Rd, Cheboygan. 231-627-6700. 

2018 Toyota Tacoma TRD 
Sport. 4x4, fiberglass topper, 
tow pkg, rear camera, bedliner, 
132 K miles. $26,995. MEN-
TION THIS PAPER AND SAVE 
$2,000. JUST $24,995. As low 
as $409 a month. North Fin 
Automotive located at Byrider - 
NorthFin Automotive . 2215 US 
Hwy 31 N, Petoskey. Call Zeke 
Eberly, 231-347-3200. Buy. Fi-
nance. Drive On, PLUS, get an 
additional $50 Gas Card when 
any vehicle purchase when you 
let us know you saw the ad in 
the Weekly Choice.

2019 CHEVY SILVERADO 
1500 LT. DOUBLE CAB, 4X4, 
STANDARD BOX. SALE 
$26,983. FINANCE FOR 60 
MOS. As low as $566 MO. Jim 
Wernig GMC. 2086 South. 
Gaylord. 989-448-4757. www.
WernigGMC.com

2019 CHEVY SILVERADO 
1500. Custom Trail Boss, 4wd, 
1-Owner, Remote Start. SALE 
PRICE $32,995. FINANCE 

FOR 60 MOS. at $654 MONTH. 
Jim Wernig Chevrolet, 2401 Old 
27 South, Gaylord. 989-732-
5161, www.JimWernigChevro-
let.com

2019 CHEVY SILVERADO 
LTZ. New Tires, BOSE Audio, 
Tonneau Cover. SALE PRICE 
$36,487. FINANCE FOR 60 
MOS. at $723 MONTH. Jim 
Wernig Chevrolet, 2401 Old 27 
South, Gaylord. 989-732-5161, 
www.JimWernigChevrolet.com

2019 FORD F250 SUPER 
DUTY SRW. XL, 6-speed 
Automatic, Crew Cab, 6.75’ 
Box. SALE PRICE $50,995 
.FINANCE FOR 60 MOS. at 
$1009 MONTH. Jim Wernig 
Chevrolet, 2401 Old 27 South, 
Gaylord. 989-732-5161, www.
JimWernigChevrolet.com

2019 RAM 1500 BIG HORN 
4WD. Tonneau Cover, Running 
Boards, Pwr. Mirrors. SALE 
PRICE $24,995. FINANCE FOR 
60 MOS. at $495 MONTH. Jim 
Wernig Chevrolet, 2401 Old 27 
South, Gaylord. 989-732-5161, 
www.JimWernigChevrolet.com

2020 GMC SIERRA 1500. One 
Owner, Turbo Diesel, Leather. 
Sale Price $31,495 FINANCE 
FOR 60 MOS. at $624 MONTH. 
Jim Wernig Chevrolet, 2401 Old 
27 South, Gaylord. 989-732-
5161, www.JimWernigChevro-
let.com

2020 Ram 1500 Classic. 4x4, 
double cab, rear camera, tow 
pkg, Leer Topper. 178 K miles. 
Sale Price $18,995. As low as 
$299 a month. Rivertown Auto 
Sales & Leasing. 989 VFW Rd, 
Cheboygan. 231-627-6700. 
www.rivertownautosales.com. 
Need a car a day or a week. We 
rent vehicles.

2021 TOYOTA TACOMA SR 
4WD. 1-Owner, Tonneau 
Cover, New Tires. SALE PRICE 
$32,995. FINANCE FOR 72 
MOS. at $571 MONTH. Jim 
Wernig Chevrolet, 2401 Old 27 
South, Gaylord. 989-732-5161, 
www.JimWernigChevrolet.com

2022 CHEVY SILVERADO LTZ. 
1-Owner, Tonneau Cover, Short 
Box, Crew Cab. SALE PRICE 
$39,995. FINANCE FOR 72 
MOS. at $692 MONTH. Jim 
Wernig Chevrolet, 2401 Old 27 
South, Gaylord. 989-732-5161, 
www.JimWernigChevrolet.com

2022 Ram 3/4 ton. 4x4, crew 
cab, long bed, 55 K miles. Sale 
Price $32,995. As low as $499 
a month. Rivertown Auto Sales 
& Leasing. 989 VFW Rd, Che-
boygan. 231-627-6700. Need 
a car a day or a week. We rent 
vehicles.

2024 CHEVY SILVERADO 
3500 HD. 1-Owner, Boss 
Plow, Long Box. SALE PRICE 
$63,695. FINANCE FOR 84 
MOS. at $993 MONTH. Jim 
Wernig Chevrolet, 2401 Old 27 
South, Gaylord. 989-732-5161, 
www.JimWernigChevrolet.com

CERTIFIED PRE-OWNED. 
2019 CHEVY SILVERADO 
1500 SHORT BOX. CREW 
CAB, 4WD, 1-OWNER, NEW 
BRAKES, REMOTE START. 
SALE $28,988. FINANCE FOR 
60 MOS. As low as $609 MO. 
Jim Wernig GMC. 2086 South. 
Gaylord. 989-448-4757. 

CERTIFIED PRE-OWNED. 
2019 GMC SIERRA 1500 SLT 
4X4. CREW CAB, 1 OWNER, 
WIRELESS PHONE CHAR-
GER. SALE $36,025. FINANCE 
FOR 60 MOS. As low as $759 
MO. Jim Wernig GMC. 2086 
South. Gaylord. 989-448-4757. 
www.WernigGMC.com

CERTIFIED PRE-OWNED. 
2021 CHEVY SILVERADO 
1500 4WD. Trail boss, 1-Own-
er, Back Up Camera, Remote 
Star. SALE PRICE $38,495. 
FINANCE FOR 72 MOS. at 
$666 MONTH. Jim Wernig 
Chevrolet, 2401 Old 27 South, 
Gaylord. 989-732-5161, www.
JimWernigChevrolet.com

CERTIFIED PRE-OWNED. 
2021 CHEVY SILVERADO 
1500 LT. Sunroof, BOSE Audio, 
Trail Boss 4WD. SALE PRICE 
$40,995. FINANCE FOR 72 
MOS. at $709 MONTH. Jim 
Wernig Chevrolet, 2401 Old 27 
South, Gaylord. 989-732-5161, 
www.JimWernigChevrolet.com

CERTIFIED PRE-OWNED. 2021 
CHEVY SILVERADO 1500. 
Crew Cab, Short Box, New 
Tires, 1-Owner. SALE PRICE 
$34,495. FINANCE FOR 72 
MOS. at $597 MONTH. Jim 
Wernig Chevrolet, 2401 Old 27 
South, Gaylord. 989-732-5161, 
www.JimWernigChevrolet.com

CERTIFIED PRE-OWNED. 
2021 GMC SIERRA 1500 3SB. 
1-Owner, Remote Start, Dbl. 
Cab, Elevation. SALE PRICE 
$32,995. FINANCE FOR 72 
MOS. at $571 MONTH. Jim 
Wernig Chevrolet, 2401 Old 27 
South, Gaylord. 989-732-5161, 
www.JimWernigChevrolet.com

CERTIFIED PRE-OWNED. 
2021 GMC SIERRA 1500 
DENALI. 6,2L V8, 4X4, CREW 
CAB, SHORT BOX. SALE 
$48,843. FINANCE FOR 60 
MOS. As low as $1028 MO. 
Jim Wernig GMC. 2086 South. 
Gaylord. 989-448-4757. www.
WernigGMC.com

CERTIFIED PRE-OWNED. 
2022 CHEVY SILVERADO 
1500 LTD. 1-Owner, Heated 
Steering Wheel, Heated Seats. 
SALE PRICE $29,495. FI-
NANCE FOR 72 MOS. at $510 
MONTH. Jim Wernig Chevrolet, 
2401 Old 27 South, Gaylord. 
989-732-5161, www.JimWer-
nigChevrolet.com

CERTIFIED PRE-OWNED. 
2022 CHEVY SILVERADO 
1500. 1-Owner, BOSE Audio, 
Sunroof. SALE PRICE $46,478. 
FINANCE FOR 72 MOS. at 
$804 MONTH. Jim Wernig 
Chevrolet, 2401 Old 27 South, 
Gaylord. 989-732-5161, 

CERTIFIED PRE-OWNED. 
2022 GMC SIERA 1500 
LIMITED. REGULAR CAB, 
LONG BOX, VINYL FLOORS. 
SALE $33,895. FINANCE FOR 
72 MOS. As low as $612 MO. 
Jim Wernig GMC. 2086 South. 
Gaylord. 989-448-4757. www.
WernigGMC.com

CERTIFIED PRE-OWNED. 
2022 GMC SIERRA 1500 SLT 
CREW CAB. SHORT BOX, 
1-OWNER, HEATED STEER-
ING WHEEL. SALE $49,995. 
FINANCE FOR 72 MOS. As low 
as $883 /MO. Jim Wernig GMC. 
2086 South. Gaylord. 989-448-
4757. www.WernigGMC.com

CERTIFIED PRE-OWNED. 
2022 GMC SIERRA 3500HD 
4X4 PRO. 1 OWNER, CERTI-
FIED, NEW REAR BRAKES. 
SALE $43,113. FINANCE FOR 
60 MOS. As low as $907 MO. 
Jim Wernig GMC. 2086 South. 
Gaylord. 989-448-4757. www.
WernigGMC.com

CERTIFIED PRE-OWNED. 
2023 CHEVY SILVERADO 
RST. 1-Owner, BOSE Audio, 
Pwr. Sunroof. SALE PRICE 
$49,995. FINANCE FOR 84 
MOS. at $779 MONTH. Jim 
Wernig Chevrolet, 2401 Old 27 
South, Gaylord. 989-732-5161, 
www.JimWernigChevrolet.com

CERTIFIED PRE-OWNED. 
2023 GMC SIERRA 1500 
ELEVATION 3SB. CREW CAB, 
SHORT BOX, 4X4. SALE 
$51,914. FINANCE FOR 84 
MOS. As low as $860 MO. Jim 
Wernig GMC. 2086 South. 
Gaylord. 989-448-4757. 

VANS
2010 Dodge Caravan. Rear 
load wheelchair ramp. Sale 
Price $5,995. As low as $249 
a month. Rivertown Auto Sales 
& Leasing. 989 VFW Rd, Che-
boygan. 231-627-6700. Need 
a car a day or a week. We rent 
vehicles.

2010 Dodge Caravan. Rear 
load wheelchair ramp. Sale 
Price $5,995. As low as $249 
a month. Rivertown Auto Sales 
& Leasing. 989 VFW Rd, Che-
boygan. 231-627-6700. Need 
a car a day or a week. We rent 
vehicles.

2016 Ford Transit Connect. 
Cargo van, 255 K miles. Sale 
Price $9,995. As low as $249 a 
month. Rivertown Auto Sales & 
Leasing. 989 VFW Rd, Cheboy-
gan. 231-627-6700. .

2017 CHEVROLET EXPRESS. 
12 passenger, New Rear 
Brakes. SALE PRICE $18,995. 
FINANCE FOR 60 MOS. at 
$376 MONTH. Jim Wernig 
Chevrolet, 2401 Old 27 South, 
Gaylord. 989-732-5161, www.
JimWernigChevrolet.com

2017 Ford Transit Connect 
XLT. 7 passenger, 160 K miles. 
Sale Price $11,995. As low as 
$239 a month. Rivertown Auto 
Sales & Leasing. 989 VFW Rd, 
Cheboygan. 231-627-6700. 

2019 Chrysler Pacifica. Double 
moon roof, rear camera, 
bluetooth, 4 captain chairs, 
110 K miles. Very nice. Sale 
Price $23,995. As low as $419 
a month. Rivertown Auto Sales 
& Leasing. 989 VFW Rd, Che-
boygan. 231-627-6700. We rent 
vehicles.

2021 Chrysler Voyager. Cash 
Price $20,995. As low as $345 
a month. North Fin Automotive 
located at Byrider - 2215 US 
Hwy 31 N, Petoskey. Call Zeke 
Eberly, 231-347-3200. Buy. Fi-
nance. Drive On, PLUS, get an 
additional $50 Gas Card when 
any vehicle purchase when you 
let us know you saw the ad in 
the Weekly Choice.

2021 RAM PROMASTER 
CARGO VAN. 1-Owner, Spa-
cious, Bluetooth. SALE PRICE 
$28,995. FINANCE FOR 72 
MOS. at $502 MONTH Jim 
Wernig Chevrolet, 2401 Old 27 
South, Gaylord. 989-732-5161, 
www.JimWernigChevrolet.com

WANTED
Buying used vinyl LP records. 
Top dollar paid by local buyer. 
All genres. Leave message 
586-773-6050. 

I NEED A HELPER, 8998 
M-32, see at RV in back. 231-
459-9467.

Old Guitars Wanted: Gibson, 
Martin, Gretsch, Rickenbacker, 
etc. 1930s to 1980s. Old Fender 
amps 1950s to 1960s. Top 
dollar paid. Call toll free 866-
433-8277.
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See what's possible when people work together to create a great environment to live, 
raise a family and pursue their passions in the place they love.

THE BOYNE AREA
CHAMBER OF COMMERCE
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Your Hometown Realtors"

27 S LAKE ST • BOYNE CITY, MI 49712 • (231) 582-9555

WWW.MARTYANDCHRIS.COM

Innovative. Growing. 
Global.

Join our team!  
ejco.com/careers

Mark E. Patrick, Agent
219 S. Lake
Boyne City, MI 49712
231-582-6829
mark.patrick.b0w0@statefarm.com

Like a good neighbor. State Farm is there. ®
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"A Family
Tradition
Since
1985" 

• Clean Well Lit Restrooms
• Flush Toilets
• Private Showers.  

Hot & Cold Water
• Water Towers & Dump Station
• 30 Lg. Level Sites 

35’ x 50’ & up)
• 20 & 30 amp sites available
• 8 sites are pull through

CONTACT    RESERVATIONS
1890 S. M75, 

BOYNE CITY, MI

• Public Paved Biking & Hiking Trail  
600 ft from Park Entrance

• Mini nature preserve & Rec Areas
• Boyne Mountain Sky Bridge 1 mi. away
• 5 Lakes within 10 miles
• Extra Parking, Picnic Tables
• Pets OK.
• Bring your own portable fire pit or we may 

be able to loan you one

terry@BoyneCountryRVpark.com

• Clean Well Lit Restrooms
• Flush Toilets
• Private Showers, Hot & Cold Water
• Water Towers & Dump Station
• 30 Lg. Level Sites (35' x 50' & up)
• 20 & 30 amp sites available
• 8 sites are pull through 
• Public Paved Biking & Hiking Trail 

600 ft. from Park Entrance
• Mini Nature Preserve & Rec Areas
• Boyne Mountain Sky Bridge, 1 mi. away
• 5 Lakes within 10 miles
• Extra Parking, Picnic Tables
• Pets OK
• Bring your own portable fire pit or we 

may be able to loan you one

CONTACT | RESERVATIONS
1890 S. M75
BOYNE CITY, MI 231-549-2214231-549-2214

terry@BoyneCountryRVpark.com


